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Dark clouds filled Minden’s skies as a cold front moved
through the area Thursday afternoon bringing rain cool-
er temps. Meterologist say the ‘cooler tempratures’ in
the 90s should remain throughout the weekend before
the 100 degree tempratures return early next week.
Bruce Franklin/Press-Herald
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WEBSTER CRIME
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Three men have been
arrested in connection
with the thefts of several
four-wheelers that have
gone missing in the south
end of the parish.

Levert Letrell Young, 21,
of the 20 block of McArthur
in Dixie Inn, was arrested
Monday, July 27, and
charged with principal to
felony theft, three counts

of principal
to commit
felony theft
and four
counts of
conspiracy
to commit
felony theft.
Bond was
set at
$27,500.

Jamal Deunte Bailey, 22,
of the 400 block of Mar-
shall Street, was arrested
Monday, July 27, and
charged with illegal pos-

session of stolen things
and conspiracy to posses
stolen things. Bond was set
at $12,500.

Kaleeb Lamar Hawkins,
20, of the 2900 block of

Dorcheat Road, was arrest-
ed Monday, July 27, and
charged with principal to
felony theft, principal to
commit felony theft and
two counts of conspiracy
to commit felony theft.
Bond was set at $13,000.

According to reports,
the thefts were reported on
July 22. Webster Parish
Sheriff’s detectives inter-
viewed Hawkins, at whose
home one of the reported
stolen ATVs was found.
Further investigation

revealed he knew Young
was involved with the four-
wheeler thefts in the Dub-
berly and Heflin areas. He
also reportedly told inves-
tigators that he and Young
had taken photos of one of
the four-wheelers stolen
later from a residence on
Highway 531. This particu-
lar four-wheeler was recov-
ered from Bailey’s home,
investigators say.

During Bailey’s inter-

HAWKINSBAILEYYOUNG

   SeeTHEFTS, Page 3

Arrests made in ATV thefts

BRUCE FRANKLIN
bruce@press-herald.com

Earlier this week, Ascen-
sion and St. Bernard Parish
officials said Naegleria
fowleria amoeba, com-
monly knows as “brain-
eating amoeba,” had been
found in their water sys-
tems.

Officials
with the City
of Minden
say the
chances of
contamina-
tion in the
city water is
unlikely.

“It’s not
very likely (contamination)
because we keep our chlo-
rine level so high,” Rick
Broussard, city water and
wastewater manager said.
“We usually go into the
system at the water plant

Offical:
‘brain-
eating

amoeba’
not likely
Minden’s water
tested monthly 

BROUSSARD

   SeeWATER, Page 2

CITY OF MINDEN

MICHELLE BATES
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A Minden man arrested
on multiple charges of
fraud, identity theft, mon-
etary instrument abuse
and forgery pled guilty to
racketeering.

Raymond
Warren, 57,
entered his
plea in front
of 26th Judi-
cial District
Judge
Michael O.
Craig, Fri-
day, July 24.
Assistant
district
attorney
Hugo Hol-
land says his
charges of
20 counts of
identity
theft, 38
counts of
access
device fraud, 38 counts of
unlawful possession of
fraudulent documents for

Warren
pleads
guilty in
fraud, ID
theft case

COURT WATCH

R. WARREN

B. WARREN

   SeeWARREN, Page 2

CITY ARTWORKS

An art show featuring the work of Jessica Davis
of Junction City, Arkansas kicked off Thursday

afternoon at City Artworks in downtown Minden.
Above, Davis, right, talks with Wanda Pittman and

Terry Gardner about her pottery display. Davis’
art will be on display until Sept. 30.

ART SHOWKICKS OFF
Bruce Franklin/Press-Herald

COOLER TEMPS
MOVE INTO
THE AREA



SECONDFRONT
2 Friday, July 31, 2015 – Minden Press-Herald     

www.press-herald.com

with .9 parts per million
and at the end of the sys-
tem we usually register a .6
or .7 parts per million.”

In 2013, the state Health
Department issued an
emergency rule requiring
water systems in Louisiana
to maintain a minimum
disinfectant level of .5 mil-
ligram of disinfectant per
liter of water throughout
the system.

Broussard says that by

maintaining a good
chorine level through out
the system helps fight off
any contaminants.

Maintaining the chlo-
rine at the required levels is
not the only precaution
taken to ensure the city’s
water is safe. Broussard
says the health department
tests samples on a monthly
basis.

“We have 30 test sites in
the system, one month we
will send in samples from
15 sites in the system and
the next month we send in
from the other 15. They are
from all parts of the sys-

tem,” he said. “They will
test to see if we have any
coliform in the water and
we do a chorine residual
test on a regular basis.”

The City of Minden’s
water is supplied by nine
wells in the Sparta Aquifer,
Broussard said.

He says the last batch of
samples were sent in
around the second week of
July and no contaminates
were found.

The parasite has caused
three deaths in Louisiana
— in DeSoto and St.
Bernard parishes, since
2011.

identification purposes,
issuing worthless checks,
bank fraud, forgery, 17
counts of monetary
instrument abuse, three
counts of computer fraud,
and three counts of online
impersonation were rolled
into the racketeering
charge.

Holland says Warren
claims his wife didn’t know

about some of the fraudu-
lent schemes and did his
best to exonerate his wife,
Barbara Warren.

“He exonerated his wife
in several of the schemes,”
Holland said. “I advised,
him, his attorney and his
wife’s attorney that she
would still have to answer
charges related to a series
of hot checks she wrote to
Minden Animal Clinic.”

“It led me to believe
either (1) there was some
truth to it, or (2) they had
concocted a story to pro-

tect her,” he said. “Either
way, prosecuting her for
the racketeering would
prove problematic at this
point, so she is being held
responsible for the
felonies I know I can prove
against her, namely the
hot checks.”

The couple was arrest-
ed in April by Minden
police when hot checks
were reported to them,
totaling $21,000, police
chief Steve Cropper said at
the time of their arrest. 

The National Insurance

Crime Bureau got involved
when some reported
fraudulent insurance
claims were being investi-
gated.

During a search of the
couple’s Rathbun Street
home, documentation was
seized in reference to the
case, including several
boxes of checks, check-
books, paperwork, some
electronics and a truck
were confiscated. 

Investigators say it all
started when they were
contacted about two bad

checks written by Barbara
Warren to Brookshire’s
Grocery in Oct. 2014. One
of the checks was more
than $500, which is a
felony, Cropper said.

In April, a representa-
tive at Regions Bank con-
tacted police telling them
Raymond Warren had
taken Navy Federal Credit
Union checks and was
writing them on an
account for a nonexistent
business, investigators
said.

Investigators learned of

several more instances
where Raymond Warren
was allegedly “kiting,” or
floating, checks from bank
to bank.

Barbara Warren was
originally charged with
three counts of bank
fraud, issuing worthless
checks and three counts of
monetary instrument
abuse. Her case has been
scheduled for Oct. 12, with
trial set for Dec. 7.

A status conference is
set for Oct. 12 for Ray-
mond Warren.

WARREN
Continued from page 1

Police say Warren was ‘floating’ checks between banks

WATER
Continued from page 1

The water treatment plant is located on Horton Street. Bruce Franklin

‘Good’ chlorine levels maintained throughout system

BATON ROUGE—
Sending "revenge porn"
can land you behind bars,
new housing protections
are being extended to
domestic violence victims
and enforcement of sea
turtle protection laws is
tightening as hundreds of
new Louisiana laws take
effect Saturday.

The provisions of more
than 260 bills passed by
state lawmakers earlier
this year kick in Aug. 1.
Many of the statute
changes are modest
adjustments to existing
laws or govern arcane
issues that will draw little
public attention. Others
are more sweeping in
scope.

`ofjb=^ka=`lroqp
Anyone who shares a

nude or partially-nude
cellphone picture or video
without permission —
often an attempt at public
shaming called "revenge
pornography" — will now

face up to two years in jail
and a fine reaching
$10,000.

Laws already on the
books made it a crime to
send a nude image of
someone under the age of
17. The new law criminal-
izing "nonconsensual dis-
closure of a private image"
is aimed at protecting
people who aren't minors.
Exceptions are included
for police investigations
and people who inten-
tionally expose them-
selves in public.

In addition to creating
new crimes, lawmakers
also changed the terms
used to describe some
existing offenses.

Authorities have used
"simple rape," ''forcible
rape" and "aggravated
rape" to describe the vary-
ing degrees of sexual
assault charges. The new
terms will be third-degree
rape, second-degree rape
and first-degree rape, after

complaints that a term
like "simple rape" was
insulting to victims.

The laws also are
changing for victims of
domestic violence, to give
them more freedom to
break a lease to escape an
abuser and to let land-
lords immediately evict
those who are deemed
abusers by the courts or a
state welfare agency. In
some narrow situations,
landlords will be barred
from evicting abuse vic-
tims.

p^cb=e^sbk=i^t
More information will

be distributed to the pub-
lic about Louisiana's safe
haven law that allows a
parent to relinquish a
baby up until they're two
months old.

The state social servic-
es department has to
develop an annual and
public information plan to
increase awareness about
the law. The new law

spells out what the plan
should contain and
requires annual reporting
to lawmakers about the
effort.

Under the safe haven
law, parents who are
unable to care for a new-
born can leave the child at
any designated facility
instead of abandoning the
child in an unsafe envi-
ronment. Louisiana's des-
ignated facilities include
any licensed hospital,
public health unit, emer-
gency medical service
provider, medical clinic,
fire or police station or
pregnancy crisis center.

peofjm=^ka=qroJ
qibp

Shrimpers hope to
boost their sales now that
state wildlife officials will
be able to enforce federal
requirements for shrimp
nets to include escape
hatches for sea turtles. A
1987 enforcement ban is
officially removed from
the books Saturday.

All sea turtles found in
U.S. waters are endan-
gered or threatened. In
the mid-1980s, when
Louisiana's law was
passed, the federal rule
requiring "turtle excluder
devices" in shrimp trawls

was new and contentious.
Supporters of removing

the state enforcement ban
said some big-box retail-
ers boycotted Louisiana
shrimp because they
objected to the state
restrictions and raised
concerns about the state's
handling of protections
for endangered sea turtles.

_llpqba=ifqqbo
cfkbp

Littering fines are dou-
bling, in a bid to help
shrink Louisiana's retire-
ment debt.

Fines for simple litter-
ing will be $150 for a first
offense and $1,000 for
subsequent offenses.
Fines for intentional litter-
ing will grow to anywhere
from $500 to $2,500. Fines
for improperly disposing
of larger litter, like furni-
ture and appliances, could
reach up to $10,000.

The new money is ear-
marked to pay down the
debt of the retirement sys-
tem of the law
enforcement agency
that issues the litter
citation.

New laws take effect Saturday
AROUND THE STATE

‘Revenge porn’ law makes it illegal
to share other’s nude photos
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OBITUARIES
Azzie Parker Blow

Azzie Parker Blow was
the second child  of Charlie
Parker and Fannie Sykes
Parker. Azzie Blow's life
would be one of great com-
mitment.

Her greatest commit-
ment was to her faith in
Jesus Christ. She accepted
Christ  at a young age in her
home church of Mt. Comfort Baptist
Church in rural Webster Parish. For over 50
years she faithfully served at St. Rest Bap-
tist Church.  She served in many areas;
however, her primary area of service was
the Sunday school department where she
was a teacher and Sunday school Superin-
tendent. Much of her free time was spent
studying God's Word as she diligently pre-
pared her Sunday school lessons.

Her second great commitment was to
her marriage. Azzie Parker united in mar-
riage to Willie Blow on Aug. 9, 1959. She
took pride in being a good wife and home-
maker. She enjoyed the tasks of cooking,
sewing, ironing, canning and freezing food
to care for her husband. She took great
pleasure in attending auctions and flea
markets to find unique furniture and
accessories to adorn her home. She man-
aged well her family's income. She enjoyed
traveling with her husband for relaxation.
Their favorite spot was Hot Springs,
Arkansas.

Her last commitment was to her voca-
tion and service to others. She worked as a
Home Extension Agent in Bienville parish
for 33 years. The duties of her job allowed
her to serve the neighbors in her commu-
nity by teaching them skills to enhance
their lives. She taught the skills of meal
planning, cooking, sewing, furniture
restoration and financial budgeting.

As she taught her neighbors she also
lovingly taught these skills to her nieces
and nephews.

Azzie Blow's life of commitment will be
fondly remembered by her husband, her
siblings Gladys McGee and William B Jack-
son of Minden and a host of  nieces,
nephews, other relatives and friends.

Funeral services for Azzie Parker Blow
will be at 11 a.m. Saturday, Aug. 1, 2015 at
St. Rest Baptist Church with Pastor B. J.

Martin, officiating.  Visitation will be from
noon until 7 p.m. Friday, July 31 in the
chapel of Kennon’s Mortuary with family
hour from 6 until 7 p.m.  Services are
entrusted to Kennon’s Mortuary.  Email
condolences may be sent to kennonsmor-
tuary@suddenlink.net.

Murphy James
Foster Bridges II 

Murphy James Foster
Bridges II, loving husband,
father, brother, son, and
grandfather, passed away
July 29, 2015, from Amy-
otrophic Lateral Sclerosis
(ALS). Murphy was born in
Shreveport on May 30,
1959, and was a life-long
resident of Minden. A gra-
cious, fun-loving, and kind man, who
always had a smile for everyone. Murphy
was an internal auditor and for Willis-
Knighton Hospital in Shreveport.

Murphy loved the outdoors, fishing,
hunting, ultra-light flying, jet skiing and
the study of guns. He liked working with
his hands whether with wood or comput-
ers, and knew a roll of duct-tape could fix
anything. Murphy was also an avid tennis
player especially with his wife, Lisa.

Murphy graduated from Haughton
High School and Draughon Business Col-
lege in Shreveport majoring in accounting
and computer technology, and he also
attended Northwestern State University. 

Murphy is survived by his loving wife
and soul mate of over 30 years, Lisa
Menard Bridges. his sons Aarin McBride
Bridges and wife Jordan; proud “Pop-pop”
to grandchildren, Liam, Seth, and Jude
Bridges of Huntsville, Texas; and Murphy
“Jay” James Foster Bridges, III of Lake
Charles, his mother, Eugenia McBride
Bridges of Minden, his siblings, R. Hunter
Bridges, III, and wife, Kandi of Baton
Rouge; Dr. R. McIntyre Bridges, Jr., and
wife Mary of Shreveport. His nieces,
nephew, and great-nephew, Elizabeth M.
Bridges of Baton Rouge; R McIntyre
Bridges, III, of Shreveport; Rachel Bridges
Barrett and husband, Jason, and great-
nephew, Luke of Smyrna, Tennessee; and
Carrie E. Bridges and fiancé Jack Higdon

of Baton Rouge, his brothers-in-law, Don-
ald Menard of New Iberia; and Mark
Menard and wife, Renee of Texas. Also
along to cherish his memory are his uncle
and aunts and their spouses and many
beloved cousins and friends. He is preced-
ed in death by his father, Dr. R. McIntyre
Bridges Sr.; brother, Dr. William McBride
Bridges; grandparents, R. Hunter Bridges
Sr. and wife Polka McIntyre Bridges; Dr.
William McGinty McBride Sr. and wife
Annie Lou Sentell McBride.

The family would like to express their
thanks and appreciation to the staff at
Gamble Hospice in Minden for their lov-
ing guidance and compassionate care for
Murphy and his family. 

The family request visiting hours be
observed at Kilpatrick’s Rose-Neath
Funeral Home located at 211 Murrell
Street in Minden, on Aug. 1, 2015 from 9
until 11 a.m. Funeral service begins at 11
a.m. with the Rev. Phil McLarty and the
Rev. Tony Angell officiating. Interment will
follow at the Garden of Memory in Min-
den. Pallbearers will be R. Hunter Bridges
II, Dr. R. McIntyre Bridges Jr., R. McIntyre
Bridges III, Dannie Hooper, Murphy “Jay”
James Foster Bridges III, Aarin McBride
Bridges and Mike Waller. In lieu of flowers,
memorial donations can be made to the
ALS Association Louisiana-Mississippi

Chapter, P.O. Box 66825, Baton Rouge, LA
70896, or a charity of your choice. Family
and friends are invited to visit and pen a
note to the family on the online guestbook
at www.rose-neath.com.

Ellis Hines
Funeral services for Mr.

Ellis Hines, 86, will be at 1
p.m. Saturday, Aug. 1, 2015
at St. Rest Baptist Church
with Rev. B. J. Martin, Pas-
tor, officiating.  Interment
will follow at Sheppard
Street Cemetery.

Ellis Hines was born Oct.
1, 1919 to the late Octavia
Bryant and John Hines in Chitersten,
Arkansas.  Mr. Hines departed this earthly
life on July 24 at Minden Medical Center.  

He leaves to cherish his memories a
special friend, Louise Miller; stepdaugh-
ter, Stephania Jackson; and a host of other
relatives and friends.

Visitation will be from noon until 7
p.m. Friday, July 31 in the chapel of Ken-
non’s Mortuary.  Services are entrusted to
Kennon’s Mortuary.  Email condolences
may be sent to kennonsmortuary@sud-
denlink.net.

BLOW

BRIDGES

HINES

view, he told investigators
Hawkins contacted him
about purchasing the ATV
from Young.

According to reports,
Young admitted to stealing
four-wheelers from two
residences in Dubberly,
one in Heflin and one in
Sibley. Investigators say he
admitted he had four four-
wheelers in his possession
and had sold them all. 

Detectives Lt. Scott
Tucker and Maj. Dustin
Reynolds were the investi-
gating officers along with
the assistance of Deputy
J.R. Lewis.

The case is still under
investigation.

THEFTS
Continued from page 1

Police: Suspect admitted to selling stolen ATVs

Clay Maraist, MD
believes his patients are an
extension of the medical
team and encourages
them to actively partici-
pate in their care. Marasist
says he is looking forward
to meeting the obstetrics
and gynecological needs
of women at all stages of
their lives and believes
there is nothing more ful-
filling than delivering
babies into the world. 

“Approachable” is the
one word he uses to
describe himself. Dr.
Maraist takes medicine
and the care of his
patients very seriously but
also finds time to blend in
his humorous personality. 

Dr. Maraist is a member
of the American College of
Obstetrics and Gynecolo-
gy. He completed medical
school at University
Health in Shreveport and

continued his education
by completing his Obstet-
rics/Gynecology intern-
ship and residency at Uni-
versity Health Shreveport.

Dr. Maraist grew up in
St. Martinville and enjoys
playing golf, hunting, fish-
ing, cooking, gardening
and spending time with
his wife, Jodie, who is also
an ob/gyn, and their dogs
Izzie and Bella.

Dr. Maraist is accepting
new patients at The
Women’s Clinic located at
431 Homer Road in Min-
den. The Women's Clinic

provides a full range of
obstetrical and gynecolog-
ic services including:
Annual Well-Women
Exams, Bone Density
Screenings, Contraceptive
Counseling, Laparoscopic
& Minimally Invasive
Techniques including Hys-
teroscopic Guided Sterili-
zation with Essure devices,
Urinary Incontinence
Treatment, Menopause
Management and Prenatal
Care throughout Pregnan-
cy and Delivery. Appoint-
ments may be made by
calling 377-8855.

Minden Medical Center welcomes Dr. Clay Maraist
MEDICAL NEWS

Ob/Gyn accepting new patients
Dr. Maraist
is accepting
new
patients at
The
Women’s
Clinic locat-
ed at 431
Homer Road
in Minden.
Courtesy
Photo



And then there were two. Two
Planned Parenthood officials have
now been caught on tape noncha-
lantly discussing the sale of fetal
body parts. 

It is quite possible that these
executives were breaking the law; it
is indisputable that their conversa-
tions were off-the-charts sickening.
Even the organization's founding
eugenicist Margaret Sanger might
struggle to defend the inhumanity.

Now we learn that four far-far-left
Democrats in Congress are calling
for an investigation. Not of Planned
Parenthood and its ghoulish prac-
tices, but of the anti-abortion group
that secretly taped those damning
lunch conversations.

Yes, those upstanding representa-
tives are livid because the video was
recorded "without the consent of the
Planned Parenthood doctor." The
House members also complain that
the footage was "selectively-edited."

But was there something in the
red wine that forced Dr. Deborah
Nucatola to talk about she can deftly
crush a fetus to ensure that certain
prized body parts remain intact? Or
was the salad dressing spiked when
Dr. Mary Gattner spoke about per-
forming "less crunchy" abortions in
order to get "whole specimens?" 

She actually seemed to find the
whole fee-for-fetus discussion amus-
ing, especially when joking that she
wants to make enough money to buy
a Lamborghini.

As those
Democrats were
attacking the
messenger, they
received support
from their ideo-
logical allies on
the New York
Times editorial
board. The Times'
hacks described
the videos as a
dishonest attempt
to make the sale
of body parts look
"nefarious and
illegal." 

Well, it's certainly nefarious, and
it's possibly illegal.

Many prominent Democrats are
simply making believe the videos
don't exist. There has been nary a
sound from Hillary Clinton or other
presidential candidates, although
Bernie Sanders did concede that
Planned Parenthood's "tone" was
off. 

Yes, changing the "tone" should
do the trick.

Anyone with a spine might follow
the lead of Fox News analyst Kirsten
Powers, a lifelong Democrat. "This is
stomach-turning stuff," she wrote.
"But the problem here is not one of
tone. It's the crushing." Powers con-
cluded that when abortion doctors
are considered immune from criti-
cism, "society has officially gone off
the rails."

Meanwhile, another train is bar-
reling straight at those progressives
who are so out of touch with we the
people. Criminal illegal aliens who
return to the USA after being deport-
ed should go to jail. Period. That's
the gist of Kate's Law, named to
honor the late Kate Steinle, who was
murdered by an illegal in San Fran-
cisco.

Who could object? Well, enter
Senator Dick Durbin of Illinois. You
may remember him as the guy who
compared U.S. soldiers at Guan-
tanamo Bay to Nazis and Pol Pot,
saying they had "no concern for
human beings." So, Senator, let's talk
about "concern for human beings"
who are maimed and murdered by
thugs who should not be in this
country.

During a Senate hearing this
week, Durbin skipped some moving
testimony from families who were
ripped apart when their loved ones
were killed by illegal immigrants.
Then he completely mischaracter-
ized Kate's Law and lamented that it
could be "an invitation for a lot of
prosecutions."

Got that? According to Durbin's
priorities, we should worry about
prison overcrowding, not felons who
return to the country time and again.

There have always been depraved
"doctors" who butcher babies about
to emerge from the womb, just as
there have always been depraved
criminals who kill innocent people,
whether for profit or pique or pleas-
ure.

Before our society went off the
rails, to borrow from Kirsten, we
came together as Americans to
denounce atrocities. No longer. Now
we have politicians who depend on
the abortion lobby for money and on
Hispanics for votes. So when truly
vile acts occur, these craven men and
women avert their eyes. Or change
the subject. Or deflect the blame.

_áää=lÛoÉáääó=áë=~=í~äâ=ëÜçï=Üçëí=çå
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On June 9th, the Webster
Parish Convention and Visi-
tors Commission held their
second quarter commission
meeting at the newly com-
pleted Germantown Colony
visitor center. Larry Milford
was on hand to give the com-
missioners a special tour of
the exhibits he created for
the climate controlled exhibit
area of the building housing
the original artifacts returned
to Germantown from the
state archives in Baton
Rouge. 

The 34th
Annual
Country
Showdown
was held in
Webster
Parish in
Minden for
the first
time. Real
Country
104.5 FM
KBEF Radio
of Minden
hosted
America’s
largest country music talent
search on Friday, June 26th.
The event was held at the
Minden Community House
with a standing room only
attendance for the first year.
Plans are already in the works
to hold the event again next
year at the Minden Civic
Center.  

Webster Parish was fea-
tured again in a full-page
write-up highlighting Web-
ster Parish’s attractions and
events in the June issue of
Horizon Travel America, a
magazine that caters specifi-
cally towards Canadians trav-
eling to the United States. On
June 4th, 100,000 copies of
the magazine were distrib-
uted with the Toronto Star
and National Post to affluent
readers throughout the coun-

try. 
With the assistance of the

City of Minden, the first
phase of the new signage for
the Northwest Louisiana Film
Trail has been installed in
downtown Minden. Each of
the new signs will identify a
numbered location of a
movie filmed in downtown
Minden corresponding to the
map in the brochure. Each
location sign will give a brief
write up about the movie and
will have QR code. When
scanned with a QR reader
application available free
online from the App Store, a
film clip will be available on
your phone or iPad showing
the movie trailer and a scene
from the movie filmed at the
location. This is definitely a
first in the state and perhaps
the US. 

The 64th Springhill Rodeo
held on July 30th - August 1st
was featured on the cover of
July/August issue of
Louisiana Road Trips Maga-
zine along with a full page
story. 

On July 13th - July 17th, I
made sales calls with repre-
sentatives of Shreveport and
Natchitoches in Dallas, Texas
and Oklahoma City, Oklaho-
ma on tour companies who
book groups of 40 -80 people
on motor coaches. Our goal
was to promote the Louisiana
Holiday Trail of Lights and
invite their sales people to
attend a complimentary  tour
this December 10th -14th
including a visit to all of the
five cities while they are all
lighted up for the holidays.
We were able to book all the
available seats. We were also
invited to return to Oklaho-
ma City on November 5th to
make a presentation to 100-
125 group tour sales agents
with the goal of booking
group tours for the 2016 holi-

day season. We also booked
tours for the 2015 holiday
season and in the spring of
2016. Be looking for motor
coach buses in Webster
Parish in November and
December. So far we have
booked 5 group tours!   

The Heart of the Pines
Film Festival was held for the
first time in Minden on July
25th and 26th bringing quali-
ty film screenings and events
to the heart of the Ark-La-
Tex. The films were selected
specifically for the local
North Louisiana audience.
Attendees got to see great
independent films from all
over the world, including the
critically acclaimed, festival-
circuit hit "Wildlike", which
will be opening in theaters
this September.

Courtney Sandifer, Pro-
ducer, Director, and organiz-
er decided to hold the first
Heart of the Pines Film Festi-
val in her home town. The
festival began on Saturday at
10:00 am at the Minden Civic
Center with activities
throughout the day and
evening. Then on Sunday,
there was also and interactive
Filmmaking Workshop for
Children from 2:00pm to
6:00pm followed by an Arts
Community Mixer at 7:30 pm
in conjunction with the Film
Fest at The Farm located at
417 East Union Street in Min-
den. 

The first film festival held
in Webster Parish was fea-
tured as #2 of “ 5 Things to
Do this Weekend” in the
Shreveport Times, on KSLA
Channel 12 News, Fox 33 and
90.7FM The Promise’s show
“Talk of the Town” with Tom
Pace.
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Big things happening
in Webster Parish

The left’s
deadly wall
of silence

PERSPECTIVELETTERS TO
THE EDITOR

WEBSTER PARISH TOURISM REPORT

`çåÑÉÇÉê~íÉ
cä~Ö

Dear Editor,

"Our Confederate Flag," this is
the question today.  This flag is
an important part of our Ameri-
can history; north, south, and
across the land of our country,
America.  This demand from a
very few, want a transformation
of our great America.  The doing
away with the Confederate Flag
will only be the beginning.

These few loud voices already
want old established monuments
removed.  If states give in to these
silly demands how much will
they want removed from our
American History? Parish, county,
and street names as well?! There
is no telling how far this craze
will go if our state gives into the
few loud demands.

If our southern states give in
and go along what will be next?
Will our American Flag, Old
Glory, be next? I hope and pray
our states disregard these calls
from the few to do away with the
Confederate Flag.  Where are our
voices, our support of the Ameri-
can people in Congress.  Their
silence is killing us.

Please God, Bless America,
Jack L. Daniels

fíÛë=~Äçìí
íÜÉ=_áÄäÉ

Dear Editor,

It is not about a flag! It is not
about a gun! It is about THE
BIBLE!  We the people know what
is really happening in our coun-
try.  There is and has been a
major push in the United States
to divide WE THE PEOPLE! An
unhealthy agenda against us has
been in place for many years
now.  Yet I still believe in WE THE
PEOPLE! It is sad that many are
working to destroy what our
founding fathers through the
constitution have declared to be
our right.  Our country was
established on THE HOLY SCRIP-
TURES which no government
entity should take away.  I com-
mend the families that spoke of
Christian forgiveness after the
horrid shooting in South Caroli-
na.  They are WE THE PEOPLE!

Yet, rarely do we hear any
elected official or those running
for election speaking so bravely.
The news media are even less
truthful.  Please do not give up on
America.  Keep voting even
though we are being deceived at
every turn.  Keep teaching your
children/grandchildren true fam-
ily values.  Keep being positive
and encouraging to one another.
Seek the Bible for yourself to get
the real facts in living a just life in
the midst of lies, hate, and preju-
dice in many forms that WE THE
PEOPLE face daily.  Most impor-
tantly as a believer in a heavenly
God and Jesus a savior for all
people and THE HOLY SPIRIT a
guide and a comfort for us; if WE
THE PEOPLE (God's people)
which are called by his name
shall humble ourselves, pray and
seek God's face; then turn from
our wicked ways; surely will we
hear from heaven and will be for-
given of our sins thus healing can
come to our land as stated in 2
Chronicles 7:14.  Then in James
4:10 Humble yourselves in the
sight of the LORD and he shall lift
you up.

Don't you know that after tak-
ing our first defense is taken
away, our guns then our most
valued treasure to go is the sword
of the Spirit which is the Word of
God! Our Bibles! Do you not see
in Hebrews 10:31 It is a fearful
thing to fall into the hands of the
living God! America is headed in
that direction.

In my opinion,
Susan Neal
Ashdown, Arkansas



Friday, July 31, 2015 — Minden Press-Herald 5

Celebrate your wedding,engagement, 
or anniversary with Webster Parish!

Send an email to community@press-herald.com to find out how!
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ENGAGEMENT

August 2, 2015
Old Shongaloo Rock Church will be holding its annual
Revival at 7 p.m. with the Rev. Johnny Adkins as guest
speaker. At 6 p.m .Sunday, August 2, the church will have
pot luck at the church prior to service. At 6 p.m .Monday,
August 3, salads, sandwiches, chips and dips will be
served before service. Following service Tuesday, August
4, there will be an ice cream social. For more information
call Elba Haynes at 846-2306 or Barbara Haynes at 846-
2888.

Greater St. Paul Baptist Church will have its annual Dea-
con & Deaconness program at 9:30 a.m.

August 3 - 5, 2015
New Hope Christian Methodist Episcopal Church will have
its revival 7 p.m. nightly with guest speaker Debra Hart
Henry.

August 8, 2015
The Golden Gates, Bro. Roy Flurnoy, King John Taylor,
and Jody & Company will be performing at True Life
COGIC’s evening of “Old-Fashioned Quartet Singing” at 7
p.m.

August 9, 2015
Saint James Missionary Baptist Church will celebrate its
149th church anniversary at 3 p.m. 

Mount Dillard Christian Methodist Episcopal Church will
have its homecoming and revival services at 11 a.m.

August 10 - 12, 2015
St. Mark Baptist Church will have its annual revival nightly
at 7 p.m. Guest evangelist will be the Rev. Arthur Douglas.

Mount Dillard Christian Methodist Episcopal Church will
have its revival nightly at 7 p.m. with the Rev. Derrick Har-
ris.

Miller Chapel Gospel Baptist Church will have its annual
revival 7 p.m. nightly. Guest speaker will be the Rev. ASby
Glosson. All are welcome.

Around Town
Marks - Butcher engaged to marry
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Glenbrook back to work
H I G H  S C H O O L  F O O T B A L L

M A J O R  L E A G U E  B A S E B A L L

Contenders make moves

C O L L E G E  F O O T B A L L

Key Buckeyes suspended for season opener

Minden Press-Herald and Minden Athletic

Team of TheWeek

Congratulations to the Minden AAA Nationals. They are this
week’s MPH/Minden Athletic Team of the Week for taking home the
state championship. They will represent Louisiana at the AAA World

Series in Myrtle Beach, South Carolina, August 7-13.

The Minden Press-Herald’s Team of the Week feature is brought to you every 
other Friday by Minden Athletic.

The Glenbrook Apaches took the field for their first day of fall camp on Thursday morning in helmets under a blistering summer sun. The Apaches were on the
field from 7-11 a.m. as new head coach Caleb Carmikle put the team through a variety of drills geared for speed and conditioning. That was followed by a brief
installation period for offensive and defensive scheme. Then the Apaches moved to conditioning before wrapping up on special teams. Press-Herald Photo/Blake Branch

CHICAGO (AP) — Ohio
State has suspended All-
America defensive end Joey
Bosa, receiver Corey Smith
and H-backs Jalin Marshall and
Dontre Wilson for its opening
game at Virginia Tech.

"Violation of team policies,"
Buckeyes coach Urban Meyer
said Thursday at Big Ten media
days. "That's as far as I'll go."

Meyer did say the violations
had nothing to do with players
breaking any laws.

Meyer said he has known for
a while that the suspensions
were coming and that he is

"100 percent supportive" of the
policies.

The defending national
champions open the season
Labor Day night in Blacksburg,
Virginia, against the only team
to beat them last season.

"We're pushing forward,"
Meyer said. "We're playing an
extremely talented team, on the
road in a tough environment."

Bosa had 13.5 sacks as a
sophomore and enters his
junior year as one of the top
NFL prospects in college foot-
ball.

Meyer said the Buckeyes

will look toward sophomore
Jalyn Holmes and redshirt
freshmen Sam Hubbard and
Darius Slade to help pick up
the slack for Bosa.

Marshall was second on the
team in receptions as a fresh-
man with 38 and was also the
team's best punt returner.

Wilson and Smith com-
bined for 41 catches for 555
yards.

The Buckeyes were ranked
No. 1 in the preseason coach-
es' poll released Thursday and
are likely to be top-ranked in
The Associated Press presea-

son Top 25 when it is released
Aug. 23.

Ohio State brings back most
of its key players from last
year's team, which bounced
back from a September loss to
the Hokies in Columbus to win
the first College Football
Playoff. Bosa might be the best
of the Buckeyes. He had 21
tackles for loss last season,
including a game-ending sack in
overtime against Penn State.

Marshall was a versatile
playmaker the Buckeyes lined
up all over the field, including
at quarterback at times. Wilson,

a junior, plays a similar role for
Ohio State. A foot injury against
Michigan State in November
cut his season short and kept
him out of spring practice.

Smith, a senior, is in his sec-
ond season with Ohio State
after transferring from junior
college.

The Buckeyes will likely
have a new addition at H-Back
when preseason practice starts
in August. Braxton Miller has
said he will switch from quar-
terback to receiver, which could
help make up for the losses
there.

HOUSTON (AP) — With
mere hours until the trade
deadline, the Houston Astros
and Toronto Blue Jays have
sent a clear message that
they're going for it — mak-
ing big moves to try and pro-
pel their teams into the play-
offs for the first time in a
long time.

The Astros haven't
reached the postseason since
being swept by the White
Sox in the 2005 World
Series. Toronto's playoff
drought is the longest in the
majors, with its last trip com-
ing in 1993, when Joe
Carter's home run won the
World Series.

The Blue Jays acquired
All-Star left-hander David
Price from Detroit on
Thursday, a couple days after
getting shortstop Troy
Tulowitzki from Colorado.

"These types of players,
the great superstar players,
rarely become available,"
Toronto general manager
Alex Anthopoulos said. "We
think we're a good team and
adding a guy like Price we
think makes us that much
stronger and will give us a
chance to win. It's as simple
as that."

The Astros made their
own moves before the dead-
line for making non-waiver
trades at 4 p.m. EDT Friday.

They added top left-hand-

ed starter Scott Kazmir from
Oakland last week and
picked up two-time All-Star
outfielder Carlos Gomez and
right-hander Mike Fiers from
the Brewers on Thursday
night.

"This was a move with an
eye toward this year, next
year and the year after that,
more so than five or seven
years from now," Houston
general manager Jeff

L u h n o w
s a i d .
" T h a t ' s
what our
fans want.
They want
us to win."

In other
trades, the
L o s
A n g e l e s
Dodgers,
w h i c h

haven't won it all since 1988,
the year of Kirk Gibson's
pinch homer off Dennis
Eckersley, increased their
already hefty payroll to $297
million with a three-team
deal. It brought them starters
Mat Latos from the Marlins
and Alex Wood from the
Braves as well as relievers
Jim Johnson and Luis Avilan
from Atlanta.

The Blue Jays are six
games back in the American
League East and two games
out of the second Wild Card.

"By adding these two,"
Toronto manager John
Gibbons said, "it gives me a
shot in the arm. I know that."

In Price they get a proven
veteran and high-level starter
to bolster a team with a pow-
erful offense. The first over-
all pick in 2007 is 9-4 with a
2.53 ERA in 21 starts this
season.

"They've got a good thing
going on right now in
Toronto," Price said.
"They've kind of been in this
situation before and didn't
make these type of moves. It
definitely shows you that
they want to win right now.
You have to respect that. You
have to like it and that's what
you want to be a part of."

The ahead-of-schedule
Astros wrapped up a three-
game sweep of the Angels on
Thursday night to take a two-
game lead in the AL West.
The young and energetic
team has finally coaxed fans
back to the park after several
miserable years of losing,
including dropping 100-plus
games in three straight sea-
sons from 2011-13.

"There is a lot of excite-
ment when you add two
players of that caliber for
this home stretch," Houston
manager A.J. Hinch said.
"Moves are exciting this
time of year. Everybody
loves that."

price
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BABY BLUES | RICK KIRKMAN AND JERRY SCOTT

BEETLE BAILEY | MORT & GREG WALKER

BLONDIE | DEAN YOUNG AND JOHN MARSHALL

FUNKY WINKERBEAN | TOM BATIUK

HAGAR THE HORRIBLE | CHRIS BROWNE

HI AND LOIS | BRIAN WALKER, GREG WALKER AND CHANCE BROWNE

MOTHER GOOSE & GRIMM | MIKE PETERS

SAM AND SILO | JERRY DUMAS

PRIMETIME TELEVISION

ENTERTAINMENT
facebook.com/mindenph
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Stewart: Meeting with Obama wasn’t a secret 
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Walters to revisit big news stories including Lennon murder 



FOR 
LEASE

R E S TA U R A N T 
FOR LEASE 318-
707-1964 

MISC.
DENIED SOCIAL 
SECURITY DIS-
ABILITY and/ 
or SSI? Please 
CALL 318-272-
3312 ALWAYS 
leave a message. 
NO money up 
front! 

NOTICES
THE WEBSTER 
PARISH SCHOOL 
BOARD is post-
ing a Request for 
Proposal(RFP) 
for E-Rate Cat-
egory 1. You can 
access the RFP 
by going to www.
websterpsb.org 
and navigating 
to Departments, 
Technology, E-
Rate, RFP, and 
then by opening 
the file named 
“ W P S D _ R F P _
W A N _ I N T E R -
N E T - F I N A L ” . 
There will also 
be a link to the 
RFP posted on 
the front page of 
www.websterpsb.
org under the 
news section that 
will bring you di-
rectly to the file. 

RENTAL
3BED 1BATH MO-
BILE HOME Hwy 9 
near Homer. $400/mo 
318-584-4373 
3BR 2BA DOU-
BLE WIDE mobile 
home, all electric, 
fridge, dishwash-
er, stove, double 
carport, front and 
back porch. 268-
5932 
MOBILE HOME 
3br 2ba $500/ 
mo $400/ dep no 
pets. Call 318-
584-5600 
TENTS FOR 
RENT! All occa-
sions. Call Archie 
@ 422-1497, or 
422-1797 
SERVICES

HUSBAND FOR 
HIRE Home main-
tenance jobs. Call 
Charles Stubbs 426-
5425 or 377-8658 

EMPLOYMENT
CARING & COM-
P A S S I O N A T E 
CNA’S WANTED 
Apply in person. 
Cypress Point 
Nursing Center 
Bossier City, LA 
(behind Lowe’s 
on Douglas Dr.) 
3 1 8 - 7 4 7 - 2 7 0 0 
Come & make 
a difference in 
someone’s life 
CW&W CON-
TRACTORS Sib-
ley, la Now hiring 
for the following 
Positions: Heavy 
equipment op-
erators Grapple 
truck drivers/ op-
erators Low-boy 
and dump truck 
drivers Very com-
petitive pay and 
benefits Package 
available. Send 
resume to hr@
cwwcontractors.
com
Or call 318-377-
4823 
HODGES SER-
VICES, LLC. is 
now hiring a 
skilled service 
tech/ installer for 
commercial hot/ 
cold refrigeration 
and commercial 
HVAC. Job Re-
quires: Minimum 
2yrs experience. 
Valid La. Drivers 
License. Excel-
lent verbal and 
written communi-
cation skills. Abil-
ity to work inde-
pendently or as a 
team player. On 
call and overtime 
are required. Will 
be responsible 
for servicing hot 
and cold com-
mercial kitchen 
equipment and 
c o m m e r c i a l 
HVAC. EPA cer-
tification a plus. 
We cover a large 
area of service. 
We offer competi-
tive pay based 
on experience. 
Send resume to: 
hodgesse rv i c -
esllc@ gmail.com 
Please include 
contact informa-
tion or any spe-
cial training or 
certifications you 
may have. 
NOW HIRING 
qualified serv-
ers, hostesses 
and food runners/ 
bussers. Email 
contact informa-
tion and previous 
work experience 
to admin@myro-
mas.com. 
ROSEBURG FOR-
EST PRODUCTS 
is seeking a 
Millwright for its 
Simsboro, LA fa-
cility. For more in-
formation and to 
apply for the po-
sition interested 
applicants should 
access the follow-
ing website http://
roseburg.appli-
cantpool.com and 
look for Millwright 
Simsboro, LA An 
Equal Opportu-
nity Employer in-
cluding Disability 
& Veterans 

THRIVING MIN-
DEN PRACTICE 
SEEKS experi-
enced insurance 
pre-certification 
specialist. Car-
diology experi-
ence preferred. 
Excellent ben-
efits. Please send 
resumes to P. 
O. Box 37388, 
Shreveport, LA 
71133-7388. 
VAC TRUCK DRIV-
ERS NEEDED 
Stallion produc-
tion services in 
homer & haugh-
ton, la is seek-
ing vacuum truck 
drivers. Must have 
clean record and 
pass drug/alco-
ho l /works teps . 
Benefits include: 
competitive pay, 
medical/dental/vi-
sion insurance-2 
plans to choose 
from-, 401k w/
co match, long 
& short term dis-
ability, 5/2 sched-
ule. $500 sign on 
bonus pd after 
90 days excellent 
emp record. Apply 
in person @ 7034 
hwy 79 n, homer, 
la or 205 hwy 164, 
bldg. A, haughton, 
la or email resume 
to jrolen@sofs.cc 
WEBSTER PAR-
ISH SCHOOL 
BOARD is declar-
ing a hiring emer-
gency for the fol-
lowing teacher 
positions: Social 
Studies/Grades 
6-12, Science/
Grades 9-12, 
Middle School 
Math, Middle 
School ELA. For 
more information 
regarding these 
positions contact: 
Charlotte Dean 
3 1 8 - 3 7 7 - 7 0 5 2 
x224 ccdean@
websterpsb.org 

FOR 
SALE

7 LAYING HENS 
FOR SALE 1 yr 
old. $10 each. 
377-3055 
GE DIGITAL CAM-
ERA Great Con-
dition $45 Call 
or text 318-658-
2923 for pictures 
and more infor-
mation!! 

GARAGE 
SALES

1013 RIDGE-
WOOD CIRCLE, 
MINDEN Multi 
family yard sale! 
Toys, School Uni-
forms, jewelry, 
children clothes 
and shoes, wom-
an clothes and 
shoes, lots of 
kitchen items and 
home decor!!! 
And much much 
MORE! 
Sale starts Au-
gust 1 at 8:00am. 
Please no early-
birds. 
126 S. E. 2ND ST. 
SIBLEY Free gift 
with every pur-
chase. Friday 
and Saturday 
7-12. Furniture, 
clothes, dishes, 
fishing equip-
ment, books, col-
lectables, and 
tools. 
210 ASH ST. 8 Family 
yard sale. Uniforms, 
shoes, clothes, jew-
elry, ect. Nothing over 
$4! Everything must 
go! Saturday 8am-
Until. 

3 FAMILY HUGE 
SALE 414 Chris 
Dr. Friday and 
Saturday 7a-1p 
Rain or Shine! 
322 CAREY LANE 
Saturday 8a-until. 
Women’s cloth-
ing and shoes, 
books, ceiling 
fan, shelving, too 
much to list. 
FRIDAY AND SAT-
URDAY 7-1, 702 
Wood St. Min-
den. Lots of good 
items! 
MOVING SALE 
Saturday August 
1st only! Inside! 
715 Claiborne St. 
Minden! 
RUMMAGE SALE 
to benefit Joe 
LeBlanc Food 
Pantry Saturday 
August 1st, 7am- 
until its all gone! 
408 Broadway, 
Minden. Dona-
tions are wel-
come! Contact 
Jessica 465-6726 
SATURDAY AND 
SUNDAY from 
8-2. 1406 Forest 
Dr. Minden, Liv-
ing estate sale! 
Glassware, Col-
lectables, Wom-
en’s Clothing. 

SHERIFFÕ S SALE

TIB - THE 
INDEPENDENT 
BANKERSBANK

VS.

THE OPENED 
S U C C E S S I O N 
OF THOMAS 
R. JANSSEN 
A/K/A THOMAS 
R I C H A R D 
JANSEEN AND 
GAIL G. JANSSEN 
A/K/A GAIL GREEN 
BOYD JANSSEN, 
GAIL BOYD, GAIL 
GREEN, GAIL 
JANSSEN

 In the 
T w e n t y - S i x t h 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
No. CV74211.

By virtue of a WRIT 
OF SEIZURE AND 
SALE issued out 
of the Twenty-Sixth 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
in the above styled 
and numbered suit 
and to me directed, 
I have seized and 
taken into my 
possession and 
will offer for sale 
at public auction to 
the last and highest 
bidder for cash 
WITH the benefit 
of appraisement 
and according to 
law at the principal 
front door of the 
Courthouse in the 
City of Minden, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, on

WEDNESDAY, 
August 5, 2015,

during the legal 
sale hours, the 
following property, 
to wit:

Begin at the 
Northeast corner 
of Lot No. 28, E.B. 
Smith Subdivision, 
located in 
Government Lots 4, 
5 and 8, Section 19, 
Township 18 North, 
Range 9 West, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, as per 
plat thereof on file 
and of record in the 
Office of the Clerk 
of Court, Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
in Map Book 3, 
Page 4, thence run 
North 84 degrees 
49 minutes West 
326 feet, thence 
run South 22 
degrees 00 minutes 
West 102.47 feet, 

thence run South 
84 degrees 49 
minutes East 48.3 
feet, thence run 
South 23 degrees 
55 minutes East 
203.1 feet, thence 
run North 60 
degrees 24 minutes 
East 243.8 feet, 
thence run North 
7 degrees 55 
minutes East 137 
feet to the Point of 
Beginning, together 
with all buildings 
and improvements 
located thereon.

And Also: A Lot 100 
x 246.7 x 102.47 x 
267 Ft. out of Lot 
# 26E. B. Smith 
Subdivision in Lots 
#4, 5 & 8 Sec. 19-
18-9 (Vol. 790-81), 
Records of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana.

Which has the 
address of 127 
Horseshoe Loop, 
Doyline, LA 71023

SOLD SUBJECT 
TO  ANY 
SUPERIOR LIENS, 
M O R T G A G E S 
OR PRIVILEGES 
THERETO.
 S a i d 
property seized 
is that of the 
defendant and will 
be sold to satisfy a 
judgment rendered 
in our  Honorable 
Court.

GARY S. SEXTON
Sheriff and Ex-
Officio Auctioneer, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana

Linda Vaughan-
Deputy

July 3, 2015
July 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________
SHERIFFÕ S SALE

LPP MORTGAGE 
LTD

VS.

ARTHUR ARCHIE 
NEAL AND 
PATRICIA ANN 
CREGHAN NEAL

 In the 
T w e n t y - S i x t h 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
No. 74618.

By virtue of a WRIT 
OF SEIZURE AND 
SALE issued out 
of the Twenty-Sixth 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
in the above styled 
and numbered suit 
and to me directed, 
I have seized and 
taken into my 
possession and 
will offer for sale 
at public auction to 
the last and highest 
bidder for cash 
WITH the benefit 
of appraisement 
and according to 
law at the principal 
front door of the 
Courthouse in the 
City of Minden, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, on

WEDNESDAY, 
August 5, 2015,

during the legal 
sale hours, the 
following property, 
to wit:

Lots 103 & 104, 
Babb addition, City 
of Minden, Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
as per plat recorded 
in Book 2, Page 82, 
in the Conveyance 
Records of 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, together 
with all buildings 
and improvements 
thereon.

Which has the 
address of 1007 
Horton Street, 
Minden, LA 71055

SOLD SUBJECT 
TO  ANY 
SUPERIOR LIENS, 
M O R T G A G E S 
OR PRIVILEGES 
THERETO.
 S a i d 
property seized 

is that of the 
defendant and will 
be sold to satisfy a 
judgment rendered 
in our  Honorable 
Court.

GARY S. SEXTON
Sheriff and Ex-
Officio Auctioneer, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana

Linda Vaughan-
Deputy

July 3, 2015
July 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________
O R D I N A N C E 
NO. 1054

AN ORDINANCE 
TO DECLARE 
CERTAIN CITY 
PROPERTY AS 
SURPLUS AND TO 
FIX THE TERMS 
OF THE SALE.

BE IT ORDAINED 
AND ENACTED 
by the Council of 
the City of Minden, 
Louisiana, in 
Regular Session 
held on July 6, 
2015, that the 
property described 
below is no longer 
needed for public 
purposes and has 
no foreseeable 
use in the future; 
this property is 
hereby declared 
surplus property:
# 1 2 8 7 0 6
Lot fronting 50 
ft. on West St. X 
200 ft. in NW/4 of 
NW/4 Sec. 28-19-9.

Section 1:  That 
the minimum bid 
be set as $500.00.                                         
Section 2:  That 
sealed bids will 
be received in 
the Office of the 
City Clerk, 520 
Broadway Street, 
P. O. Box 580, 
Minden, LA 71058 
until 2:00 p.m. on 
August 7, 2015, 
at which time said 
bids will be opened 
and read aloud.  
Bid envelopes 
should be marked 
with Ò Property 
Bid No. 1-15Ó .
Section 3:  If 
adopted, this 
ordinance shall not 
become effective 
until ten days after 
its passage, during 
which time any 
interested citizen 
may apply to the 
district court having 
jurisdiction of the 
municipality for an 
order restraining 
the disposition 
of the property.
By motion of 
Wayne Edwards 
and seconded 
by Mike Toland, 
Ordinance No. 
1054 was passed 
and adopted by 
the following vote 
on this 6th day 
of July, 2015:
AYES: Five 
NAYS: N o n e
A B S E N T: N o n e
A B S TA I N : N o n e
  
s / _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _
T o m m y  
Davis, Mayor

A T T E S T :

s/______________
Michael Fluhr, 
City Clerk

July 17 & 24 & 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________ 
O R D I N A N C E 
NO. 1055

AN ORDINANCE 
TO DECLARE 
CERTAIN CITY 
PROPERTY AS 
SURPLUS AND TO 
FIX THE TERMS 
OF THE SALE.

BE IT ORDAINED 
AND ENACTED 
by the Council of 
the City of Minden, 
Louisiana, in 
Regular Session 
held on July 6, 
2015, that the 
property described 
below is no longer 
needed for public 
purposes and has 
no foreseeable 
use in the future; 

this property is 
hereby declared 
surplus property:
# 1 2 8 7 0 6
Lot 1, Blk. Ô OÕ , 
Rosedale Subdiv.

Section 1:  That 
the minimum bid 
be set as $500.00.                                         
Section 2:  That 
sealed bids will 
be received in 
the Office of the 
City Clerk, 520 
Broadway Street, 
P. O. Box 580, 
Minden, LA 71058 
until 2:00 p.m. on 
August 7, 2015, 
at which time said 
bids will be opened 
and read aloud.  
Bid envelopes 
should be marked 
with Ò Property 
Bid No. 2-15Ó .
Section 3:  If 
adopted, this 
ordinance shall not 
become effective 
until ten days after 
its passage, during 
which time any 
interested citizen 
may apply to the 
district court having 
jurisdiction of the 
municipality for an 
order restraining 
the disposition 
of the property.
By motion of 
Fayrine A. 
K e n n o n - G i l b e r t 
and seconded 
by Mike Toland, 
Ordinance No. 
1055 was passed 
and adopted by 
the following vote 
on this 6th day 
of July, 2015:
AYES: Five 
NAYS: None 
ABSENT: None 
ABSTAIN: None 
  
s/______________
T o m m y  
Davis, Mayor

A T T E S T :

s/_____________
Michael Fluhr, 
City Clerk

July 17 & 24 & 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________ 
Request  for  
P r o p o s a l s

The City of 
Minden (Ò CityÓ ) 
is requesting 
proposals for the 
furnishing of all 
staffing, equipment 
and supplies 
necessary to 
provide food and 
drink (Alcoholic 
b e v e r a g e s  
prohibited in all 
city parks) in 
concession units 
at the Minden  
Recreation Center 
Park at Recreation 
Center Drive, 
Minden, La with 
electrical power 
and water available. 

The purpose 
of offering a 
c o n c e s s i o n 
program within 
the ball park 
is to provide 
c o n v e n i e n c e 
and enhance the 
enjoyment of park 
patrons. Submittals 
received by the 
due date will be 
publicly opened on 
August 21, 2015 
at 2:00 pm in the 
Cypress Room 
located at City Hall, 
520 Broadway, 
Minden, LA, 71055. 
The results will be 
publicly read aloud.

The City reserves 
the right to waive 
informalities in the 
bids and reject any 
or all bids for any 
reason whatsoever 
at the sole 
discretion of the 
City. The successful 
bidder will be 
notified in writing.

Please contact 
Michael Fluhr, City 
Clerk/Treasurer, 
Minden City Hall, 
520 Broadway, P. 0. 
Box 580, Minden, 
LA  71058-0580 
[Phone: (318) 377-
2144; Fax (318) 
371-4200] with any 
questions or to 
receive a proposal 

Classifieds
N O R T H W E S T  L O U I S I A N A

The Marketplace of Webster and Bossier Parishes.

Minden Press-Herald | 203 Gleason Street • Minden, La. 71055 | 318-377-1866 | www.press-herald.com

Rates

PricingÊisÊe asy!

$7.75
Per Day - Up to 20 
words! Additional 

words are only 30¢ 
cents more!

GarageÊS ales
No word limit.

$11
One Day

$16.50

Two Days
Receive a FREEÊGar ageÊS aleÊ

KitÊ with your two day ad!

*Garage Sale ads must be prepaid.

Deadlines

Ads
Line ads must be

submitted by noon
the day before

publication. Display ads
two days prior to

publication.

Public Notices
Public notices must be

submitted two days prior to 
publication date depending 

on the length. Notices
may be emailed to

classifieds@press-herald.com

Payments
Cash, Checks, Billing

GrowÊ YourÊB usiness
Call Courtney to place your ad!

Classified line ads are
published Monday 

through Friday in the 
Minden Press-Herald, 
Bossier Press-Tribune

and online at

377-1866
PLACEÊ YOURÊ
ADÊ TODAY!

RealÊE stateÊNot ice
“All real estate advertised herein is 

subject to the Federal Fair Housing Act, 
which makes it illegal to advertise any 
preference, limitation or discrimination 

based on race, color, religion, sex, handi-
cap, familial status, or national origin, or 
intention to make any such preference, 
limitation, or discrimination. We will not 

knowingly accept any advertising for real 
estate, which is in violation of the law. 

All persons are hereby informed that all 
dwellings advertised are available on an 

equal opportunity basis.

APARTMENTS 
FOR RENT
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s p e c i f i c a t i o n 
package. RFP 
packages are 
also available at 
www.mindenusa.
com or www.
bidexpress.com. 

Michael Fluhr, City 
C le rk /Treasurer

July 17 & 24 & 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________ 
SHERIFFÕ S SALE

DEUTSCHE BANK 
NATIONAL TRUST 

COMPANY, 
AS TRUSTEE 

FOR MORGAN 
STANLEY ABS 
CAPTIAL I INC. 
TRUST 2004-

WMC2

VS.

JAMES CURTIS 
SMITH, JR. A/K/A 
JAMES C. SMITH, 
JR. A/K/A JAMES 
SMITH, JR. AND 
CONNIE BILYEU 
SMITH A/K/A 
CONNIE B. SMITH 
A/K/A CONNIE 
SMITH A/K/A 
CONNIE BILYEU

In the 
T w e n t y - S i x t h 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
No. CV74683.

By virtue of a WRIT 
OF SEIZURE AND 

SALE issued out 
of the Twenty-Sixth 
Judicial District 
Court of Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
in the above styled 
and numbered suit 
and to me directed, 
I have seized and 
taken into my 
possession and 
will offer for sale 
at public auction to 
the last and highest 
bidder for cash 
WITH the benefit 
of appraisement 
and according to 
law at the principal 
front door of the 
Courthouse in the 
City of Minden, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, on

WEDNESDAY, 
September 2, 

2015,
during the legal 
sale hours, the 
following property, 
to wit:

That certain 
One and Ten 
Hundredths (1.10) 
acre tract of land 
lying in Government 
Lot 4, of Section 
Eleven, Township 
Seventeen North, 
Range 10 West 
(GovÕ Õ t Lot 4, 
Sec. 11, T17N, 
R10W), Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
and being more 
p a r t i c u l a r l y  
described as 
follows:

From a Bureau of 
Land Management 
monument at the 
southeast corner 
of Government 
Lot 4, Section 
Eleven, Township 
Seventeen North, 
Range Ten West 
(SB Cor. GovÕ Õ t Lot 
4, Sec. 11, T17N, 
R10W), Webster 
Parish, Louisiana, 
run North Twelve 
Degrees Fifty-five 
Minutes Forty-three 
Seconds East 
(N12¼ 55Õ 43Ó E), with 
the east line of the 
said Government 
Lot 7.  Fifty-five and 
Five Hundredths 
feet (55.05Õ ) to a 
half inch iron rod;

Thence North 
E i g h t y - n i n e 
Degrees Fifty-eight 
Minutes Seventeen 
Seconds West 
Three Hundred 
Eleven and Forty-
nine Hundredths 
feet (N89¼  58Õ  17Ó W 
311.49Õ ) to a half 
inch iron rod;

Thence North 
Zero Degrees Ten 
Minutes Forty-
eight Seconds 
West One Hundred 
Forty-six and Eight 
Hundredths feet 
(N0¼  10Õ  48Ó W 
146.08Õ ) to a half 
inch iron rod;

Thence South 
E i g h t y - n i n e 
Degrees Fifty-eight 
Minutes Seventeen 
Seconds East 
Three Hundred 
Forty-five and 
F o r t y - t h r e e 
Hundredths feet 
(S89¼  58Õ  17Ó E 
345.43Õ ) to a half 
inch iron pipe in 
the east line of 
Government Lot 4Õ

Thence South 
Twelve Degrees 
Fifty-four Minutes 
Thirty-five Seconds 
West One Hundred 
Forty-nine and 
E i g h t y - f i v e 
HUndredths feet 
(S12¼  S4Õ  35Ó W 
149.85Õ ) to the point 
of beginning and 
containing One and 
Ten Hundredths 
(1.10) acres, more 
or less, and being 
shown on survey 
plat attached and 
made a part hereof.

SOLD SUBJECT 
TO  ANY 
SUPERIOR LIENS, 
M O R T G A G E S 
OR PRIVILEGES 
THERETO.
 S a i d 
property seized 
is that of the 
defendant and will 
be sold to satisfy a 
judgment rendered 
in our  Honorable 
Court.

GARY S. SEXTON
Sheriff and Ex-
Officio Auctioneer, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana

Linda Vaughan-
Deputy

July 31, 2015
August 28, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________

SHERIFFÕ S SALE

THE BANK OF NEW 
YORK MELLON 
F/K/A THE BANK 
OF NEW YORK, 

SUCCESSOR TO JP 
MORGAN CHASE 

BANK, N.A., AS 
TRUSTEE FOR 
CENTEX HOME 
EQUITY LOAN 
TRUST 2002-D

VS.

MALISSA TINKES 
LEMAY A/K/A 
MALISSA KAY 
LEMAY, MALISSA 
KAY TINKES AND 
PHILIP SHAWN 
LEMAY A/K/A PHILIP 
SHAUN LEMAY

 In the 
Twenty-Sixth Judicial 
District Court of 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, No. 74678.

By virtue of a WRIT 
OF SEIZURE AND 
SALE issued out 
of the Twenty-Sixth 

Judicial District Court 
of Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, in the 
above styled and 
numbered suit and to 
me directed, I have 
seized and taken 
into my possession 
and will offer for sale 
at public auction to 
the last and highest 
bidder for cash 
WITH the benefit of 
appraisement and 
according to law at the 
principal front door of 
the Courthouse in 
the City of Minden, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana, on

WEDNESDAY, 
September 2, 2015,

during the legal sale 
hours, the following 
property, to wit:

Begin at the 
Southeast Corner of 
the Southeast Quarter 
of the Northwest 
Quarter, SE/C of SE/4 
of NW/4, Section 28, 
Township 23 North, 
Range 10 West, 
Webster Parish, 
Louisiana; thence run 
North 308 feet thence 
run West 45 feet, more 
or less, to the center 
line of the roadway 
traversing the 40 
acres tract and to the 
point of beginning of 
the property herein 
described; thence 
run West 480 feet; 
thence run North 210 
feet; thence run East 
480 feet to the center 

line of said roadway; 
thence run South 
along the center line 
of said roadway 210 
feet to the point of 
beginning; together 
with all improvements 
located thereon and 
all rights thereon 
belonging.

Which has the 
address of 1075 
King Orchard Road, 
Sarepta, LA 71071

SOLD SUBJECT 
TO  ANY 
SUPERIOR LIENS, 
M O R T G A G E S 
OR PRIVILEGES 
THERETO.

S a i d 
property seized is that 
of the defendant and 
will be sold to satisfy a 
judgment rendered in 
our  Honorable Court.

GARY S. SEXTON
Sheriff and Ex-Officio 
Auctioneer, Webster 
Parish, Louisiana
Linda Vaughan-
Deputy

July 31, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________
ADVERTISEMENT 
FOR BIDS
Sealed bids for 
surplus firefighter 
protective equipment, 
(22) SCBA Air Packs 
and (47) Aluminum 
cylinders for Webster 
Fire District 7 will 
be received by Mike 

Burton, Chairman, at 
100 MBL Bank Dr., 
Minden, LA 71055 
until Monday, August 
24, 2015 at 4:00 
p.m. CDT, and then 
opened publicly and 
read aloud at the 
meeting of the board 
on Tuesday, August 
25, 2015 at 5:30 p.m. 
at 11217 Highway 80, 
Minden, LA 71055. 
Any bid received 
after closing will be 
returned unopened. 
All equipment will be 
sold together as one 
unit with minimum 
bid of $20,000.00 
for the entire lot 
of equipment. 
Specifications may 
be obtained from 
Brian Williams, Fire 
Chief at 61 Shell 

Street, Minden, LA 
71055, (318) 371-
2754, or chief@
w e b s t e r f d 7 . c o m . 
Evidence of authority 
to submit the bid 
shall be required 
in accordance with 
R.S. 38:2212(A) 
(1) (C). The right is 
reserved to reject 
any and all bids and 
to waive informalities 
for just cause.
Brian Williams, 
Fire Chief
Webster Fire District 7
61 Shell Street
Minden, LA 71055
(318) 371-2754
2015; and Friday, 
August 7, 2015.
July 24 & 31, 2015
August 7, 2015
Minden Press-Herald
_______________ 

CROSSWORDÊ

CRYPTOQUIPÊ

Friday, July 31, 2015 - Minden Press-Herald 9

PUBLICÊ NOTICESÊ CONT.



SMALL ADS
DO SELL!

CALL AND 
PLACE 
YOURS
TODAY! 

377-1866
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Thanks 
for

reading!
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>> The Marketplace of Northwest Louisiana.   Call and advertise today!     377-1866

ADVERTISE 
HERE!
Call 377-1866
and speak

to an advertising
representative today!
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