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It’s Christmas time in Minden
CHRISTMAS SPIRIT

WILL PHILLIPS
Minden Press-Herald

Tuesday afternoon the 
City of Minden held an 
urgent press-conference 
in order to inform citi-
zens of a new threat to 
the city’s Christmas spirit 
this holiday season. Dur-
ing the conference, Mayor 
Nick Cox along with Po-
lice Chief Jared McIver 
warned citizens of a sus-
pect who has been sight-

ed in the 
local area 
and urged 
residents 
to help lo-
cal law en-
forcement 
find and 
apprehend 
him. 

“ W e 
have a particular situa-
tion. Christmas in Min-
den was so successful … 
and this has caught the 
attention of a lot of tour-
ism. Outside people have 
noticed how beautiful our 
city is, and that’s thanks to 
the hard work of a lot of 
city workers,” said Mayor 
Cox. 

“But with the good 
comes the bad, and we’ve 
also caught the atten-
tion of some people, or 
in particular, one certain 
situation that has started 

MPD requests 
help of citizens 
in apprehention 
of a suspicious 

person 

AMBER MCDOWN
Minden Press-Herald

The December 5 meet-
ing of the Webster Parish 
Police Jury (WPPJ) was 
relatively routine with 
c o m m i t -
tee reports 
containing 
fewer an-
n o u n c e -
m e n t s 
than usual. 

T h e 
board of 
jurors ap-
p r o v e d 
some invoices for pay-
ment, the minutes of the 
November 7 road com-
mittee, finance commit-
tee, building and grounds, 
as well as last month’s 
regular meeting. 

They also approved the 
adoption of Webster Par-
ish Ordinance 1020 with 
its mergers and redefin-
ing of the territorial limits 
of precincts and polling 
places in Webster Parish. 
While a number of pre-
cincts were combined, 
the mergers should cre-
ate little change for voters 
in the upcoming spring 

elections.
“None of the locations 

will be changed,” said 
Webster Parish Police 
Jury President Jim Bon-
sall. “It’s not going to be 
a hardship on anybody to 
get to their voting place if 
they haven’t had a hard-
ship before now.”

The board approved 
recreation funding in 
the following amounts: 
District 10 received $500 
for the Webster Parish 
Council on Aging-Meals 
on Wheels program sup-
plies;  District 11 received  
$600 for the Village of He-
flin Police Department 
to purchase vests, radios, 
and utility pouches; Dis-
trict 6 received $500 for 
the Dorcheat Museum; 
and District 1 received 
$1,000 for the Council on 
Aging in Springhill. 

Ethel Smith was reap-
pointed to a five-year 
term on the Webster Par-
ish Library Board of Con-
trol. Melinda Davidson’s 
appointment as director 
of the Office of Communi-
ty Services was approved 
for 2024, and she was 

Webster Parish Police 
Jury approves ordinance 
changes; wishes Davison 
and Cox and fond farewell

WPPJGRANT

AMBER MCDOWN
Minden Press-Herald

The Minden REC has 
been awarded a Com-
munity Outreach grant 
totaling $22,000 from 
Town & Country Health 
& Rehab. The grant 
aligns with Town & 
Country’s commitment 
to supporting the com-

munities where their fa-
cilities are located.

The grant will be used 
to replace the REC’s 
outdoor basketball 
backboards throughout 
Minden, alongside the 
provision for new soc-
cer goals in select loca-
tions.

This financial boost 
from Town & Country 

Health & Rehab reflects 
an effort to promote 
recreational activities 
and healthful lifestyles 
within the community. 
The Minden REC ex-
presses gratitude for the 
support and looks for-
ward to implementing 
these improvements for 
the benefit of Minden’s 
residents.

AMBER MCDOWN/PRESS-HERALD PHOTO
The REC was awarded a Community Outreach grant totaling $22,000 from 
Town & Country Health & Rehab. It will be used to replace outdoor basket-
ball backboards.

Minden REC secures $22,000 
community outreach grant from 

Town & Country

AMBER MCDOWN
Minden Press-Herald

The Louisiana Depart-
ment of Transportation 
and Development (La 
DOTD) is set to intro-
duce two left-turn sig-
nals at critical intersec-
tions along Homer Road 
in Minden. The affected 
intersections are the 
Fort Street intersection 
(Brookshires) and the 
Fincher Road intersection 
(Walgreens), both identi-
fied for a history of left-
turn-related incidents.

La DOTD is currently 
preparing the necessary 
equipment for this modi-
fication. As part of the 
safety initiative, the traf-
fic-light timings will be 
adjusted along the stretch 
from the Broadway/Hom-

IMPROVEMENT

Louisiana 
DOTD to 
enhance 
safety on 
Homer 
Road with 
new turn 
signals

PRESS-HERALD PHOTOS
Christmas in Minden 
was a big hit last week-
end. The event kicked 
off on Friday with a tree 
lighting ceremony. May-
or Nick Cox said, “I want 
to wish y’all a merry 
Christmas. I hope this 
season is full of joy and 
happiness and laughter 
and good times.” 
Cydni’s School of 
Dance then performed, 
and the hayride gave 
guided tours through 
the Historic District, 
participants enjoyed 
the Wine Walk and the 
Reindeer Run, and Brick 
Street Coffee was serv-
ing up hot chocolate 
and donuts.
Saturday’s festivities 
included a brunch at 
Geaux Fresh, hot choco-
late at the Broken Bean, 
a vendor market on 
Pearl Street, photos with 
Santa and Mrs. Claus 
at the Warehouse, and 
ornament crafting at the 
Dorcheat Museum. That 
evening,  Amanda Shaw 
played fiddle at the Civic 
Center, and the Savior 
Christmas Concert was 
performed at First Bap-
tist Church.
The weekend wrapped 
up on Sunday night with 
the Christmas parade 
through downtown 
Minden followed by a 
fireworks display. In the 
parade,TNT Allstars won 
Best Marching Group, 
the Minden High School 
band won Best Band, 
Living Word of Minden 
won Spectacular Spar-
kles, and the Calvary 
Baptist Church won the 
Santa’s Award.
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Fibrebond expands operations in Minden, investing $43 million in growth
AMBER MCDOWN
Minden Press-Herald

Patrick Caraway, vice 
president and chief finan-
cial officer of Fibrebond, 
addressed the Minden 
Lions Club on December 
7, shedding light on the 
company’s current $43 
million expansion initia-
tive. Fibrebond, founded 
by Claud Walker in 1982, 
has been a key player 
in manufacturing engi-
neered-to-order build-
ings, catering to the data 
center, fiber, industrial, 
utility, and wireless mar-
kets.

Caraway commended 
the strong work ethic of 
the workforce in north-
west Louisiana, empha-
sizing the pivotal role they 
play in the company’s 
success. 

“There is nowhere else 
in the country that we see 
the work ethic that people 
have in northwest Loui-
siana,” said Caraway. “I 
wouldn’t trade these peo-
ple for the world. It’s the 
guys out there in the plant 
that make this happen.” 

With over 500 employ-
ees, Fibrebond signifi-
cantly contributes to the 

local economy, employ-
ing nearly 300 residents 
of Webster Parish and 
approximately 150 from 
adjacent parishes, along 
with over 200 electrical 
and mechanical contract 
workers.

In 2023 alone, Fibre-
bond made a substantial 
economic impact, dis-
bursing over $10 million 
to vendors in Minden. 
Caraway attributes this 
success to the company 
having a single manufac-
turing facility located in 
northwest Louisiana.

Despite facing adversity 
in 1998 when a fire devas-
tated their facility, Fibre-
bond rebounded with re-
silience, reopening a new 
plant within 11 months. 
Over the years, they diver-
sified their product line, 
manufacturing innova-
tive precast concrete and 
steel products for vari-
ous applications in the 
data center and industrial 
markets.

The current expansion 
involves adding 74 acres, 
totaling 253 acres, and 
enhancing infrastructure. 
This includes increas-
ing parking capacity by 
178 spaces, introducing a 

90,000 square foot high-
performance concrete 
slab for larger industrial 
assemblies, and expand-
ing the warehouse build-
ing by 80,000 square feet. 
Automation upgrades 
include an integrated 
beam line and a 100-foot 
plasma table with two ro-
botic heads for in-house 
steel plate processing. 

Beams up to 71 feet in 
length will be automati-
cally conveyed to one of 
six welding stations, each 
with its own 20-ton over-
head crane.

Recognizing the envi-
ronmental impact of their 
operations, Fibrebond is 
integrating sustainability 
measures by incorporat-
ing a one-megawatt so-

lar array to self-generate 
renewable power. The 
expansion, slated for 
completion in 2024, will 
double Fibrebond’s ca-
pacity for data center and 
industrial projects, so-
lidifying its position as a 
cornerstone of economic 
growth in Minden, Loui-
siana.

The Lions Club has in-

teresting speakers every 

Thursday at noon. They 

meet at the American 

Legion Memorial Hall lo-

cated at 119 Pine Street, 

and they welcome new 

members who share the 

mission of community 

service in Minden.



noticing our city.”
The mayor went on to 

provide a description of 
the suspect, and what 
citizens will need to be 
on the lookout for. 

“During this holi-
day season I’d like for 
you to be particularly 
on the lookout for any 
green hairy individuals. 
Also keep a watchout 
for odd looking things 
such as dogs with horns 
strapped to their heads 
with rope,” said Mayor 
Cox. 

“Neighbors need to 
watch out for one anoth-
er and keep an eye out. 
We need to work closely 
with law enforcement 
officials during this sea-
son. As your mayor, I 
want you to know that 
we are not going to let 
anyone steal our Christ-
mas spirit this year.”

Chief McIver then 
started providing more 
details about the situa-
tion, confirming the de-
scription the mayor had 
presented along with 
how citizens can help 
the police department 
apprehend the individ-
ual.

“The mayor has told 
everyone today about 
some information that 
we have. As a depart-
ment, we’ve been re-
ceiving intelligence 
from local neighboring 
agencies about a sub-
ject who may possibly 
be coming to our town,” 
said Chief McIver. 

“This subject, as the 
mayor described, is 
green, hairy, may even 
be wearing some red 
and white. The informa-
tion we have is that this 
subject is not dangerous 
to people, but he’s dan-
gerous to the Christmas 
spirit. Because of that, 
we want you to remain 
vigilant, we want you to 
be looking out for him.”

The chief then gave 
instructions to citizens 
to call 318-510-4701 
to inform them of any 
sighting of the green and 
hairy suspect.

“You’re encouraged 
to call anytime that you 
may see someone re-
sembling this subject. 
You may get a record-
ing, and if you do leave 
a message of where you 
saw that individual, 
where at, what they were 
doing, and a date and 
time,” said Chief McIver.

“This is going to help 
us as a local law enforce-
ment agency to hope-
fully apprehend him to 
keep him from stealing 
the spirit of Christmas. 
Again, this subject is not 
a danger to anyone, just 
to the spirit of Christ-
mas, so we need your 
help in trying to appre-
hend this subject to save 
the Christmas Spirit of 
Minden.”

This is an ongoing in-
vestigation and the Min-
den Press-Herald will be 
providing more updates 
on the story as informa-
tion becomes publicly 
available.

er Road intersection to 
the Cline Street/Homer 
Road intersection. This 
measure aims to ensure 

a seamless traffic flow 
while addressing safety 
concerns at the specified 
intersections.

Engineer Brandon Gre-
co from La DOTD stated, 

“Our crews are currently 
testing our equipment to 
make sure everything is 
working properly before 
we install the new turn 
arrows. We are looking 

to get both intersections 

done and timings for the 

whole corridor updated 

before Christmas.”

given authority to sign 
documents on behalf of 
that organization.

The final agenda item 
was the approval of the 
update to the use agree-
ment for ABC & 123 
HeadStart in Claiborne 
Parish. 

Next the committee 
reports were given. 

Melinda Davidson 
with the Office of Com-
munity Services an-
nounced that the Sec-
tion 8 Housing waiting 
list is open. 

Wanda Finley with 
HeadStart noted that 
enrollment in their pro-
gram is climbing in Clai-
borne Parish. Funding  
limits enrollment to 232 
children. 

Savannah Jones of 
Webster Parish Libraries 
noted that the summer 
reading program train-
ing for the state will be 
held in Minden, possi-
bly for the first time ever. 

Serena Gray of Web-
ster Parish Tourism not-
ed that the Sibley kayak 
launch is planned to be 
installed in March, 2024, 
once the water level ris-
es sufficiently.

The coroner’s office 
reported 40 deaths in 
November, which is 
about average. 

Col. Thompson of the 
Webster Parish Asses-
sor’s office reminded 
the board that property 
taxes are due at the end 
of this month. 

Shakira Williams from 
the LSU Ag Center spoke 
next, reporting that they 
have an opening for a 4H 
agent. The position clos-
es December 15, and the 
position can be applied 
for at www.lsuagcenter.
com. Job Opportunities 
can be found under the 
Services tab.  The center 
is also investigating way 
to improve the 4H live-

stock program, and it 
is holding a food safety 
class at the Council on 
Aging. 

Brian Williams from 
the Office of Emergency 
Preparedness reported 
that they have received 
the Starlink equipment 
which will be used by 
emergency personnel in 
case of an internet out-
age, they have received 
the Claiborne Electric 
grant to purchase por-
table radios which can 
be used during major 
incidents and loaned to 
agencies without this 
equipment, and they 
have recently completed 
a cyber security work-
shop. During this work-
shop they have discov-
ered that many of the 
smaller municipalities 
are unable to afford on-
call IT staff, so his de-
partment is investigat-
ing using a collaborative 
effort to help them pro-
tect and maintain their 
systems. 

Jessica Gorman of the 
Dorcheat Museum pre-
sented the final commit-
tee report. It has been 
a fairly quiet month at 
the museum with a few 
out of town visitors and 
some small items do-
nated to the museum. 
They now have a scan-
ner and laptop which 
will be available, starting 
in January, for the public 
to use.

The meeting ended 
with well wishes and 
thanks to Vera Davison 
and Cayla Cox who will 
be leaving the police 
jury at the end of this 
month. Davison is re-
tiring after many years 
serving on the jury and 
will be replaced by Tan 
Grigsby. Cox, who took 
over for Nick Cox when 
he was elected mayor, 
will be replaced by Nan-
cy Hines.

WPSB
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Bernice Virginia 
Underwood

A visitation for Bernice Virginia 
Underwood were held Friday, De-
cember 8, 2023, at 10:00 a.m. with a 
celebration of life service followed 
at 11:00 a.m. at Rose Neath Funeral 
Home Chapel in Minden, Louisi-

ana. Interment will followed at Minden Cemetery in 
Minden, Louisiana. 

Bernice was born January 9, 1938, in Minden, Louisi-
ana. She was a lifelong member of Calvary Missionary 
Baptist Church.

Bernice Virginia Underwood, loving wife, beloved 
mother, and cherished Nana left this life in the early 

morning hours of December 6, 2023, surrounded by 
her family. We are rejoicing knowing she is now rest-
ing in the arms of her Lord and Savior. She spent many 
hours nurturing various flowers and plants, beautifying 
God’s creation. She had a servant’s heart and lived her 
life dedicated to serving her Lord. Her greatest joy was 
her family. 

She was preceded in death by her parents, Era and 
Rueben P. Miller, sister, Martha Wynn, and brothers, 
Jimmy Miller and Carrol Miller.

She is survived by her husband, Lynn Underwood 
of Minden; son, Bruce Underwood and wife Tami of 
Magnolia, AR; daughters, Debra Domerese and hus-
band Marty, of Emerson, AR, and Renee Cottrell and 
husband William of Minden; grandchildren, Matthew 
Underwood and wife Kadi, Amanda Underwood, Luke 
Cottrell, and Hunter Cottrell, and great-grandchildren 
Walker Underwood and baby sister, Wrenley on the 
way. 

JURY
Continued from Page 1

MPD
Continued from Page 1

SIGNALS
Continued from Page 1

Virginia Jinks Newman
Virginia Jinks Newman of Minden, LA passed away 

December 7, 2023, to be with her heavenly Father. Vir-
ginia was born April 9, 1936, to the late Harvey and 
Willie Mae Jinks in Rayville, Louisiana.  She lived there 
through the 6th grade and then moved to Nachez, Mis-
sissippi. She graduated from Natchez High School in 
1954.

Virginia was married 52 years to the late James Ed-
ward Newman of Bude Mississippi. They moved to Cal-
ifornia in 1957, and returned to Louisiana in 1985, and 
lived out their lives. 

Virginia was preceded in death by her sister Evelyn 
Jinks Brewer and husband W.J. of Minden, brothers, 

Kenneth Lavelle Jinks and wife Mary of Dothan, Ala-
bama and Carl Clayton Jinks and wife Sandra of Min-
den. 

She is survived by her sons, Monte Newman of Min-
den and Eugene Scott Newman and wife Margie of 
Arizona; granddaughter, Jessica Newman Murdock 
and husband Chris; grandsons, James Colby Newman 
and Eugene Scott Newman, Jr; great-grandson Rowan 
Tristan Murdock, and numerous nieces and nephews. 

Visitation was Monday, December 11, 2023, at 10:00 
a.m. with services followed at 11:00 a.m. at Heflin Bap-
tist Church in Heflin, Louisiana with Bro. Ronnie Os-
borne officiated. Interment was at Bistineau Cemetery 
in Heflin, Louisiana under the direction of Rose Neath 
Funeral Home in Minden, Louisiana. 

Malea Geis named Employee of the Month in Webster 
Parish School Board meeting

AMBER MCDOWN
Minden Press-Herald

In recognition of her 
commitment to her stu-
dents and colleagues, 
Malea Geis, a special edu-
cation teacher at Central 
Elementary School, was 
honored as the Employee 
of the Month during the 
Webster Parish School 
Board’s December 4 
meeting.

The accolade was pre-
sented by Kevin Thomp-
son of Taylor and Sons, 
who shared sentiments 
from Ms. Geis’ recom-
mendation letter. Thomp-

son read, “Ms. Geis is 
a dedicated and caring 
member of our staff. She 
never hesitates to help out 
when asked, including as-
sisting her fellow teachers 
and the administration. 
Ms. Geis is a tireless advo-
cate for her students. Her 
caring spirit and consid-
eration for others are why 
I am recommending her 
for the Employee of the 
Month.”

The Webster Parish 
School Board applauds 
Ms. Geis for her service 
and congratulates her on 
this well-deserved honor.

Louisiana legislative task force looking for 
reforms on high-speed pursuits

(The Center Square) – 
Members of a legislative 
task force are mulling sev-
eral potential reforms for 
high-speed police pur-
suits following the death 
of two teens in December.

The Task Force on Safe-
ty for Law Enforcement 
Officers Involved in High-
Speed Chases on Friday 
heard from Jim Craft, 
executive director of the 
Louisiana Commission 
on Law Enforcement, and 
Tim Morgan with Pur-
suit Alert, a technology 
to alert drivers of high-
speed pursuits.

The task force was cre-
ated through a Senate res-
olution approved in the 
2023 legislative session in 
response to a New Year’s 
Eve crash that killed two 
teens and injured a third. 
Maggie Dunn, 17, and 
Caroline Gill, 15, cheer-
leaders at Brusly High 
School, died; Liam Dunn, 
Maggie’s brother, was in-
jured.

The chase involved 
Baton Rouge and Addis 
Police officers’ pursuit of 
a stolen vehicle. Officer 
David Couthron crashed 
into the vehicle with the 
teens. Both Couthron, 
who worked for the police 
department in Addis, and 

the driver who initiated 
the chase, Tyquel Zan-
ders, 24, were charged 
with crimes in the inci-
dent.

Couthron resigned 
in January and faces six 
charges at trial scheduled 
for March 18.

Craft discussed the 
benefits and drawbacks 
of various programs, 
technologies, policies 
and training to reduce 
accidents and injuries re-
lated to officer-involved 
high-speed vehicle pur-
suits in Louisiana.

“Police academies are 
required in this state to 
present a minimum of 
four hours of training on 
emergency driving,” he 
said, adding that annual 
in-service training of 20 
hours per year can also 
include driving. “That 
should be a part of their 
in-service training.”

While agencies have 
discretion over 12 hours 
of in-service training, 
many are priced out of 
hands-on training on ag-
gravated flight.

“That training is so ex-
pensive,” he said. “You 
beat up the tires, you beat 
up the cars.”

Craft suggests all law 
enforcement agencies 

should have restrictive 
pursuit policies, with 
limits on pursuits for cer-
tain circumstances and 
provisions for when they 
should be terminated.

While Craft said the 
policies “should be lim-
ited to the most serious 
of crimes,” he acknowl-
edged that “what we’ve 
seen is the people being 
pursued have been more 
and more reckless.

“They can really put the 
public safety of a commu-
nity at risk,” he said.

Spike strips, “arrest 
mats,” and devices to 
change traffic signals are 
also available but require 
funds and training to use 
effectively, Craft said.

Task force members 
noted that funding for 
law enforcement train-
ing is on the decline and 
noted that there currently 
is no required training for 
supervisors, who play a 
critical role in high-speed 
pursuits.

Task force Chair Sen. 
Caleb Kleinpeter, R-Port 
Allen, also pointed to the 
current penalty for ag-
gravated flight that some 
argue is insufficient.

“Today the max is five 
years for aggravated 
flight, and I don’t think 

that’s enough,” he said. “It 
should match the penal-
ties of why you are run-
ning.”

Morgan with Pursuit 
Alert explained how 
the company’s product, 
which is installed in po-
lice cruisers can alert 
drivers in the vicinity 
of high-speed chases to 
clear traffic and prevent 
collisions, technology 
that’s currently in place in 
numerous police depart-
ments in multiple states.

Parents of the teens 
killed in December testi-
fied to their frustrating 
experience in the after-
math. They stressed the 
need for more account-
ability and more training 
to avoid similar outcomes 
in the future.

“To me the biggest part 
is accountability, and 
that’s zero funding,” said 
Maggie’s mother, Erin 
Martin. “I just want to 
make sure no other mom 
gets a call like I got that 
day.”

The task force will re-
view potential reforms 
and compile recommen-
dations for lawmakers to 
consider in the 2024 leg-
islative session.

GOVERNMENT



The U.S. Supreme Court 
heard oral arguments this 
past week in what observers 
have deemed the most im-
portant tax case in decades.  
To answer the question at 
issue in the case—whether 
Congress can tax unreal-
ized capital gains as if they 
were income—the Court 
will need to define what “in-
come” actually is.

I find this case intriguing 
both because of my general 
disdain for over-taxation 
and over-regulation that 
Americans are burdened 
with every day but also be-
cause, in deciding this case, 
the Court will need to exam-
ine the U.S. Constitution. 

I begin by sharing that our 
Constitution did not origi-
nally allow for the taxation 
of income.  In fact, the Con-
stitution originally permit-
ted only two classes of taxa-
tion: 1. Direct taxes, which 
must be apportioned among 
the states in proportion to 
their populations; and 2. 
“indirect” taxes, specifically 
duties, imposts, and excis-
es, which must be uniform 
throughout the country.  
Only because of the later 
16th Amendment is Con-
gress able to impose income 
taxes on people (as opposed 
to businesses or other enti-
ties). (N. Siegel and Steven J. 
Willis, National Constitution 
Center).

These “direct” taxes are 
specifically laid out in Ar-
ticle 1, Section 9 which 
states that “no capitation, 

or other direct tax shall be 
laid, unless in proportion 
to the Census or Enumera-
tion ...”  The “indirect” taxes 
are specifically laid out in 
Article 1, Section 8 which 
states that the “Congress 
shall have power to lay and 
collect taxes, duties, imposts 
and excises to pay the debts 
and provide for the common 
defense and general welfare 
of the United States—but all 
duties, imposts and excises 
shall be uniform throughout 
the United States.”  

Well, before the 16th 
A m e n d -
m e n t , 
Congress 
did not 
want to 
be lim-
ited in its 
ability to 
tax based 
upon a 
s t a t e ’ s 
p o p u l a -
tion nor 
did it want 

to be required to see that its 
taxes were uniform through-
out the country.  These con-
stitutional requirements 
created obstacles.  So, those 
in Congress who wanted 
the federal government to 
be able to tax individual in-
come circumvented those 
restrictions with the passing 
of the 16th Amendment to 
the U.S. Constitution which 
states: “The Congress shall 
have the power to lay and 
collect taxes on incomes, 
from whatever source de-

rived, without apportion-
ment among the several 
states, and without regard 
to any census or enumera-
tion.”  The 16th Amendment 
was passed and successfully 
ratified on February 3, 1913, 
establishing Congress’s right 
to impose a federal income 
tax.

With this in mind, we will 
return to the Supreme Court 
case at issue.  The case is 
Moore v. U.S., and it involves 
a simple set of facts.

As recounted in the Wall 
Street Journal, “in 2006, 
Charles and Kathleen Moore 
invested $40,000 in an 11% 
equity interest in a foreign 
corporation.  Between 2006 
and 2017, the company was 
profitable but reinvested all 
its earnings in the business.  
The Moores thus didn’t re-
ceive dividends or any other 
income from the invest-
ment.”   Well, “under the 
2017 Tax Cuts and Jobs Act, 
the Moores became subject 
to a new federal levy called 
the ‘mandatory repatriation 
tax’ applicable to investors 
in overseas corporations …. 
This new tax treated their 
allocable share of the cor-
poration’s undistributed 
earnings as if they were ac-
tually received by the share-
holders.” (Emphasis added) 
(H. Adler and L. Willis, WSJ, 
Dec. 5, 2023).

The obvious legal issue 
facing the Court is how 
these completely unreal-
ized “gains” can be taxed as 
“income.”   Simply, how can 

so-called “income” be taxed 
if it is never received? In fact, 
“if realization is no longer a 
requirement for taxable in-
come, then ‘income tax’ has 
no boundaries in the Con-
stitution, and Congress can 
directly tax wealth.” (Id. WSJ, 
12-05-23).

I note that property taxes 
are comparable to taxes on 
unrealized capital gains 
since such taxes are im-
posed without a sale of the 
house. However, as a policy 
matter, such taxes are justi-
fied based upon the need for 
the taxing entity, generally 
the city or parish, to estab-
lish a source of funding to 
provide police, fire, public 
education, and other com-
munity and municipal ser-
vices.

The Supreme Court has 
not taken on a tax case of 
this potential significance 
in many years.  The pro-tax 
naysayers claim the Court’s 
“meddling” in this issue 
could cause the Court to 
also examine other sections 
of the Internal Revenue 
Code.  Would that it were.  
And soon. The Court would 
do a great service to the 
American taxpayer by sim-
ply (re) defining income in 
the historic fashion it’s been 
understood.

Shreveport attorney, Royal 
Alexander, worked in D.C. in the 

U.S. House of Representatives for 
nearly 8 years for two different 

Members of Congress from 
Louisiana. 

“It’s beginning to look a lot 
like Christmas. Everywhere you 
go....”

I love seeing all the colored 
lights, the different decorations, 
and all the houses seemingly in 
competition for the best deco-
rations in their neighborhood.

    My Christmas decorations 
are few but enough that I en-
joy sitting and enjoying my 
tree. Our daughter has taken 
on the role of tree decorator for 
me, and she doesn’t have a lot 
to work with. Regardless, she 
creates a beautiful addition to 
our living room. The lights are 
turned on as soon as I get up 
and are turned off as we start to 
bed.

    Our ornaments are mean-
ingful ones as they have been 
collected through the years 
from friends, students and fam-
ily members. The first ornament 

to go on our tree is a little blue 
Harley motorcycle, in memory 
of our son who lost his life on 
his treasured Harley.

After that, 
others are 
placed in 
no particu-
lar order, 
but they are 
all colorful 
and when 
they are all 
in place, it is 
a beautiful 
sight.

    We are 
enjoying the 

tree and a few other decora-
tions as we look forward to this 
Holy Season.

Usually all our family gathers 
at our house on Christmas Eve 
where we enjoy a special meal, 
in addition to several plates of 

candies and other snack items. 
The children look forward to 
the snacks as they are usually 
reserved for Christmas and are 
not made any other time of the 
year.

I have just begun to make the 
snacks and today I made what 
is called Addictive Tidbits made 
with oyster crackers. These 
are usually served with Jala-
peno Weiners and small  bits of 
cheese.

Tomorrow I will begin mak-
ing candy, the first of which 
will be Martha Washington and 
Peanut Butter cups. I usually 
make several different kinds as 
everyone has a favorite. Some 
like no nuts, some eat walnuts, 
some peanuts and almost all 
will eat pecans. 

    A few gifts have been pur-
chased but not all and none 
are wrapped and placed under 

the tree. Some of the family will 
not be with us but they will visit 
other familiy members or else 
have family members coming 
to visit them. The ones who will 
be here will be welcomed with 
a big hug from Pa and Mimi and 
then we will enjoy an evening 
together.

The holiday will not be all 
joy and happiness as there are 
those who have lost loved ones 
in the past few days and some 
have had famliy members in-
jured in a horrific accident. 
Some family members are suf-
fering from dreaded health 
problems and this will hamper 
the celebrations for their fami-
lies.

 Regardless of our situation at 
this time, we must remember 
the true reason we celebrate. 
Not to have rich foods and open 
presents from friends or loved 

ones, but to rembember that 
blessed birth of the Christ Child 
so many years ago.

He came to be our Savior and 
we will remember this special 
Child, born in a manger. The 
angels proclaimed his birth to 
the shepherds who “watched 
their sheep by night”. We will 
celebrate this with special choir 
music and presentations de-
picting the birth of this Holy 
one.

As we are so busy getting 
ready for our family to gather, 
let’s take time to try and make it 
a little better for those who are 
alone, sad or suffering at this 
time.

    From our family to yours, 
we wish you a Merry Chrisrmas.

Fannie Moore lives in Shongaloo.

Having just read  The Right 
Words at the Right Time, ed-
ited by Marlo Thomas, tells 
how her father, Danny Thom-
as,  told her how to win the 
race by keeping her blinders 
on, which made all the differ-
ence in her life as an actress, 
reminding me of Nicholas 
Sparks who said “we sit si-
lently and watch the world 
around us.  This takes a life-
time to learn.  It seems only 
the old are able to sit next to 
one another and not say any-
thing and still feel content.  
Speaking from experience 
I believe young people are 
often insecure and appear 
to need to break the silence, 
instead of realizing silence is 
pure. Silence is holy.  It draws 
people together because only 
those who are comfortable 
with each other can sit with-
out speaking.  This is the great 
paradox.”

Max Ehrmann, born in 
1872, the author of Desidera-
ta said “Go placidly amid the 
noise and haste, and remem-
ber what peace there may be 
in silence. As far as possible 
without surrender be on good 

terms with all persons. Speak 
your truth quietly and clearly; 
and listen to others,even the 
dull and the ignorant; they 
too have their story.”

I have had this poem in 
my collec-
tion since 
high school 
in Tulsa, 
back in the 
60’s when  
my speech 
t e a c h e r , 
Shirl White, 
gave it to us.

 If he 
wanted us 
to know 
something 
he would 
read it 

aloud.  He was a master at 
keeping our attention and 
a role model in many ways, 
never counting the hours and 
effort he spent in nurturing 
our creative streak whether in 
acting or writing.

I have found one of the best 
ways to be happy with myself 
is to be “comfortable in my 
own skin.”

It took me a lifetime to learn 

that but it also liberates me, 
giving  me a  feeling  of accep-
tance but  also tends to help 
control blood pressure prob-
lems!

Why don’t we know more of 
these great truths when we are 
young?   Perhaps insecurity is 
a great driving force in our life 
that helps us to achieve our 
goals while we learn these 
truths as we go along.

The problem of nit picking  
has been an age old issue con-
sidering that the Pharisees in 
Jesus time thought they had 
it down even accusing Jesus 
of sin because He ate with the 
publicans and sinners!

This is how it is and prob-
ably always will  be.

I’ve observed that those 
who are often critical will 
sooner or later commit the 
same mistakes as the ones 
that they were most critical.

That’s my take on life.
This attitude  in churches of-

ten turns the “un-churched” 
away.

Some of these thoughts 
came to me after an accident 
in 2013. While leaning on my 
crutches, with pins still in my 

foot, I stopped to scribble 
down these  thoughts  that 
have become a part of my 
philosophy.

 Napoleon Hill, famous 
American motivational 
speaker, said “we become 
what we think about.”

Our thoughts and those of 
others impact our lives.

Max Ehrman also said “be 
gentle with yourself.  You are 
no less than the trees and the 
stars. You have a right to be 
here.”

 I feel at peace when  I strug-
gle with  “situations” in my life 
that somehow have always 
worked out, giving me secu-
rity in life even when I’ve felt 
all alone.

With all of my struggles, I 
am so blessed!.

As I pillow my head I know 
that Jesus is the same yester-
day, today and forever and 
He always gets me to the right 
place at the right time.

Email Sarah at sarahp9957@aol.
com
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FROM THE BACK PORCH

It’s beginning to look a lot like Christmas

Definitions matter
U.S. Supreme Court case poses an important 

constitutional question: what constitutes ‘income?’

OPINION
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The right words at the right time

FANNIE
MOORE
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HIGH SCHOOL BASKETBALL HIGH SCHOOL FOOTBALL

CORRECTION

BLACK BAYOU – No 
report. Water is low. Con-
tact Honey Hole Tackle 
Shop 323-8707 for latest 
information.

BUSSEY BRAKE 
– The water is low and 
overall fishing is slow. For 
latest information, contact 
the Honey Hole at 323-
8707. 

OUACHITA RIV-
ER – Crappie have been 
best fishing jigs or shiners 
around submerged tops 
in the river and in river 
lakes. Bass are best in the 
cuts fishing shad imitation 
lures. For latest informa-
tion, contact the Honey 
Hole Tackle Shop at 323-
8707.

LAKE D’ARBONNE 

– With cooler weather 
dropping water tempera-
tures, the crappie bite is 
on fishing the channels 
and channel edges in 14-
16 foot water on shiners 
or jigs. Bass are moving to 
the secondary points and 
swim baits and soft plas-
tics are picking up some 
nice fish. Catfish continue 
to be caught fishing cold 
worms and night crawl-
ers off the banks. For lat-
est information, call An-
derson Sport Center at 
368-9669 or Honey Hole 
Tackle Shop at 323-8707.

LAKE CLAIBORNE 
– The lake is down some 
seven feet as the result of 
the drawdown. Crappie 
are moving to deep water 
out from the dam with 
shiners taking the most 

fish while jigs are work-
ing fairly well. Bass fish-
ing has fair this week as 
they too are starting to 
move deep. Billy Willis, 
Ruston, had one near 8 
pounds. Boats can still be 
launched at the State Park 
launch.. For latest infor-
mation, call Kel’s Cove at 
927-2264 or Terzia Tackle 
at 278-4498.

CANEY LAKE – Bass 
are moving to deeper 
water with best catches 
made on jigs, spoons 
and soft plastics. Crappie 
have been best around 
the deeper tops on shin-
ers or jigs and they will 
also be headed for deeper 
water out from the dam 
as temperatures drop. 
For information contact 
Caney Lake Landing at 

259-6649, Hooks Marina 
at 249-2347, Terzia Tackle 
at 278-4498 or the Honey 
Hole Tackle Shop at 323-
8707.

LAKE POVERTY 
POINT – Catfishing has 
been good. Crappie fish-
ing has improved on both 
ends of the lake with the 
south end of the lake as 
well as around the slips 
starting to improve. No 
report on bass. For latest 
reports, call Poverty Point 
Marina at 318/878-0101. 

LAKE YUCATAN – 
The water is low and fish-
ing is quite slow this week. 
A few slab crappie have 
been caught on jigs and 
shiners. For information, 
call Surplus City Landing 
at 318/467-2259.

Fishing Report

Naming deer stands    
takes imagination

OUTDOORS

GLYNN HARRIS

Calling ‘em deer 
“stands” is a misnomer. 
Most of us don’t stand; we 
sit. It’d make more sense to 
say we were going to climb 
a tree and hunt out of our 
deer “seat”, which could be 
a chair, or stool, or board 
nailed between two branch-
es.

However, we need to ac-
cept the fact that we climb 
and sit down in deer stands. 
Even the hunting catalogs 
call ‘em deer “stands” so if 
they’re good enough for Ca-
bela’s they ought to be good 
enough for us.

The first deer stand I 
ever used was one I built. By 
today’s standards, climb-
ing and sitting in the one I 
made would get you seri-
ously maimed, or worse. To 
reach my perch 12 feet up 
in the tree, I drove spikes 
into the trunk (that activity 
today would get me banned 
from the club by the timber 
company owning the land), 
and once I reached my de-
sired height, I nailed a two-
by-four in a fork of the tree 

for a place to sit. Admitted-
ly, my hunts were of fairly 
short duration because the 
comfort level deteriorated 
rather quickly. 

Today, while some 
hunters still construct their 
own stands, there are types 
of deer stands on the mar-
ket that boggle the mind. 
There are box stands, 
ground blinds, climbing 
stands, lock-on stands, lad-
der stands, saddle stands 
and even one you pull on a 
trailer to your hunting site, 
hit a button and the stand 
on the trailer magically el-
evates for you to climb into 
and hunt.

Many of the stands we 
have used on our hunting 
club are stands members 
constructed and for sure, 
they’re better made and 
safer than the spikes-in-
the-tree; two by four seat 
from my early days of chas-
ing deer.

Interestingly, we named 
most of our stands to coin-
cide with either the location 
or the circumstances from 
which the stand originated.

One of the stands I used 

was a ground blind I built 
and it had been dismantled, 
moved and reconstructed at 
least three times. I disman-
tled and moved the stand 
to my former hunting club 
in 2001, and in honor of 
the devastating event that 
took place that year on Sep-
tember 11, I call this stand 
Ground Zero.

Another of my stands, a 
box mounted atop a ladder, 
rested against a tree that 
was literally covered in poi-
sonous green vines when 
the tree was selected. It’s 
only natural that this stand 
was called Poison Oak.

Still another was a simi-
lar stand sitting against a 
tree on the banks of Sugar 
Creek, a stream that period-
ically floods and brings with 
it debris from who-knows-
where. While getting the 
stand ready to place on the 
tree, I noticed an old light 
bulb lying in the leaves. It 
had washed in from some-
where. The name of this 
stand? Forty Watt.

Another of my stands 
was a tri-pod and the day 
I put it up, a pretty orange 

Gulf Fritillary butterfly (I 
had to Google it to find out 
the name) came and lit on 
my finger. The tri-pod be-
came the Butterfly Stand.

My good friend and 
hunting partner, George 
Seacrist, named all his 
stands from Running Wild 
to Bermuda Triangle to In-
dian Mound. One of his that 
caught my interest was a 
big roomy ground stand he 
set up down in the bottom 
along the creek. He called it 
Noah’s Ark. 

A couple of years later, 
he set up a box stand on the 
ridge above Noah’s Ark and 
was pondering with me one 
day about a possible name. 
Hmmmm….Noah’s Ark is 
down in the bottom. Why 
not Mount Ararat on the 
ridge? George liked it and 
that’s the new name it was 
given.

The next stand I build 
I’m going to call it the Ten 
Point Buck stand. Maybe if 
I name it that, I’ll get that 
big one. If things turn out 
wrong, I guess I’ll just call 
it the Dang-I-Missed-Him 
stand. 

Six Glenbrook 
players first-team 
All-District 1-1A

ROBERT SUMMERLIN/SPECIAL TO THE PRESS-HERALD
Minden’s Darnell Morris (23) attempts to block a shot underneath the 
basket against Airline last week.

24-team Minden Holiday 
Classic starts Wednesday

RUSSELL HEDGES
Minden Press-Herald

The 33rd annual Car Gi-
ant of Minden Minden Hol-
iday Classic gets underway 
Wednesday.

The tournament fea-
tures 12 boys and 12 girls 
teams.

The Holiday Classic is 
one of the few bracket tour-
naments left instead of just 
a series of games. Champi-
ons in both divisions will 
decided Saturday.

Three gyms will be used 
over the first three days — 
Minden High, Webster Ju-
nior High and the Minden 
Recreation Center.

(Records are through 
Sunday.)

Both host teams have a 
good chance of making it to 
the finals.

The Crimson Tide (6-2) 
open against North Web-
ster (1-3) Wednesday at 8 
p.m. in the Minden gym.

Minden split games 
last week, falling to Airline 
56-48 on the road and de-
feating Haughton 64-55 at 
home.

The Lady Tiders (4-
4) face Ringgold (3-4) at 
6:40. They also split games 
last week, falling to Airline 
55-48 on the road and de-
feating Richwood 54-49 at 
home.

The winners of both 
games advance to the semi-
finals of their respective di-
visions, which are Friday.

Ringgold (8-3), which 
won the Lakeside tourna-
ment, is Minden’s most 
likely semifinal opponent in 
the boys division.

Calvary Baptist (6-3), 
the 2023 select Division III 
runner-up, is in the other 
half of the bracket along 
with Gibsland-Coleman (7-
3), Lincoln Prep (2-1) and 
Class 5A Parkway (8-5).

Simsboro (12-3) and 
Richwood (6-5) are in Min-
den’s half of the girls brack-
et.

Arcadia (10-0), a non-

select Division IV semifi-
nalist last season, is in the 
other half of the bracket. 
The Lady Hornets face 
Loyola (3-6) Wednesday 
at 4 at Minden High with 
a spot in the semifinals on 
the line.

Gibsland-Coleman (4-
6, which reached the non-
select Division V quarterfi-
nals last season, could face 
the winner for a spot in the 
title game.

The Lakeside boys and 
girls are also in the tourna-
ment. 

The Lakeside boys 
picked up their first win last 
week, defeating Plain Deal-
ing 40-35.

RUSSELL HEDGES
Minden Press-Herald

Six Glenbrook play-
ers have been named to 
the All-District 1-1A first 
team selected by the dis-
trict’s coaches.

Seniors Chase Sentell 
and Garrett Brown made 
the first team on offense 
and defense. 

Sentell was selected at 
flanker/wing and Brown 
at tight end and lineback-
er.

Glenbrook’s other 
first-team selections 
were senior wide receiver 
Landry Powell, senior 
center Jackson Lott, ju-
nior defensive lineman 
Daivari Jackson and ju-
nior punter Seth Man-
grum.

Sentell rushed for 
723 yards on 97 carries 
and caught 25 passes for 
507 yards, not including 
the second round playoff 
game against St. Mary’s. 
He scored 13 rushing 
touchdowns and nine re-
ceiving.

Powell caught 28 
passes for 438 yards and 
four touchdowns.

Glenbrook finished 
8-3. The Apaches finished 

third in the district be-
hind non-select Division 
IV runner-up Haynes-
ville and quarterfinalist 
Homer.

Powell was also 
named to the second 
team at linebacker. Ju-
nior Jackson Walker was 
a second-team selection 
at wide receiver and de-
fensive back.

Glenbrook’s other sec-
ond-team selections were 
senior offensive tackle 
Spencer Brantley, fresh-
man guard Nolan Still, 
junior placekicker Easton 
Sanders and junior de-
fensive lineman Jonathan 
Bryant, 

Haynesville senior 
running back/receiver 
Alonzo Jackson was 
named the Offensive 
MVP. He was named to 
the first team at athlete 
and also made the first-
team defense at lineback-
er.

Homer senior de-
fensive back Katrevrick 
Banks was named the 
defensive MVP. He also 
made the first-team of-
fense at receiver.

Note: For the full All-
District 1-1A team go to 
press-herald.com.

There was an error 
from the source in a story 
last week on the All-Dis-
trict 1-4A football team. 
Junior defensive line-
man Demetrius Robinson 
was one of three Minden 
players named to the first 

team. Junior running 
back Dunavon Robinson 
was named only to the 
second team.

The error was first 
corrected in a story post-
ed on press-herald.com 
on Dec. 5.

COLLEGE FOOTBALL

LSU QB Daniels 
wins Heisman

STAFF REPORTS
Minden Press-Herald

LSU senior quarter-
back Jayden Daniels is 
the 2023 Heisman Tro-
phy winner.

Daniels, who trans-
ferred from Arizona State 
efore the 2022 season, is 
LSU’s second Heisman 
winner in the last five 
years.

Quarterback Joe Bur-
row won the award in 
2019.  

He was the first win-
ner from LSU in 60 years. 
The late Billy Cannon 
won it in 1959.

The Heisman Trophy 
capped a week that saw 
Daniels win the Davey 
O’Brien Award, the Wal-
ter Camp Player of the 
Year, AP Player of the 
Year and the Johnny Uni-
tas Golden Arm Award.

In 12 games in 2023, 
Daniels passed for 3.812 
yards and 40 TDs. He also 
rushed for 1,134 yards.

ROBERT SUMMERLIN/SPECIAL TO THE PRESS-HERALD
Minden’s Travesti Byrd goes up for a shot against Airline. The Lady 
Tiders face Ringgold Wednesday in the Minden Holiday Classic.
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GOOD NEWS

Christmas – one night 

among millions, but it was 

enough to make us believe 

in miracles. There is no way 

our simple minds can com-

prehend the love God has 

for us. But that did not keep 

Him from coming to us in the 

form of a baby, born in a stall 

in Bethlehem. His name is 

Immanuel –“God with us….”  

Yes, Jesus came to live among 

us. He breathed our air, felt 

our pain, knew our sorrows, 

and died for the sins of man. 

He did not come to frighten 

us, or threaten us, but to show 

us the way to warmth, safety, 

salvation and to God. (Max 

Lucado/Chuck Swindoll)

Christmas began in the 

heart of God. It is complete 

only when it reaches the 

heart of man. Through Jesus, 

God reached down for man to 

bring reconciliation to Him. 

Only when man reaches up 

and takes God’s hand does 

the reconciliation take place. 

Perhaps Jesus pondered: 

“Try to imagine what I gave 

up when I came into your 

world as a baby. I set aside 

My Glory, 

so that 

I could 

i d e n t i f y 

with you. 

I became 

poor so 

that you 

might be-

come rich. 

I gave My life that you might 

gain yours.” (Sarah Young).

Yes, this is Christmas…

God loving, searching, and 

giving Himself – to us. It is 

completed when man recog-

nizes his need for receiving, 

giving and yielding himself 

totally – to God. Just think 

of this: While the innkeeper 

tended to his guests, the de-

voted Joseph tended to Mary, 

and the shepherds tended 

their flocks….and over in the 

stall, a Child came forth to 

tend to all the souls of man, 

including ours! When Christ 

entered our world, He didn’t 

come to brighten our long, 

dreary December days, but 

to transform our lives so we 

can be ‘candles glowing in 

the darkness around us.’  We 

could not do this by our-

selves. We could not earn our 

salvation. But the very pur-

pose of His coming into the 

world was that He might of-

fer up His life as a sacrifice for 

our sins. From the Cradle to 

the Grave…His mission was 

simply this: “He came to die 

for us!”  And this is the heart 

of the Christmas story. The 

Cradle is just the beginning 

point. (Billy & Ruth Graham/

Rich Miller).

Christmas is the most stun-

ning rescue story of all time. 

Think about this: Man is lost 

without any hope of ever sur-

viving in this sin-sick world. 

But a loving God is not will-

ing that any should perish, 

so in His divine wisdom, He 

sent His only Son into the 

world (Baby Jesus) to live 

among man, identify with 

them, and then take the sins 

of the world on His back all 

the way to the Cross so man 

might be made ‘right with the 

Heavenly Father” and be in 

full fellowship with Him. God 

was willing to invade the hu-

man race in order to rescue 

man. What a thriller! “The 

Greatest Rescue Story Ever 

Told!” (John Eldredge).

Christmas is reassurance 

that God keeps His prom-

ises, then and now.  So, one 

night…among the wrinkled 

hills of Bethlehem….God, 

who knows no boundaries, 

took on the shocking con-

fines of a baby’s skin. (Philip 

Yancey). That night, with the 

Baby’s first cry, history was 

sliced open and the world 

was changed forever. And 

on that holy night, the Light 

entered the darkness and 

brightened the surround-

ings. Yes, that first Christmas 

changed everything. And it 

was a child that did it….but 

not’ just any child’ – Jesus 

Christ, God’s Holy Son.  O 

Blessed Advent, prepare our 

hearts to celebrate Christmas 

with great anticipation! (Ref-

erence taken from “Christ-

mas, On This Holy Night”).

Bill Crider is Chaplain of Minden 

Medical Center

Bill Crider

   BLESSED ADVENT – BRINGING SALVATION AND NEW HOPE

“Sojourn in this land and I will be 
with you and bless you, for to 
you and to your descendants 
I will give all these lands, 
and I will establish the oath 
which I swore to your father 
Abraham . . . and by your 
descendants all the nations 
of the earth shall be blessed.” 
Genesis 26:3-4  NASB 

  

God promised Abraham 
a land for his descendants, 
a land of rest, a land flowing with milk 
and honey.  In this land God would 
bless and provide for those who obey 
His commands, who follow His Word.  

Through this promise all the nations 
will be blessed.  This promise 
is fulfilled for us in a faith re-
lationship with the Savior, be-
ing forgiven of sin, living in His 
righteousness with an inheri-
tance with Him for eternity.

  

Lord Jesus, thank You for the 
blessings of salvation, peace, 
rest, and eternal life I have re-
ceived through faith in You. 

 
Max Hutto is a Baptist Minister and a resi-

dent of Minden.  More information can be found 
at www.upwardlook.org.

THE UPWARD LOOK

Max Hutto

Significant Places: The Promise Land

Good News

6 | WEDNESDAY,DECEMBER 13, 2023	 MINDEN PRESS-HERALD | MINDEN, LA

INSPIRATION

It’s the most wonderful time of the 

year. It’s a time when we teach children 

to believe in a man they  can’t see and his 

promise of making their dreams 

come true if they are good. We 

watch them mind their  man-

ners and be on their best be-

havior. However, this behavior 

in many cases is temporary un-

til the  return of Christmas next 

year. The question I ask is can 

our behavior toward God be viewed in 

the same  manner? It seems that we have 

times of not talking to God until we want 

or need a blessing or miracle.  It’s not fair 

for us to wait until a particular season 

or situation to be our best for God. It’s 

not fair that we  put so much emphasis 

on respecting and obeying a 

fictional entity when we don’t 

give that same  respect to our 

very real God. My call to action 

today is not to take away the 

magic of the holidays or the  

dreams of children but to en-

courage us all to give God our 

best behavior all year.

Bernard Harris III is a Haughton firemAN AND A 

LOCAL RESIDENT OF MINDEN

Bernard Harris

Our Best Behavior



Classifieds
PLACE YOUR AD TODAY!
classifieds@press-herald.com

Classified line ads are published Tuesday, Wednesday and Friday in the Minden Press-Herald, Bossier Press-Tribune and online at www.press.herald.com

Classified
Rates
Pricing is easy!

$7.75
Per Day - Up to 20 words! 

Aditional words are only 30 
cents more!

Garage Sales
No word limit.

$11
One Day

$16.50
Two Days

Receive a FREE Garage 
Sale Kit with your two day 

ad!

* Garage Sale ads must be 
prepaid.

Deadlines

Ads
Line ads and display ads must 

be submitted by noon two 
days before publication. 

Public Notices
Public notices must be sub-

mitted two days prior to 
publication date depending 

on the length. Notices may be 
emailed to classifieds@press-

herald.com

Payments
Cash Checks, Billing

Real Estate Notice
“All real estate advertised 
here is subject to the Fed-

eral Fair Housing Act, which 
makes it illegal to advertise 
any preference, limitation or 
discrimination based on race, 
color, religion, sex, handicap, 

familial status, or national 
origin, or intention to make 
any such preference, limita-
tion, or discrimination. We 
will not knowlingly accept 

any advertising for real estate, 
which is in violation of th 

elaw. All persons are hereby 
informed that all dwellings 

advertised are available on an 
equal opportunity basis.

Grow
Your

Business
Call to place your ad!

PLACE
YOUR

AD
TODAY!
377-1866

HAVE YOUR 

PET SPAYED 

OR 

NEUTERED

SCHOOL 

ZONES 

ARE 

HANDS 

FREE
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january 10, 2024
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PROCEEDINGS OF THE CITY OF MINDEN, STATE OF 
LOUISIANA, TAKEN IN REGULAR SESSION HELD ON 
DECEMBER 4, 2023

The Minden City Council met at City Hall, Minden, Loui-
siana, beginning at 6:00 p.m. with the following members 
present: Mayor Nick Cox, Carlton Myles, Levon Thomas, 
Latasha Mitchell, Michael Roy, and Andy Pendergrass. 
Absence(s): None.
Mayor Cox welcomed everyone to the meeting. Prayer was 
offered by Michael Roy and Andy Pendergrass led the Pledge 
of Allegiance. It is noted for the record that Mayor Cox
allowed both council and public comments prior to every 
vote. Michael Roy moved to amend the printed agenda to 
add Item (9) Adopt Resolution – Regarding a Lease Purchase 
Agreement for the Purpose of Financing New SCBA Air 
Packs for the Minden Fire Department. The motion was duly 
seconded by Carlton Myles and the vote was unanimously in 
favor. Abstention(s): None. Absence(s):None.
Carlton Myles moved to adopt the minutes of the Minden 
City Council Regular Session held on November 6, 2023, as 
presented. The motion was duly seconded by Latasha Mitchell 
and the vote was as follows. Aye(s): Carlton Myles, Levon 
Thomas, Latasha Mitchell, and Andy Pendergrass. Nay(s): 
None. Abstention(s): Michael Roy. Absence(s): None. The 
motion carried. Upon motion by Andy Pendergrass and duly 
seconded by Michael Roy, the council unanimously adopted 
a Resolution Adopting the Louisiana Compliance Question-
naire for the Audit Period of 10/01/2022 – 09/30/2023, as 
presented. Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
Latasha Mitchell moved to confirm Bria Cooper as a full-time 
policer officer in the Minden Police Department, subject to 
passing all applicable tests. The motion was duly seconded 
by Michael Roy and the vote was unanimously in favor. 
Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
Upon motion by Andy Pendergrass and duly seconded 
by Levon Thomas, the council unanimously confirmed 
Hunter Buchanan as a full-time police officer in the Minden 
Police Department, subject to passing all applicable tests. 
Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
Carlton Myles moved to authorize Mayor Cox to execute a 
purchase agreement for property on Recreation Drive, subject 
to attorney review. The motion was duly (29) 12-04-2023
seconded by Andy Pendergrass and the vote was as follows: 
Aye(s): Carlton Myles, Levon Thomas, Latasha Mitchell, and 
Andy Pendergrass. Nay(s): Michael Roy. Abstention(s): None. 
Absence(s): None. The motion carried. The following action 
was taken regarding condemned property: Barbara Miller
4502 N. Ripple Ridge Drive Houston, Texas 77053 
505 Plateau Street South 70 ft. of Lot #8, Blk. “7”,
Harrell Hts. in SW/4 of NW/4 Sec. 27-19-9 Gregory Miller 
was present representing the property on behalf of the 
property owner. Miller asked for more time to rehabilitate the 
structure located on the property. Carlton Myles moved to 
authorize Mayor Cox to issue an order declaring the property
condemned and further order the demolition of any structures 
located thereon and the cleaning of the lot within 120 days 
of December 4, 2023. The motion was duly seconded by 
Andy Pendergrass and the vote was unanimously in favor. 
Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None. 
The following action was taken regarding condemned 
property:

The Church of God in Christ
c/o Superintendent Roy Hill
114 Kennedy Lane
Minden, Louisiana 71055

707 Crichton Street
Lot 50 x 150 ft. in NE/4 of NW/4
Sec. 28-19-9

With no party representing the property owner present at 
the time this item was heard, Latasha Mitchell moved to 
authorize Mayor Cox to issue an order declaring the property 
condemned and further order the demolition of any structures 
located thereon and the cleaning of the lot within 30 days 
of December 4, 2023. The motion was duly seconded 
by Michael Roy and the vote was unanimously in favor. 
Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
The following action was taken regarding condemned 
property:

Esquire 2019, LLC
707 Benton Road, Suite 125
Bossier City, Louisiana 71111

514 Babb Circle
Lot #9, Babb Addn., Unit #2

With no party representing the property owner present at 
the time this item was heard, Latasha Mitchell moved to 
authorize Mayor Cox to issue an order declaring the property 
condemned and further order the demolition of any structures 
located thereon and the cleaning of the lot within 30 days of 
December 4, 2023. The motion was duly (30) 12-04-2023
seconded by Andy Pendergrass and the vote was unanimously 
in favor. Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
City Clerk Michael Fluhr presented the Budget/Financial Re-
port for the month of October 2023. No motion was required.
Fire Chief Brian Williams presented the Annual Fire Report 
for the Year 2023. Upon motion by Michael Roy and duly sec-
onded by Latasha Mitchell, the council unanimously approved 
the Annual Fire Report, as presented. The Police Report for 
the month of October 2023 was unanimously accepted, as
presented, by motion of Latasha Mitchell and second by 
Michael Roy. Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
Upon motion by Michael Roy and duly seconded by Levon 
Thomas, the council unanimously adopted a Resolution 
Regarding a Lease Purchase Agreement for the Purpose of 
Financing SCBA Air Packs for the Minden Fire Department, 
as presented. Abstention(s): None. Absence(s): None.
The Minden Police Department and Minden Police Associa-
tion presented the Courage and Bravery Award to Colin 
Campbell and presented the Life Saving Award to Officer 
Logan Clingan. Other announcements and council comments 
were heard. The meeting was then adjourned.

___________________________
Nick Cox, Mayor

ATTEST:

______________________________ 

December 13, 2023
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 ELM GROVEFIELD 

24-4 and 24-5

LEGAL NOTICE
STATE OF LOUISIANA, OFFICE OF CONSERVATION, 

BATON ROUGE, LOUISIANA.

In accordance with the laws of the State of Louisiana, 
and with particular reference to the provisions of Title 30 
of Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950, a public hearing 
will be held in the Hearing Room, 1 st Floor, LaSalle 
Building, 617 North 3rd Street, Baton Rouge, Louisiana, 
at 9:00 a.m. on TUESDAY, JANUARY 9, 2024, upon the 
application of AETHON ENERGY OPERATING, LLC. 
At such hearing the Commissioner of Conservation will 
consider evidence relative to the issuance of Orders 
pertaining to the following matters relating to the Haynes-
ville Zone, Reservoir A, in the Elm Grove Field, Webster 
Parish, Louisiana.
1. To authorize applicant to drill, designate and utilize one 
cross unit horizontal well to serve as a unit well for HA RA 
SU119 and HA RA SU120, and five cross unit horizontal 
wells to serve as alternate unit wells for HA RA SU119 
and HA RA SU120, all at the locations and in the general 
manner shown on the plat submitted with the application, 
or at any other legal locations within such units (to be 
drilled in lieu of all approved, but undrilled horizontal 
wells approved for HA RA SU119 and HA RA SU120 by 
Office of Conservation Order No. 361-L-156, effective 
November 10, 2015), and to approve exceptions to the 
spacing provisions of Order No. 361-L, effective July 29, 
2008, as to the common boundary of the units which will 
be served by the cross unit horizontal wells, provided that 
there will be no perforations in a wellbore closer than 330’ 
to any unit boundary other than the common unit bound-
ary between the units to be served by the wells.
2. To find that each of the proposed horizontal wells are 
necessary to efficiently and economically drain a portion 
of the Haynesville Zone, Reservoir A, underlying the 
units on which it is proposed to be drilled which cannot 
be efficiently and economically drained by any existing 
well on such units, will prevent waste, avoid the drilling of 
unnecessary wells, protect correlative rights and promote 
the full and efficient development of the natural resources 
of this state.
3. To provide that if the horizontal portion of a well is 
cased and cemented back above the top of the Haynes-
ville Zone, Reservoir A, the distance to any unit boundary 
and offset well(s) will be calculated based on the distance 
to the nearest perforation in the well and not on the pen-
etration point or terminus of the well in the Haynesville 
Zone, Reservoir A.
4. Except insofar as set forth above, to confirm and 
continue in full force and effect the provisions of Order 
No. 361-L, effective July 29, 2008, as amended and 
supplemented by the 361-L Series of Orders, the units 
created thereby, and of all applicable Statewide Orders.
5. To provide that the unit allowables for the units to be 
served by the proposed wells may be produced from the 
unit or substitute unit well, from any alternate unit well, or 
from any combination of such wells serving the unit, at 
the discretion of the operator.
6. To provide that production from a cross unit horizontal 
well shall be allocated to each unit penetrated by the well 
in the same proportion as the perforated length of the 
lateral in each such unit bears to the total length of the 
perforated lateral as determined by an “as drilled’ survey 
performed after the well has been drilled and completed.
7. To consider such other matters as may be pertinent. 
The Haynesville Zone, Reservoir A was defined in Order 
No. 361-L, effective July 29, 2008. A plat is available for 
inspection in the Office of Conservation in Baton Rouge 
and Shreveport, Louisiana.
http://dnr.louisiana.gov/conshearings All parties hav-
ing interest therein shall take notice thereof.

BY ORDER OF:
 MONIQUE M. EDWARDS

COMMISSIONER OF CONSERVATION 
Baton Rouge, LA 11/29/23;12/5/23 S lckIN ACCOR-

DANCE WITH THE AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES 
ACT, IF YOU NEED ASSISTANCE AT THE HEARING, 

PLEASE CONTACT THE OFFICE OF CONSERVATION-
ENGINEERING DIVISION AT P.O. BOX 94275, BATON 
ROUGE, LA 70804-9275 IN WRITING WITHIN TEN (10) 

WORKING DAYS OF THE HEARING DATE.

December 13, 2023
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January 10, 2024
MINERAL LEASE SALE

NOTICE OF PUBLICATION
OFFICE OF MINERAL RESOURCES

ON BEHALF OF THE STATE MINERAL AND ENERGY BOARD

FOR THE STATE OF LOUISIANA
BATON ROUGE, LOUISIANA 70821

Notice is hereby given in conformity with La. R.S. 30:126 that sealed bids
will be received in the Office of Mineral Resources, LaSalle Office
Building, Baton Rouge, Louisiana (P. O. Box 2827, Baton Rouge, LA 70821)
on or before 12:00 noon on Tuesday, January 9, 2024 for a lease to
explore, drill for and produce oil, gas and any other liquid or gaseous
minerals in solution and produced with oil or gas on the following
described tracts (Tract Nos. 45706 through 45734, inclusive). The sealed
bids shall be opened publicly on Wednesday, January 10, 2024 in the
LaSalle Office Building, 617 N. 3rd Street, Capitol Complex, Baton Rouge,
Louisiana.
The descriptions for the Tract(s) nominated below were, for the purpose of
acquiring a mineral lease(s) or a geophysical agreement(s), provided and
corrected exclusively by the nominating party. Therefore, any mineral
lease(s) or geophysical agreement(s) awarded by the Louisiana State
Mineral and Energy Board (Mineral Board) from the Tract(s) listed below
are without warranty of any kind, either express, implied or statutory
including, but not limited to, title or the implied warranties of
merchantability and fitness for a particular purpose.
An error or omission in the nominating party’s Tract description may
require that a State mineral lease(s) or geophysical agreement(s) be
modified, canceled or abrogated due to the existence of conflicting
leases, operating agreements, private claims or other future obligations
or conditions within the Tract(s) described. In such case, however, the
Mineral Board shall not be obligated to refund any consideration paid by
the Lessee prior to such modification, cancellation or abrogation
including, but not limited to, bonuses, rentals and royalties.
Tract(s) available for leasing may be situated in the Louisiana Coastal
Zone as defined in Act 361 of the Regular Session of the Louisiana
Legislature of 1978 (promulgated as LSA-R. S. 49:213) and may be subject
to the guidelines and regulations promulgated by the Office of Coastal
Management of the Department of Natural Resources for operations in the
Coastal Zone.
Further, in accordance with Article XII, Section 10 of the Constitution of
Louisiana, and notwithstanding any language herein to the contrary, any
mineral rights granted by the Mineral and Energy Board to the tract(s)
advertised herein are subject to the surface usage for integrated coastal
protection or hurricane and flood protection projects promulgated, funded
and effected through the State of Louisiana, the Louisiana Coastal
Protection and Restoration Authority, the Louisiana Office of Coastal
Protection and Restoration, and the Department of Natural Resources and
its divisions, whether solely or in conjunction with other state, local or
federal governmental agencies or with private individuals or entities.
Bids may be for the whole or any particularly described portion of the
land advertised, but no bids will be accepted that does not equal the
Minimum Royalty as set forth in La. R.S. 30:127 or which are not in
compliance with the provisions of Sub-part A of Chapter 2, Title 30 of the
Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950, as amended, other applicable laws or
the guidelines established by the Board through the Office of Mineral
Resources. The Minimum Royalty is not to be construed as an amount
acceptable to the Mineral Board, it being the policy of the Mineral Board
to reject any bid which does not reflect tract potential. The Board
considers bonus, royalty percentage, and also compares royalty granted to
landowners in the area.
Multiple portion bids on the same tract may be accepted by the Mineral
Board, even though they overlap. In the case of overlapping portion bids
on the same tract, each of which is otherwise acceptable to the State, the
Mineral Board has the sole discretion, to determine which one of the
multiple bids on the same tract is most advantageous and in the best
interest of the State. The Mineral Board may base it decision on factors
such as but not limited to the royalty, per acre cash payment, bonus, any
additional consideration. The selected bid, (referred to as “Bid A”), will
be given priority in having a lease issued. The Mineral Board will also
indicate the acceptability of other portion bids on the same tract, if
any, in the order of their acceptance (referred to respectively as “Bid
B”, “Bid C”, etc.). Once the plat of “Bid A” ‘s portion has been rendered
as accurately as possible, “Bid B” will be contacted and given an option
to take a lease on the remaining portion of his portion bid acreage not
overlapping “Bid A” ‘s bid portion, at “Bid B’ ‘s per acre bid price (both
as to bonus and rental); and thereafter, each successive bidder whose bid
is otherwise acceptable will be given the option to take a lease on
whatever portion remains of his portion bid acreage at his respective per
acre bid price, less and except any prior portion bid acreage on which the
successful bidder has opted to take a lease.
The Mineral and Energy Board does not obligate itself to accept any bid,
and that acceptance is at the sole discretion of the Mineral Board which
reserves the right to reject any and all bids or to grant a lease on any
portion of the tract advertised and to withdraw the remainder of the
tract.
RAdditional requirements to be included in all sealed bids submitted to
the Office of Mineral Resources and additional tract information
associated with each tract advertised can be found at the Office of
Mineral Resources website titled “Notice of Publication” located at:
http://www.dnr.louisiana.gov/index.cfm/page/1599.
It is the bidders’ responsibility to properly complete the bid package
pursuant to the requirements stated in both the public notice and the
Notice of Publication.
The rights to geothermal resources, free sulphur, potash, lignite, salt
and other solid minerals are to be excluded from any oil or gas mineral
lease and any bid purporting to include those rights will be disregarded
as to the extent of those rights only.
If you require accommodations due to a disability in order to attend or
participate in a meeting, please notify the Office of Mineral Resources at
P.O. Box 2827, Baton Rouge, LA 70821-2827 or 225-342-4615 at least two (2)
working days before the meeting date.
efer to the “Notice of Publication” for the general guidelines, minimum
requirements, and additional notes associated with each tract advertised.
The “Notice of Publication” can be found at:
http://www.dnr.louisiana.gov/index.cfm/page/1454.
The rights to geothermal resources, free sulphur, potash, lignite, salt
and other solid minerals are to be excluded from any oil or gas mineral
lease and any bid purporting to include those rights will be disregarded
as to the extent of those rights only.
If you require accommodations due to a disability in order to attend or
participate in a meeting, please notify the Office of Mineral Resources at
P.O. Box 2827, Baton Rouge, LA 70821-2827 or 225-342-4615 at least two (2)
working days before the meeting date.
INLAND TRACTS (Tract Nos. 45706 through 45730 inclusive, herein cannot
specify a lease primary term exceeding three (3) years).
TRACT 45707 - Bossier and Caddo Parishes, Louisiana
All of the lands now or formerly constituting the beds and bottoms of all
water bodies of every nature and description as to which title is vested
in the State of Louisiana, together with all islands arising therein and
other lands formed by accretion or by reliction, where allowed by law,
excepting tax adjudicated lands, and not presently under mineral lease on
January 10, 2024, situated in Bossier and Caddo Parishes, Louisiana, and
more particularly described as follows: Beginning at a point having
Coordinates of X = 1,679,992.88 and Y = 603,917.81; thence Westerly
approximately 2,649 feet to the Northeast corner of State Lease No. 19483
and the Southeast corner of State Lease No. 6856, as amended; thence
Northerly approximately 2,774 feet along the East boundary of said State
Lease No. 6856, as amended, to a point on the South boundary of State
Lease No. 5849; thence Easterly approximately 2,474 feet and Northerly
approximately 2,465 feet along the boundaries of said State Lease No. 5849
to a point; thence Easterly approximately 1,246 feet to the most westerly
Southwest corner of State Lease No. 20445 having Coordinates of X =
1,681,099.25 Y = 609,239.99; thence along the boundary of said State Lease
No. 20445, as amended, the following: South 89 degrees 45 minutes 03
seconds East 1,531.48 feet to a point having Coordinates of X =
1,682,630.72 and Y = 609,233.33, South 00 degrees 07 minutes 36 seconds
East 5,287.92 feet to a point having Coordinates of X = 1,682,642.42 and Y
= 603,945.42, and Southerly approximately 58 feet to a point being its
most southern Southwest corner; thence Westerly approximately 2,650 feet
to the point of beginning, containing approximately 2 acres.
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------ Cotton Valley ------
Alexander IV, Charlie, 

470 McArthur Lp
Alexander Jr, Charlie, 470 

McArthur Lp
Alexander, Javeon Jaca-

rle, 153 Nora Ave
Aragon, Elijah Andrew, 

134 McClanahan Dr
Baker, Heather Lynn, 454 

Marathon Rd
Beacham-Webb, Bre-

anna, 130 Beacham Dr
Bissell, Dorothy Marie, 

268 Resident St
Bray, Reid Hollis, 23434 

Hwy 371
Broussard, Taylor Aaron, 

162 Dennis Lp
Brown, Lee Carter, 155 

Curtis St
Carpenter, Juanita Lou-

ise, 170 Davis St
Charles, Andrea Marie, 

317 McArthur Lp
Council, Duante Raynard, 

159 Abner St
Cox, Jeffery Duane, 116 

Main St
Crittenden, Jannen Marie, 
283 Magnolia Camp Rd
Davis, Tommy W, 343 

Adkins Rd
Dewberry, Rondell Ty-
rone, 22001 Hwy 371

Gillespie, Alicia Ivy, 198 
Earl St

Harper, Antwain R, 229 
Greenard St

Hawkins, Shontralica 
Shyonne, 155 Abner St
Holloway, Kristin Dawn 

Johnson, 20928 Hwy 371
Jiles, Willie, 192 Green-

ard St
Johnson Jr, James G, 
445 Cotton Valley Ave

Jordan, Shauntaya, 822 
Marathon Rd

McCuen, Eric Steven, 
1218 Old Hwy 7

McKinney, Jerrica 
Shanell, 21236 Hwy 371 

#14
Miller, Christopher Walter, 

429 McArthur Lp
Miller, Sarah Louise, 429 

McArthur Lp
Phillips, Jerrod, 108 

Lewis Ave
Pierce, Cassandra L, 122 

Merritt Rd
Ratcliff, Marla Cox, 283 

Arnold Well Rd
Robbins, Caitlyn Chey-
enne, 145 College St
Standokes, Coesha 

White, 480 Bill Lockey Rd
Strieff, Cynthia L, 233 

Lucy St
Striplin, Jason Lamar, 
168 McClanahan Dr

Striplin, Shannon Holden, 
168 McClanahan Dr

Sublett, Jessica Ann, 234 
Sikes Ferry Rd

Taylor, James Curtis, 140 
Abner St

Thomas, Myrna Jackson, 
6214 Hwy 160

Thompson, Jeffery Wade, 
970 Adkins Rd

Vaughan, Ross Odell, 
283 Magnolia Camp Rd

------ Cullen ------
Alexander, Shakisha 

Lashell, 2100 Barrett St 
#2122

Baird, Steven Dewayne, 
2 N Collins St #239

Bankhead, Tashira, 227 
Giles St

Banks, Ashley Monique, 2 
N Collins St #204
Bradford, Tommy 

Dewayne, 605 Henrietta 
White Blvd

Bradley, Willie, 115 Ab-
bott Cir

Brown, Antwayneshia Le-
shay, 2239 Reynolds St

Bruton, Leemason Deon-
drey, 2233 Reynolds St

Cain, Quasavonna T, 995 
East Rd #10

Cain, Sammie, 310 
Cobb St

Carroll, Lindsey Marie, 
703 East Rd

Casey, Iesha Nicole, 202 
N Lemon St

Castleman, Yolanda 
Patrice, 216 East Rd

Clayton, Elizabeth Anne, 
2100 Barrett St #2144

Coleman, Kenneth Ray, 
115 Bradley St

Coleman, Sandra Faye, 
1205 Henrietta White 

Blvd
Cooper, Berta Mae, 211 

East Rd
Cooper, Kendrick Lamar, 

211 East Rd
Cooper, Lonnetta Ran-
som, 1202 1/2 Henrietta 

White Blvd
Davis, Robert De Quann, 

2132 Barrett St
Dickens, Luquece Sony-

ette, 995 East Rd #5
Drew, Tydarrion Darrelle, 

101 S Collins St
Eason, Ian Rashad, 995 

East Rd #4
Ford, Erica Rena, 104 

Newsom St
Foster, Addie Burks, 107 

S Collins St
Green Sr, Bernard, 110 

Green St
Green, Alice, 105 Rhone 

St
Harris, Angela Denise, 

201 Williams St
Hawthorne, Bobbie Ray, 

212 Sumlin St
Hawthorne, Toby Ella, 

202 N Lemon St
Henderson, Babette Gail, 

202 N Lemon St
Hicks, Kelsie Marie, 104 

Woods St
Holmes, Monica Stanley, 

1409 Henrietta White 
Blvd

Jones Beasley, Damian 
Rashad, 108 Washington 

St
Jones, Robbin Selena, 
2100 Barrett St #2131

Lane, Katrina Latrice, 113 
Murphy St

Leal, Precious A, 2263 
Reynolds St

Lincoln, Bobby Joe, 2 N 
Collins St #229

Mack, Louis James, 2 N 
Collins St #238

Manning, Bertha Mae, 
314 Orr St

Manning, Tevin, 2113 
Barrett St #2113

McCracken, Anitria 
Latrice Raishon, 2132 

Barrett St
McDaniel, Antonius Mar-

tez, 213 N Lemon St
Miller, Marlynda Yvdncus, 

204 N Lemon St
Mims, Dominick Marvalle, 

2100 Barrett St
Murray, Tarrique Michael, 

128 Payne St
Myers, David R, 113 S 

Collins St
Myers, Natashia Katrese, 

113 S Collins St
Oliver, Barbara Brooks, 

402 Lee St
Oliver, Kevina, 2113 Bar-

rett St #2113
Owens, Evondra Brianne, 

2223 Reynolds St
Pickings, Dana Lynn, 104 

S Morris St
Poindexter, Donald Ray, 

418 Lee St
Ray, Raymond Darrell, 

224 Jenkins St
Rhone, Isaac L, 1209 
Henrietta White Blvd

Riser, Eddie Washington, 
121 Reeves St

Sanders, Michelle Marie, 
2120 Barrett St

Sanders, Rochelle Delme-
tria, 114 Bradley St
Sanders, Shabreca 

Renea, 1301 Henrietta 
White Blvd

Smith, Demichael Damon-
treal, 106 S Morris St

Strong, Nina Jean, 2 N 
Collins St #214

Tealer, Champagin Lor-
raine, 2263 Reynolds St

Thompson, Andra K, 2252 
Reynolds St

Thompson, Latasha 
Shanta, 2252 Reynolds St

Tyson, Chelsy Janene, 
229 East Rd

Villo, Clintonnisha 
Leonora, 1301 Henrietta 

White Blvd
West, Charcandrick 

Deon'te, 1402 Henrietta 
White Blvd

White, Destinie Davaneak, 
2133 Barrett St

Williams, Cassandra 
McDaniel, 103 Cobb St
Wilson, Artavious, 212 

Sumlin St
Woodard, Johnny Lee, 

301 Orr St
------ Doyline ------

Anderson, Charles William 
Gee, 327 Greentree St
Anderson, Shamir Toc-
carro, 1264 Shiloh Rd

Bailey, Angela Pollard, 118 
Pine Dr

Bankston, Allen Christo-
pher, 302 Stable Dr

Barmore, Mikala Rose, 
7327 Hwy 527

Bates, Larry Edward, 2832 
Spurgin Rd

Bernard, Tonya Eubanks, 
302 Stable Dr

Billups, Justin Slade, 106 
Whites Trl

Bledsoe, Franky A, 443 S 
Morgan St

Bledsoe, Sandra Lynn, 
475 Watson St

Bolt, Mary E, 114 N 
Parke Dr

Bowman, Timothy, 237 
Roach Rd

Branch, Damon Earl, 524 
Lakeview Dr

Braumiller, Pepper Dayne, 
801 College St

Brewer, Aimee McCleskey, 
165 Green Park Rd #5

Brown, Genette Miles, 106 
Smith Trl

Brown, Jamica Regina, 
181 Pilgrims Rest Rd

Bryant, Christie M, 228 
Hanson Dr

Bryant, Joshua David, 228 
Hanson Dr

Cage, Justin Nathaniel, 
1064 College St

Carter, Lou Allen, 2938 
Hwy 163

Clouston, Austin Matthew, 
408 Oak Dr

Coates, Madison, 152 Roy 
Hale Dr

Cobb, Jonathan Lee, 159 
Hickory Hollow Rd

Coffey, Miranda Rose, 
1104 Foreman Rd

Coulter, Billy Ray, 7327 
Hwy 527

Coulter, Darnell Thelma, 
7327 Hwy 527

Deleon Jr, Jessie, 1031 
College St

Devereaux, Dannie, 119 
Roosevelt Watson Rd

Devereaux, Tiffany Dawny-
ette, 170 Watson St

Disotell, Keri Dawn, 103 
Willis St

Doss, Christopher Michael, 
654 Pilgrims Rest Rd

Dowling, Shawn Matthew, 
102 Callahan Cir

Everett, Misty D, 118 
Horseshoe Bridge Rd

Flores, Juan, 245 Green-
tree St

Fuller, Elizabeth Rose, 678 
Fuller St

Gaynor, Jed Dylan, 2667 
Dement Rd

Gonzales, Austin John, 
2475 Dement Rd

Gonzales, Sarah Louise, 
2475 Dement Rd

Graham, Natalie Nicole, 
155 Perch St

Hamilton, Shawn Allen, 
6421 Hwy 527

Harris, Luler Ware, 150 
Ware Ln

Hatfield, Bobby Fay, 244 
Johnson St

Henderson, Lance Dillon, 
121 Mathes Rd

Hinton, Brenda Newman, 
443 Strong St

Holland, Donna Carol, 273 
Bass St

Holland, Richard Lynn, 
273 Bass St

Hooper, Meghann Burson, 
348 Hanson Dr

Hunter, Katelyn Marie, 151 
Clark Bayou Dr

Jackson Jr, Joseph, 485 
Carter Rd

Jennings, Cortney Rae, 
1214 Hwy 163

Johnson, Stafford Taylor, 
1475 Johnson Rd

Jones, Bryan Keith, 102 N 
Parke Dr

Jones, Deangelo Deundre, 
2589 Dement Rd

Joplin, Tonya Watson, 995 
Carter Rd

Knowles, James Michael, 
181 Pine Cir

Lancaster, Jeffery Dean, 
1115 Johnson Rd

Langford, Jessica Danielle, 
180 Langford Rd

Laroux, Matthew Kyle, 323 
Clark Cir

Lee, Brittney Ann, 311 
Johnson St

Levasseur, April Lynn, 
6421 Hwy 527

Liles, Kristine Whitmore, 
329 Johnson St

Lockett, Daijohni Antoi-
nette, 871 Shiloh Rd

Maddox, Nancy Roberts, 
394 Audleman Rd

Mahaffey, Pamela Boswell, 
261 Main St

Mangham, Michael G, 125 
Dowden Rd

McCulloch III, William Ben-
jamim, 2386 Dement Rd
McGuire, Jessica Jose-
phine, 148 Gas Plant Rd
Meador, Heather Lynn, 

182 Buckeye Rd
Mercer, Shelee D, 811 

Pilgrims Rest Rd
Meyers, Justin Barry, 116 

Gas Plant Rd
Miller, Carol Bledsoe, 443 

S Morgan St
Miller, Darryl, 1135 Shiloh 

Rd
Morris, John Carl, 117 

Craig Ln
Moseley, Riley Danielle, 

450 Greentree St
Murray, Blane Scott, 152 

Roy Hale Dr
Packard, Hannah Jean, 

103 Susan Ln
Palmer, Zachary John, 151 

Horseshoe Loop
Patton, Jesse C, 6168 

Hwy 527
Patton, Krista Louise, 6168 

Hwy 527
Pickett, Doss, 7766 Hwy 

527
Pickett, Elizabeth Raylynn, 

7810 Hwy 527
Poe, James Philip, 104 

Stiles Trl
Rabb Jr, Johnny Edward, 

150 Pilgrims Rest Rd
Rhodes, Rachel Anne, 106 

N Parke Dr
Rodgers, Meshea Crum, 

1115 Johnson Rd
Rumbaugh, Robert The-

dore, 540 Hanson Dr
Rutherford, Dorenda An-

nette, 135 Poverty Point
Sepulvado, Emily Su-
zanne, 140 Falcon Lp

Seymour, Barbara May, 
109 Spencer Ln

Shaw, Rodney Sammy, 
124 N Parke Dr

Stephens, Clay Alan, 160 
Pine Cir

Stroud, Lori Ann, 116 Gas 
Plant Rd

Stuart, Denelle, 177 
Hickory Hollow Rd

Swain, Richard Kyle, 5243 
Boothville Rd

Tanner, Dianna Gail, 387 
Lakeview Dr

Taylor, Mary M, 547 Horse-
shoe Loop

Thompson Jr, William 
Ernest, 520 Pilgrims 

Rest Rd
Thompson, Pamela Lewis, 

520 Pilgrims Rest Rd
Thompson, Ragen Eliza-
beth, 1104 Foreman Rd

Thompson, Rhonda Lynne 
Vaughan, 147 Hickory 

Hollow Rd
Triplet, Michelle Marie, 580 

Horseshoe Loop
Tuggle, Billy Ancil, 600 

Hanson Dr
Vaughan, Keri Logan, 879 

College St
Wade, Margaret Marrow, 

299 Audleman Rd
Ward Jr, Sammie Lee, 600 

McDowell St
Ward, Ginger Sue, 1111 

Foreman Rd
Ware, Kevin Darnell, 160 

Ware Ln
Weaver, Carly Lynn, 7766 

Hwy 527
Webb Jr, John Reed, 155 

Yates Ln
Williams, Felisha, 314 

Audleman Rd
Womack, Nathaniel, 382 

College St
Woodall, James Nicholas, 

401 S Morgan St
Woodall, Ricky Lynn, 311 

Dogwood Dr
Woodall, Tammy Joy, 311 

Dogwood Dr
Wren, Margaret Allen, 133 

Guttery Kelly Rd
Wright, Vickie Goss, 153 

Guttery Kelly Rd
Young, Nicole L, 193 

Alexander Rd
------ Dubberly ------

Berry, Patrick Lee, 541 
Shadows Ln

Coile, Toby Lee, 530 
Peachtree Rd

Davidson, Jared Lane, 
1299 Peachtree Rd

Dixon III, John D, 500 
Central School Rd

Fielding, Erintina Latrice, 
4277 Hwy 531

Foster, Durrander Evella, 
139 Oscar Moore Rd

Foster, Julia Lincoln, 1000 
Peachtree Rd

Garcia, Jennifer, 811 Jack 
Martin Rd

Haymon, Dustin Ray, 251 
Walraven Rd

Henry, Kati Lynn Smith, 
115 J D Ln

Jellum, James Keith, 1769 
Harveys Barber Shop Rd

Kidd, Kathryn Renee, 1274 
Harveys Barber Shop Rd
Kilgore, Carmen Denise, 

1153 Catalpa Ln
Lindsey, Eva Mae, 138 

Mims Grocery Rd
Maddox, Naomie Michelle, 

1961 Stuckey Rd
Mangrum, Misty Marie, 

673 Brushwood Dr
Marks, Jessica Lynn, 251 

Walraven Rd
Mitchell, Taquilla Quan-
tinta, 605 Stuckey Rd

Moore, Kenneth Harold, 
251 Oscar Moore Rd

Morgan, Larry, 497 Central 
School Rd

Moss Jr, Samuel Lynn, 
1156 Catalpa Ln

Moss, Tabitha Ann, 1156 
Catalpa Ln

Msangi, Julie S, 3419 
Hwy 531

Murphy, Curtis L, 124 
Sawmill Rd

Roberts, Lisa Holomon, 
1149 Harveys Barber 

Shop Rd
Shaw, Kendall Gurgainers, 

757 Stuckey Rd
Shaw, Thomas Edward, 

1003 Peachtree Rd
Shirley, Frank Mitchell, 266 

Garrett Dr
Smith, Haley Nicole, 1000 

Peachtree Rd
Smith, Thomas Ray Fur-

low, 1157 Catalpa Ln
Stephens, Michael Dan-
gelo, 524 Mims Grocery 

Rd
Strickland, Jacob Allan, 

1887 Hwy 532
Striplin, Phillip Kyle, 1600 

Brushwood Dr
Thornton, Atravion D, 1329 

Peachtree Rd
Tomlinson, Latha Nanette, 
190 Holomon Cemetery 

Rd
Vance, Martha Marie, 3149 

Hwy 531
Wallace, Kenneth Ray, 

4905 Hwy 531
Watts, Erin Reeves, 280 
Holomon Cemetery Rd

Wells, Sarah White, 1552 
Harveys Barber Shop Rd

West, Christina Marie, 431 
Shadows Ln

------ Haughton ------
Hudson Jr, Jackson Je-
thro, 4903 Camp Joy Rd
Smith, Sondra Dee, 4405 

Camp Joy Rd
------ Heflin ------

Acosta, Robert James, 
2386 Franklin Rd

Austin, Kimberly Dawson, 
6949 Hwy 531

Bates, Alexis Paige, 1450 
Franklin Rd

Bates, Jessica Davis, 322 
N Main St

Bennett, Mabel Shaw, 774 
N Main St

Boyd, Kasey Nicole, 254 
S Main St

Branton, Daniell Lee, 116 
Moss Point Lp

Brown Jr, Lenward, 1061 
Tillman Church Rd

Brown, Robin Jeanette, 
240 Tillman Church Rd

Brown, Thomas Ray, 6398 
Hwy 531

Burns, Lawrence Ray, 
1111 Tillman Church Rd

Cage, Christian Alexander, 
214 Canal St

Carey, Jamall Keith, 6420 
Hwy 531

Cook, Dustin Dean, 201 
Woodmill Rd

Cowart, Trevor Dalton, 
1914 Franklin Rd

Cozort, Marianne Mer-
edith, 1927 Franklin Rd

Deamon, Heather Simone, 
1061 Tillman Church Rd
Fife, Lance Murdock, 582 

Moss Point Rd
Fontenot, Lindsey, 1100 

Franklin Rd
Fox, David Earl, 213 

Canal St
Frazier, Ronita Montgom-
ery, 204 Tillman Church 

Rd
Frye, Tracy Allen, 350 N 

Main St
Gros, Kristopher Allen, 400 

Moss Point Rd
Gros, Mary Shea, 400 

Moss Point Rd
Harris, Gary Wayne, 5410 

Hwy 371
Hearnsberger, John Gar-

rett, 1450 Franklin Rd
Hill, Danedda Roberson, 

6520 Hwy 531
Hinds, Clay Sylvester, 700 

Bistineau Line Rd
Huey, Verlanda Charles, 

132 Burson Lp
Huggs, Macy Nicole, 3969 

Franklin Rd
Humphrey, Belinda M, 164 

Canal St
Kimmons, Laticia Lynnetta, 

132 Kennon Pit Rd
Lazarus, Jason Daniel, 

554 Moss Point Rd
Lee, Zachary Lewis, 633 

Hwy 792
Martin, Aaron Bryant, 322 

Canal St
Mccoy, Heather, 3528 

Franklin Rd
Moss, Austin Blake, 2382 

Franklin Rd
Nash, Jami Lee, 180 

Womack Rd
Nelson, Veronica Denise, 

240 Kennon Pit Rd
Norton, Timal Lashard 
Antonio, 6437 Hwy 531

Otte, Esteban Jacinto, 350 
Bossier St

Peters, Brenda Kay, 100 
Hale St

Peters, Clyde Louis, 100 
Hale St

Rabb, Lakeitta Michelle, 
564 Tillman Church Rd

Rhone, Jacobi Rashard, 
828 Mason Felts Rd

Richardson, Tayler Jona, 
1813 Burson Rd

Robinette, Susan Harper, 
5948 Hwy 371

Robinson Sr, Kevin Den-
nis, 581 Buttonwood Rd

Robinson, Thomas 
Braeden, 517 Martha 

Woods Rd
Tellis, Jerrel Denzell, 150 

Leroy Tillman Rd
Tellis, Tamercy Yanae, 

5109 Hwy 371
Tellis, Tynnia Lorraine, 514 

Tillman Church Rd
Trent, Simico Cook, 5574 

Hwy 371
Wafer, Shauni Elizabeth, 

133 Memorial Park Dr
Walker, Jason Mattthew, 

6059 Hwy 371
Wallace, Armon Japaul, 

844 Mason Felts Rd
Wallace, Carrie Joanna, 
134 Tillman Church Rd
Webb, Vickie Ann, 5234 

Hwy 371
White, Ashandric Yornise, 

190 Leroy Tillman Rd
Wiltcher III, Bobby Joseph, 

112 Webster St
Wiltcher, Lori Ann, 476 Art 

Camp Rd
------ Minden ------

Abbott, Shenekia Yvette, 
102 Berry Dr

Abner, Derek Lashun, 201 
Berry Dr

Acker, Jeffery Lee, 1401 
Lewisville Rd #133

Acker, Michele Annette, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #133

Aiken, Anwar R, 239 
Country Pines Dr

Alexander, Deshun 
Denoah, 232 Walter 

Lyons Rd
Alford, Patsy Willis, 621 

Pine St
Allen Jr, Rodney Errol, 605 

Carolina St
Allen Jr, Rodney Joe, 8084 

Dorcheat Rd
Allen, Shelbie Michelle, 

622 Oak Knoll St
Allen, Tanyua Denise, 

8084 Dorcheat Rd
Allen, Yvonne Johnson, 

310 Myers St
Ambrose, Tiernan Colleen, 

512 McIntyre St
Anders, Denita Latisha, 

311 Martin Cir
Anderson, Jonathan Ja-
mal, 200 Louisiana Blvd
Arender, Rachel McKen-
sie, 103 Emerald Dr #223
Arrington, Audrey Chas-

sity, 610 Marion St
Arrington, Jadon Shemar, 

511 Goodwill St
Ashley, Erial, 105 Ken-

nedy Ln
Ashton, Sean Zachary, 

935 Sibley Rd
Ashton, Timothy Sean, 935 

Sibley Rd
Austin, Janice Boyd, 192 

Gryder Rd
Autin, Dylan Michael, 201 

Louisiana Blvd
Avant, David Alan, 126 

White Ln
Averitt, Haleigh Joann, 

2744 Dogwood Trl
Bailey, John Cole, 107 

Seminary Ln
Bailey, Jordan Elizabeth, 

1054 Frontage Rd
Bailey, Passionate Jernika, 

716 East St
Bailey, Tommarz Jamez, 

405 S Abney St
Ball, Georgia Mangrum, 

756 Evergreen School Rd
Ballesterol, Hilario B, 112 

2nd St
Ballesterol, Nenita Macato, 

112 2nd St
Banks, Maggie, 219 Martin 

Luther King Dr
Barbee, James Adam, 220 

Northwood Dr
Barbee, Katy Lynn, 220 

Northwood Dr
Barnard, Juston Allen, 438 

Freight Entrance Rd
Barnes, Shelbi Lynn, 103 

Emerald Dr #116
Barnett, Benjamin Paul, 

17265 Hwy 79
Barrier, Virginia Dobbs, 

108 Colin P Kelly Dr
Barton, Daniel Dewaine, 

810 Cline St
Beale, Christopher An-

thony, 209 S Roosevelt Dr
Bearden, Dina Moss, 329 

Newt Brown Rd
Beasley, Byron P, 829 

Fincher Rd
Beavers, Aaliyah 

Sha'michael, 301 E 
Todd St

Beck, Ashley Milam, 1252 
Hwy 159

Belford, Alan Robert, 250 
Chris Dr

Bell, Deshunda R, 412 
Goodwill St

Bennett, Abrianna T, 126 
Bailey St

Benton, Charlotte Cole-
man, 919 Fulton St

Benton, Samuel Lee, 314 
Gilbert St

Berdan Jr, Troy Barrett, 
1731 Dorcheat Rd

Berdan, Ashley Colleen, 
1731 Dorcheat Rd

Berry, Timothy Wayne, 110 
Mouser Ln

Beshea, Ashley, 802 
Elm St

Billups, Magan Alexis, 
1343 Dorcheat Rd

Bird, Shane Lee, 1459 
Middle Rd

Birdsong, Phillip Allan, 200 
Berry Dr

Bissell, Remington 
Burford, 1401 Lewisville 

Rd #123
Black, Cortney E, 709 

Drew Ln
Black, Joseph Samuel, 

709 Drew Ln
Blanton, Christian Cum-
mings, 704 McMullen St
Blood, Wendy Day, 1401 

E Todd St
Bollinger, Damian Ferris, 

1105 Beech St
Booth, Amber, 104 Mar-

shall St
Boston, Tioka B, 206 S 

Randall St
Boyd, Hazel S, 638 Hwy 

518
Brackin, Rachael Rhian-

non, 484 Old Arcadia Rd
Bradford, Anthony, 608 

Bradford St
Bradford, Natasha Elaine, 

16670 Hwy 80
Bradford, Roderick Ber-
nard, 515 Goodwill St

Bradley, Linda Harper, 824 
Fincher Rd

Bradley, Whitney Hall, 267 
S Tanglewood Dr

Brandon, Hagan Lee, 354 
Frenchie Dulany Rd

Bray, Amanda Rose, 590 
Hwy 518

Brewer Jr, Tommy Ken-
neth, 502 McArthur Dr

Bridges, Eugenia McBride, 
1108 Madison Ave

Brim, Theresa, 917 Homer 
Rd

Brooks, Lakeshia Jea-
nette, 163 Jernigan Ln
Browder, Kesha, 223 

Roy St
Brown, Grantia, 103 

Squire St
Brown, James R, 155 

Clearmeadow Rd
Brown, Keivondric 

Dshaun, 106 Hackett Dr
Brown, Misty Smith, 710 

Gladney St
Brown, Ontravienne 

Dejuan, 532 Babb Cir
Bruner, Richard Lee, 918 

Park Hwy
Buchanan, Sequoyah 
Lewis, 512 Walnut St

Burns, William Jamal, 109 
Knight St

Calhoun, Hannah Marie, 
293 Beech Springs Rd

Calloway, Yolanda Yvette, 
110 Goode Ave

Carathers, David Jay, 122 
Shreve Dr

Carlton, Leslie Michele, 
107 Fuller St

Carr, Bryan Mikale, 1401 
Lewisville Rd #111

Carr, Faith Kelly, 208 
Pearl St

Carrell, James Howard, 
601 Buddy Brown Rd

Carrigan, James Bradley, 
204 East And West St

Carroll, Angela Clair, 118 
Country Ln

Carter, Anisha D, 306 Bf 
Martin Dr

Carter, Latonya Michelle, 
611 Stone St

Carter, Railyn Avon, 721 
Watterman St

Carter, Thomas Clayton, 
1508 Holley St

Carter, Xavier Marquiser, 
100 Washington St

Cary, Derravia Devon, 721 
Watterman St

Cason, Cheyenne Grace, 
2702 Goodwill Rd

Castro, Kyle Eulis, 101 
Beck St

Cernigliaro, Courtney 
Michelle, 31 McArthur St
Chandler, Gregory Todd, 

1303 Mark Dr
Chatman, Nicholas De-

mond, 1011 West St
Cheatham, James Antho-
ny, 411 Germantown Rd

Choate, Michael Brandon 
Corde, 367 Gifford Hill Rd
Clark, Cynthia Walker, 818 

Methodist Camp Rd
Clark, Nicleous, 419 Park 

Ave
Cloman, Firley Gable, 613 

Watts Cir
Coile, Jodie Leanne, 190 

Sugar Creek Lp
Coker, Bessie M, 1000 

Center St
Coker, Elizabeth Dianne, 

350 Garland Rd
Cole, Charlene A, 902 

Tillman Dr
Cole, Kerry Armand, 716 

Buck St
Cole, Tiffany Diane, 1201 

Lewisville Rd
Cole, Tyler Markia, 904 

Frontage Rd
Coleman, Antonio Bernard, 

1037 Tillman Dr
Coleman, Lenard Lee, 128 

Carver Dr
Coleman, Linda Faye, 117 

Eisenhower Dr
Coleman, Shonesty 

Shakel, 201 Miller St #48
Colin, Belen, 124 Bryant 

Rd
Collier, Sarah Elizabeth, 

100 Meadowbrook Dr
Combs, Dorothy Marie, 

1401 Lewisville Rd #133
Combs, John Tyler, 113 

Washington St
Combs, Johnniemarie 

Alexandria, 712 Horton St
Combs, Linda Sue, 602 

Stone St
Combs, Monnisha Antinei-

sha, 816 Carolina St
Cook, Holly Camille, 412 

Webb Ct
Cook, Robert Andrew, 720 

West St
Cooper, Jimmy Caroll, 

1022 Tillman Dr
Cooper, Margret Penny, 

1022 Tillman Dr
Corley, Cody Wayne, 904 

Madison Ave
Corley-Castleberry, Emily 
Danielle, 706 Tillman Dr

Corrente, Devin Gage, 302 
Calvin Liner Rd

Corrente, Madilane Noel, 
512 Calvin Liner Rd

Cotton, Sandra Boyd, 634 
Hwy 518

Covington, Peter Collin, 
906 Tillman Dr

Craig Jr, Jayce Stewart, 
1105 Beech St

Craig Jr, John Wayne, 
4508 Dorcheat Rd

Crandall, Demi Lane, 802 
Drew Ln

Crawford, Chandrika 
Elana, 410 S Gum St
Crehan, Shelby Lynn, 

8101 Dorcheat Rd
Crittenden, Sarah, 41 

Front St #ST
Crow, Charles Ray, 914 

Devereaux St
Curry, Amanda Virginia, 

101 Colin P Kelly Dr
Dale, Alexis Kiyola, 824 

Carolina St #21
Dantes, Tonya Brewer, 437 

Hatten Roberts Rd
Davis, George Vanderrick, 

216 Brushwood Acres
Davis, Jessa Lott, 307 

Ellis Dr
Davis, Linda A, 612 

Chestnut St
Davis, Russell Lynn, 116 

Matthew Stevens Ln
Davis, Vicky Jo, 1746 

Dorcheat Rd
Davis, William Charles, 73 

Shell St
Dawson, Jennifer, 595 

Pisgah Rd
Dean, Chasity Diann, 803 

Center St
Delaney, William Rashad, 

113 Squire St
Deloach, Brenda J, 386 

Sugar Creek Lp
Denato, Sheri Ann, 623 

Oak Knoll St
Dial, Lauren Edana, 100 

Meadowbrook Dr
Dick, Ryan Glenn, 17291 

Hwy 79
Dillard, Bristol R, 517 

Constable St
Dillon, Colton Dean, 380 

Chris Dr
Dixon, Robin Rene, 202 

Sandy Rd
Dooly, Linda Sue, 1777 

Blue Run Rd
Douglas, Barry Vonderick, 

109 Hackett Dr
Douglas, James Little, 109 

Seminary Ln
Douglas, Miriam Elena, 

545 Sommersby Dr

Dubose, Joseph Wayne, 
514 Martin Luther King Dr

Dubose, Kenneth Lee, 
1001 East St

Duke, Jennifer Alewyne, 
115 Berry Dr

Dye, Linda G, 103 Emer-
ald Dr #207

Eason, Courtney Dee, 417 
Patrick St

Eason, Jaericca Shardae, 
1010 Watterman St

Eason, Jessica Elgineka, 
614 Constable St
Eason, Raideisha 

Unashae Shunteall, 131 
Country Ln

Edge, Emily Edwards, 
2254 Dorcheat Rd

Edmiston, Ami Nicole, 117 
Chandler Cir

Edwards, Brittany Shaiko-
ria, 802 Hillside Ln

Edwards, Crystal, 1403 
Lincoln Ave

Edwards, Stephens 
Cordell, 101 Squire St

Edwards, Takemiya 
Niselle, 2374 Hwy 532
Elkins, Hilary, 242 W 

Union St
Elkins, Kita Diane, 500 

Sunset Ln
Ellison, John Henry, 413 

East St
Elshout, Dana Eldridge, 

168 Guy Miller Rd
Emerson, Chiketha Moore, 

412 Goode Ave
Erving, Nahkeem Jamaral, 

414 Patrick St
Eubanks, Lakara Monique, 

6345 Dorcheat Rd
Evans, Danny Ray, 407 

Clerk St
Evans, Kaitlyn Janay, 407 

Clerk St
Evans, Tiffany Nicole, 900 

Bayou Ave #244
Everest, Jessica Lea, 901 

Elmo Burton Lp
Ewing, Michael Kevin, 212 

W J Beck Rd
Farley, Sharon G, 101 

Country Pines Dr
Feaster, David W, 2444 

Doc Steed Rd
Feaster, Mary, 2444 Doc 

Steed Rd
Feaster, Samuel, 2444 

Doc Steed Rd
Ferrell, Debra Ann, 617 

Durwood Dr
Ferrell, Edward Christo-

pher, 1316 Hwy 518
Ferrell, Shavenskie 

Demond, 115 Fort St
Ferrell, Stephanie Denise 

Gray, 1316 Hwy 518
Fink, Adam E, 1086 

Middle Rd
Fink, Shawna Marie, 1086 

Middle Rd
Fish, Laurie Marie, 705 

Goodwill St
Fisher, Brittany Nicole, 105 

Fuller St
Fisher, Decarro Deuntay, 

922 Center St
Fletcher, Peyton Lee, 184 

Hickory Hills Rd
Flournoy, Amber Nicole, 

137 Flournoy Dr
Flournoy, Marlinda Renee, 

108 Squire St
Floyd, Whitney Hodges, 

187 Hartwell Rd
Ford, Gwendolyn Carol 
Hampton, 209 Bell St

Franklin, Alicia Ann, 1382 
Dorcheat Rd

Franklin, Dequricus Der-
von, 301 S Randall St

Franklin, Jacraius Jay, 301 
S Randall St

Frazier, Jay Patrick, 624 
Elm St

Freelon, Benjamin, 610 
Nella St

Freelon, Nellie G, 610 
Nella St

Freelon, Shania Niquesha, 
610 Nella St

Freelon, Victoria, 106 
Washington St

Freeman, Nicholas Ed-
ward, 227 Dogwood Trl

Fuentes, Tyrell Alterique, 
616 Graveyard St

Fulkroad, Glory Cheyanne, 
14145 Hwy 371

Fuller, Bobbie Blaine, 201 
Kristin Ln

Gandy, Maggie Bingle, 620 
Oak Knoll St

Garms, William Bradley, 
807 Tillman Dr

Gaston, Lataurus Camille, 
1529 Shreveport Rd #22
Gavin, Marvin Richard, 
445 Scooter Roach Rd
Gibson, Amanda Gayle, 

2265 Dogwood Trl
Gilchrist, Aidan Oliver, 200 

Louisiana Blvd
Gill, Laasia D, 631 Mor-

row St
Gilliam, Micah Zephaniah, 

200 Louisiana Blvd
Gilliland, Shannon Marie, 

1009 Almond Cir
Givens Jr, Willie C, 1106 

Constable St
Goddard, Eva Nichols, 

111 3rd St
Golatt, Natarshia Simone, 

410 Weston St
Gomez, Genever Gaviola, 

210 Bridwell St
Gooding, Ebony Lanitta, 

219 Camp St
Goodings, Rayneshia Jac-

quan, 625 Oak Knoll St
Graham, Kaeleigh Eliza-

beth, 1200 Bonnie Ln
Gray, Barbara Jane, 303 E 

Roosevelt Dr
Green, Jaylen Marquel, 

902 Center St
Green, Johnnie Bernard, 

509 Goodwill St
Green, Lisa M, 143 

Country Ln
Green, Natasha Quinta, 

618 Woods St
Green, Oquentisha Las-
antrell, 143 Country Ln
Green, Reginald, 11971 

Hwy 80
Green, Toscany Avanti, 

1409 Webster Ave
Greeson, Regina Eliza-

beth, 100 Azalea Terrace 
Ln #15

Griffith, Preston Reed, 
1304 Elm St

Griffith, Shelby Louise, 
1304 Elm St

Grisby, Breunna Shantell, 
605 Pershing St

Gross, Cynthia L Clark, 
1106 Drew Ln

Gross, Kyla Christina, 
1106 Drew Ln

Gruner, Cheryl A, 103 
Emerald Dr #109

Gurganus, Roger Allen, 
202 Marshall St

Hagewood, Mary Jordan, 
1205 Park Hwy

Halford, Audrey Jones, 111 
Loop Rd

Hamilton, Darion Deonn, 
711 Jackson St

Hamilton, Nia Sharde, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #127

Hammond, Delmar L, 1529 
Shreveport Rd #19

Hampton, Bobby Leanard, 
1355 Sheppard St #309

Hanson, Travis Justin, 915 
Old Arcadia Rd

Harden, James David, 
1312 Evergreen Rd

Hardy, Javelin L, 709 
Rebecca St

Harlan, Ann Mays, 107 
Bay Creek Rd

Harper, Shalonda Leann, 
709 Buck St

Harris, Ronald Wayne, 123 
Chrysler St

Harris, Terica Lachanda, 
609 Leary St

Harrison, Crystal Ashley 
Roy, 255 Timberline Dr
Harrison, Kristi Michele, 

906 Tillman Dr
Hattaway, Tracie Rene, 

1003 Tillman Dr
Hawk, Jimmy Charles, 505 

Moore St
Hawkins, Alphonzo 

Fitzgerald, 309 N Fairview 
St

Hawkins, Jaliscia M, 102 
Jacob Ln

Hawkins, Makeshia Re-
nae, 1203 Fulton St

Hayles, Angela Darnell, 
617 Childs Rd

Haynes, Bonnie Louise, 
1343 Lee St #28

Haynie, Bonnie Camille, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #144
Hebron, Judy McCarty, 

620 Childs Rd
Henderson, Breanna M, 

105 Country Ln #103
Herring, April Kennedy, 

403 W Todd St
Herring, John Jacob, 208 

Goode Ave
Hicks, Divina Andaya, 133 

Treat Dr
Hicks, Tracy Waltman, 

1020 Syrup Mill Rd
Hightower, Kelsey Faith, 
137 Lawson Davis Rd
Hightower, Leslie, 266 

Gryder Rd
Hodges, Deanna Annette 

Kawaio, 411 Tatum St
Holcomb II, Glen Law-
rence, 127 Circle Ln

Holliday, Becky Jackson, 
105 Oaketree Ln #5

Holmes Jr, Gary Eugene, 
105 Sarah Cir

Hough, Baylee Leanne, 
17301 Hwy 80

Howard, Aundria Lanell, 
1305 Mark Dr

Hubbard, Cynthia Rene, 
121 Pine St #29

Huddleston, Taylor Chase, 
1211 Hwy 159

Hudson, Forest Park, 3113 
Germantown Rd

Hulion, William Kohler, 
1558 Jack Martin Rd
Hunt, Casey S, 801 

Shreveport Rd
Hunter, Briana Nicole, 

1118 Louisiana Ave
Hunter, Caleigh, 1401 

Lewisville Rd #235
Hunter, Justin Robert, 381 

Country Club Cir
Ingram, Keith Martin, 464 

Adams Rd
Irving, Lucy McEachern, 

439 McEachern Rd
Isgitt, Adam Blake, 119 N 

Tanglewood Dr
Isreal, Darren McGavin, 

513 Joel St
Isreal, Jamiaya Antriece, 

1016 Horton St
Jackson, Christell Bailey, 

1543 Shreveport Rd
Jackson, Elesia Yvette, 

105 Fuller St
Jackson, Gloria Musgrow, 

910 Pine St
Jackson, Jomesha Antho-

nette, 1314 Lee St #19
Jackson, Joshua Jomal, 

809 Horton St
Jackson, Larhonda 

Deanna, 215 Martin Luther 
King Dr

Jackson, Nadica, 611 
Weston St

Jackson, Robert E, 1543 
Shreveport Rd

Jackson, Roymona Louise, 
210 Virginia Ave

Jacobs, Kayla, 1314 Lee 
St #15

James, Cheryl Lena, 831 
Old Arcadia Rd

Jenkins, Jazmine T, 502 
Quarles St

Jennings, Edward James, 
605 Fuller Rd

Jennings, T Denise, 605 
Fuller Rd

Johnson, Heather, 909 
Hinton St

Johnson, Jacob Lee, 2076 
Methodist Camp Loop
Johnson, Jaylen, 535 

Patrick St
Johnson, Kearia Kanishia, 

802 Carolina St #31
Johnson, Keith Charles, 

909 Hinton St
Johnson, Latecia Chev-

one, 704 Hillside Ln
Johnson, Nila Parish, 103 

Emerald Dr #113
Johnson, Pondosa Lee, 

507 South St
Johnson, Tanisha Janelle 
Bourn, 606 Bradford St

Jones Sr, Mackinley, 401 
Myers St

Jones, Alexandra Danielle, 
912 Devereaux St

Jones, Eron Dsean, 614 
Joel St

Jones, Larry Allan, 194 
Caney Lake Rd

Jones, Lauren Christine, 
131 Colin P Kelly Dr

Jones, Rica Iman, 111 
Washington St

Jones, Shavon L, 1101 
Tillman Dr

Jones, Whitney Lynnett, 
906 Durwood Dr

Jordan, Megean Nicole 
Mary, 1314 Lee St #26

Kelley, Caitlin Anne, 110 
Seminary Ln

Kelly Jr, Michael Langston, 
893 Old Arcadia Rd

Kelly, Desmond Lamont, 
103 Emerald Dr #118

Kemp, Andie Nicole, 715 
Weston St

Kemp, Ashley Danielle, 
715 Weston St

Kemp, Chadricka D, 715 
West St

Kendall, Derek Dee, 130 
Debbie Ln

Kennedy, Adam Tyler, 
2958 Germantown Rd
Kennedy, Shanna, 705 

Constable St
Key, Bobby Ray, 714 

Murdock St
Key, Jeremy Dwayne, 
1398 Sheppard St #19
Key, Jerry Denis, 1677 

Almond Cir
Keyser, Kathleen M, 1001 

E Todd St
Khattab, Ibrahim A, 528 

Pine St
Kinsey, Ardis Ricky, 36 

McArthur St
Kinsey, Ruby Jones, 100 

Stanley St #8
Kirkendolph, Velisa Kiwani, 

226 Fort St
Kirkpatrick, Martha Hen-

dry, 1503 Hickory Dr
Kirksey, Wymeatris De-
wone, 355 Weston St

Kizzia, Alexandrea Nicole, 
73 Shell St

Kleckinger-Craven, 
Heather, 1107 Gloria St

Knight, Suzannah Vander-
burg, 714 Bymo Dr

Knowles, Gnya Cachet, 
913 Woods St

Koehler, Katina Ruth, 249 
Gryder Rd

Kuntz, Vicki Rumsey, 416 
Fincher Rd

Kusner, Karalyn, 1110 
Claiborne St

Lane, Tyrese Javon, 1421 
Shreveport Rd

Lane-Smith, Rachal Diane, 
403 Hillside Ln

Lang Jr, Lawrence Arland-
ers, 103 Emerald Dr #125
Lang, Diane Carter, 103 

Emerald Dr #125
Lang, Katherine Harper, 

808 Columbia St
Langley, Autumn Dawn, 

2116 Dogwood Trl
Langley, Devin Kyle, 209 

Virginia Ave
Langwasser, Kyle Dustin, 
116 Matthew Stevens Ln
Lard, Tikeyah Hay, 212 

Bell St

Larkins, Dianne S, 606 
Bradford St

Laroux, Joseph L, 110 
Shade Rv Park

Law, Anton Dominick, 210 
S Randall St

Lawrence, Eric Scott, 814 
Louisiana Ave

Lawrence, Kelly Kephart, 
907 McCausland St

Leppert, Michael Hunter, 
531 Vander Almond Rd
Lewis, Andre Deshaun, 

1529 Shreveport Rd #28
Lewis, Devodrick Dean-

gelo, 712 Clay St
Lewis, Dominesha Lava-

cea, 101 Squire St
Lewis, Gerald Wayne, 205 

Shirley Dr
Lewis, Kontishia Thornton, 

503 Chestnut St
Lewis, Phyllisha Jamecia 
Ranese, 1401 Lewisville 

Rd #138
Lewis, Ruby Mae, 1034 

Ridgewood Cir
Lewis, Tadaysha Ahemia, 

217 Main St
Lewis, Whitney Bonetta 

Nicole, 209 Fort St
Lister, Shundrekia Nicole, 

728 Brooks Alley
Lofton, Brittany Briann, 

603 Evans St
Lofton, Vikki Roneta, 702 

Caney St
Long, Joshua Lane, 104 

Emerald Dr #12
Love, Bessie Markray, 212 

Bell St
Luke, Cindy M, 105 Bay 

Creek Rd
Lyons, Cynthia Hodges, 42 

Front St
Maddox, Tori L, 1355 

Sheppard St #321
Malone, Akeilah Keshell, 

616 Joel St
Malone, Shakeia Shanea, 

604 Evans St
Maness, Avery Anne, 417 

Webb Ct
Maness, Jason Scott, 805 

Germantown Rd
Mangrum, Randall Scott, 

149 Aspen Dr
Mann, Rhonda Jackson, 

2002 Pruitt Rd
Marcantel, Brianna Nicole, 

1315 Evergreen Dr
Martin, Frank B, 305 

Hall Aly
Martin, Ladean, 211 S 

Roosevelt Dr
Martin, Michael Caleb, 195 

Boy Scout Rd
Mata, Juan Antonio, 200 

Heflin Ranch Rd
Matteson, Chandler Adrian 

Scott, 1401 Lewisville 
Rd #234

Maxey, David Clayton, 408 
Lawson Pl

Maxey, Patricia Lynn, 506 
East And West St

Maxie, Carolyn Taylor, 516 
Talton St

Maxwell, Taylor Jo, 120 
Sunny Beach Lp

May, Chastity Charlie, 
1661 Almond Cir

May, Jefferson Ryan, 206 
East And West St

McCarthy, Kimberly Cza-
ska, 9756 Hwy 80

McClendon Jr, Cedric 
Raynard, 103 Emerald 

Dr #123
Mccoy, Troy Lance, 2581 

Jack Martin Rd
McCray, Marcus Almetrice, 

703 Weston St
McDivitt, Richard Barry, 

601 Evans St
McFarland, Brandy Amilia, 

1276 Goodwill Rd
McHugh, Korina Bushnell, 

144 White Ln
McKellar, Christopher Dil-

lon, 112 Clerk St
McKenzie, Clayton S, 208 

Berry Dr
McKinney, Becky Ann, 217 

Pine St
McKinnon, Valerie Renee, 

15154 Hwy 371
McLain, Kristopher Sean, 

137 Lawson Davis Rd
McLean, Brandon D, 503 

Chestnut St
McLean, Melissa Ann, 118 

3rd St
Meador, Lora Renee, 919 

Brackin St
Mealey, Aidan Scott, 1307 

E Todd St
Medley, Caitlin Paige, 

4533 Hwy 528
Merritt, Jerry Wade, 1104 

Pine St
Merritt, Linda King, 118 

Shiloh Cemetery Rd
Miles, Constance Denise, 

16911 Hwy 80
Miles, Kenny Dwayne, 316 

Gilbert St
Miller Jr, Alton Wayne, 110 

Loop Rd
Miller, Nicole D, 405 

Front St
Miller, Precious Perneki, 

513 East St
Mims, Kamiya Mona, 502 

Moore St
Mitchell, Antonio W, 908 

Carolina St #13
Mitchell, Fairy Elizabeth, 
1398 Sheppard St #60

Mitchell, Sharon Bernette, 
102 Emerald Dr #8

Monzingo, Taylor Danielle, 
103 Sarah Cir

Moore Jr, Jerry Jerome, 
246 Pecanview Dr

Moore Jr, Terry Sentell, 
407 W Todd St

Moore, Ebony, 221 Wash-
ington Rd

Moore, Joshua Montrail, 
114 Southfield Park

Moore, Kobayoshi Danyell, 
203 High St

Moore, Mary H, 727 
Plum St

Moore, Randa Gail, 601 
Searles St

Moore, Rebecca 
Leighanne, 2078 Method-

ist Camp Loop
Moore, Roger Naess, 322 

Pennsylvania Ave
Moore, Shunton Quen-
nuce, 1398 Sheppard 

St #15
Moore, Toshyamona 

Flournoy, 210 Azalea St
Moorehead, Linda H, 360 

Chris Dr
Moorehead, Trystan Jade, 

360 Chris Dr
Morales, Charles Ray, 100 

Kristin Ln
Morehart, Lauren Ashleigh, 

2 Mason St
Morgan Sr, Walter, 604 

Moore St
Moro, Kristy Michelle, 

8034 Dorcheat Rd
Morris, Javonte Javiaez, 

246 Pecanview Dr
Morris, Latarya Nicole, 246 

Pecanview Dr
Morrison, Steven Glenn, 
3535 Germantown Rd
Moses, Kathrine, 409 

Clerk St
Moses, Shari Anne, 215 

Cadillac St
Mosley, Donners De-

wayne, 201 Miller St #35
Myles, Anterrica Gwena, 

1088 Frontage Rd
Needham, Laura James, 

1501 Lewisville Rd
Neloms, Cynthia Simone, 

621 Batton St
Neloms, Dereshia L, 

16392 Hwy 371
Neloms, Stacey Deion, 

915 Woods St
Nelson Jr, Torie Cortez, 

1025 Tillman Dr
Nelson, Brian, 912 Mc-

Causland St
Nelson, Shabrie Lorraine 

Lacole, 912 McCaus-
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INACTIVE VOTERS
WEBSTER PARISH

LOUISIANA SECRETARY 
OF STATE KYLE ARDOIN

If your name appears on 
the list below, your voter 

registration status is inac-
tive because your

registration address was 
not able to be verified by 
your parish registrar of 

voters during the
annual canvass or cor-

respondence sent to the 
address on file has been 
returned undeliverable. If
your residential address 

or the address where you 
receive mail has changed 

from the address
used when you registered 

to vote or last changed 
your voter registration 
record, please update

your residential address 
on your voter registration 

record online at www.
GeauxVote.com. You

may also change it by mail 
or in person at your parish 

registrar of voters.
If you have not changed 

your address, you are cur-
rently eligible to vote but 

will be required to
confirm your address 

when voting. If you do not 
confirm your address and 

you do not vote in
any election between the 

time your name was added 
to the list and the day after 

the second
regularly scheduled 

general election for federal 
office held after such date, 

your name may be
removed from the voter 

registration list.
A list of inactive voters 
is available 24 hours a 

day, seven days per week 
online at

www.GeauxVote.com.

MINUTES

The Webster Parish 
Library Board of Control 
met for a special session 
meeting in the Stewart
Center Meeting Room 

Friday, December 1, 2023, 
at 10:00 a.m. Present were 

board members
Laura Evans, Linda 

Watson, George French, 
Ethel Smith, and Secretary 

Savannah Jones.
Absent: Charlotte Dean 

and Vera Davison
President George French 
established a quorum and 
called the meeting to order 

at 10:00 a.m.
Mr. French asked for any 
additions to the agenda. 

There were no additions to 
the agenda.

Mr. French asked for 
audience comments. 

There were no audience 
comments.

Upon motion by Ethel 
Smith, second by Laura 
Evans, the following poli-
cies were approved as

presented:
 ADA Meeting Attendance 

Policy
 SAUP – Disaster Recov-

ery Policy
 SAUP – Receipts and 

Collections/Monetary 
Deposits Policy

There being no further 
business, upon motion by 
Linda Watson second by 

Laura Evans, the
meeting adjourned at 

10:28 a.m.

_____________________
_________________ ____
_____________________

_________
President Secretary

_____________________
_____________

Date

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald
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land St
Nelson, Tekeila Jermeyce, 

406 Joel St
Nolen, Devonte Ramar, 

833 Carolina St
Nolen, Nekagie Nicole, 

1107 Young St
Noles, Shonette Camille, 

608 Sunset Ln
Norris, Kenneth Mark, 160 

Celtic Ln
Odell, Grace Marie, 184 

Weldon Johnson Rd
Outley, Jeremy D, 703 

Columbia St
Parham, Joshua Blake, 

102 Berry Dr
Parker, Candace Ashly, 

809 Center St
Parks, David Gregory, 

1103 Rathbun St
Parks, Jack Anderson, 

1103 Rathbun St
Pate, Charles Artis, 206 

Crestview Dr
Pearson, Angelliyah Der-

riauna, 102 Hillside Ln
Peschke, Amber B, 403 

Whitlock St
Peters, Albany Elizabeth, 

255 Virginia Ave
Peters, Garrison Redell, 

617 Watts Cir
Peters, Noah Ray, 801 

Kennon St
Peterson, Deandreus 

Javion, 184 Amanda Rd
Petrie, Deana Michele, 

301 Hardy St
Philebar, Dennis J, 1006 

Gladney St
Philebar, Paula A, 1006 

Gladney St
Phillips, Kyra Monique, 

13476 Hwy 371 #A
Pickard, Nicholas Cole, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #114
Pickens, Cory Nathaniel, 

411 Summit St
Pickens, Kyle Leshon, 411 

Summit St
Pickett, Brenda H, 241 

Calvin Liner Rd
Pilcher, Tramel L, 609 

Howell St
Powell, Danna Lynn, 134 

Willard Ray Rd
Powell, Ethan Glen, 134 

Willard Ray Rd
Powell, Rene Jenell, 114 

McArthur Dr
Pratt, Antia Loel, 1398 

Sheppard St #2
Prestridge Jr, Charles Ed-
ward, 8084 Dorcheat Rd
Priddy-Arrington, Michael 

Ann, 405 Ash St
Priddy-Arrington, Tyler 

Ryan, 405 Ash St
Pugh, Zeola, 405 Joel St
Pyle, Jill, 182 Dorcheat 

Landing
Quarles, Cassandra Alyse 

Ogle, 806 Center St
Quinonez, Genaro, 181 

Country Pines Dr
Rabb, Markeisha Monae, 

121 Country Ln
Ragsdale, Tonda Laya, 

806 Claiborne St
Rambo, Dianna Evette, 

810 Peach St
Ramsey, Cindy Gray, 918 

Country Club Cir
Ramsey, Jeffery Dean, 
918 Country Club Cir

Ramus, Vince, 303 Martin 
Cir

Ratcliffe, Juanita Louise, 
704 Goodwill St

Ray, Mark, 214 Whispering 
Pines Trl

Ray, Marla June, 214 
Whispering Pines Trl

Redding, Aaron Carlos, 
216 Grisby Rd

Redington, Wendy, 194 
Caney Lake Rd

Rhame, Penny Bonsall, 
1765 Old Arcadia Rd

Rhodes, Stanley R, 932 
Carolina St

Richard, Denise Anna, 
1355 Sheppard St #309

Richards, Kellie Savanna, 
4280 Evergreen Rd

Richardson, Contory De-
carlos, 207 Hillside Ln

Richardson, Justin Christo-
pher, 506 Ash St

Riley, Vicki Miller, 406 Guy 
Miller Rd

Rivers, Frank James, 1401 
Lewisville Rd #130

Roach, Micah Patrick, 344 
Couchwood Rd

Roberson, Taylor Nichole, 
900 Bayou Ave #246

Robertson, Kimberly Ann, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #136
Robinette, Alexis Marina, 

461 McIntyre Rd
Robinson, Edjuana 

Tiawan, 114 Dodge St
Robinson, Patrice Colleen, 
308 N Middle Landing St
Robinson, Salante Jamar, 

138 Loop Rd
Rogers, Blake Harp, 1301 

Broadway St
Rogers, Joy Brown, 1301 

Broadway St
Rolen, Allyssa Shawntel, 

846 Middle Rd
Rosenberg, Chris, 1401 

Lewisville Rd #110
Ross, Latasha Lasha, 503 

Chestnut St
Rotharmel, Shane Mi-

chael, 322 N Tanglewood 
Dr

Rowell, Desha Danielle, 
117 Mandy Ln

Sanders, Matthew Allen, 
101 Shade Rv Park

Sanders, Michael Dylen, 
147 Methodist Camp Rd
Satterberg, Patricia Ded-

mon, 322 Carey Ln
Schulz, Austin Lee, 209 

Chandler St
Scott, April, 722 Rebecca 

St
Scott, Ashley Raovel, 815 

Warren St
Scott, Retonya Mechelle, 

712 Brooks Alley
Scroggins, Hunter Zain, 

105 Fuller St
Seamster, Andrea Alicia, 

616 Durwood Dr
Seamster, Anthrous 

Londarous, 108 Eisen-
hower Dr

Seamster, Geneva, 207 
Edna St

Seamster, Tanquanika 
Devorsha, 1112 Victory Dr
Sellers, Shelena Renee, 

215 W Union St
Shaffer, Brooklyn P, 1401 

Lewisville Rd #247
Shaw, Cade, 305 S 

Tanglewood Dr
Shaw, Toni Carleton, 305 

S Tanglewood Dr
Sheaffer, Tracie Catherine, 

200 Heflin Ranch Rd
Shehee, Sharman, 820 

Harris St
Sheppard, Kimberlee 

Danielle, 930 Evergreen 
Rd

Shine, Kayla Dishon, 416 
Morrow St

Shine, Qaurdarryl Devon-
tae, 121 Pine St #30

Shine, Rickey Dale, 620 
Constable St

Shoebroek, Marcus Tyler, 
31 McArthur St

Shyne, Marquez Almon, 
133 Country Ln

Shyne, Monta, 1105 
Constable St

Sikes, Carolyn H, 1135 
Miller Rd

Sikes, Haley Marie, 500 
Blue Run Rd

Sills III, Kimako Devinci, 
310 S Abney St

Simpson, Valerie Vanette, 
308 McIntyre St

Sims, Felicia Renea, 918 
Devereaux St

Sloan, Bria Z, 139 Colin P 
Kelly Dr

Smith, Brooke Renee, 606 
Hillside Ln

Smith, Danny Martise, 608 
College St

Smith, Debra Lynn, 11 
East St

Smith, Dmontez Deon, 317 
Emerald Dr

Smith, Hajile Assilem-Zeal, 
200 Louisiana Blvd

Smith, Kara Renee, 516 
Constable St

Smith, Neville R, 1009 
Watterman St

Smith, Rachel Danielle, 
389 Gryder Rd

Soens, Amber Joy, 103 
Kings Hwy

Spealman, Bradley Daniel, 
403 W Todd St

Spears, James Anthony, 
112 Seminary Ln

Specht, Joshua Daniel, 
189 N Tanglewood Dr

Spencer, Brenda Porter-
field, 601 Pennsylvania 

Ave
Spencer, Jada Mercedes, 

707 Jackson St
Sprawls, Phillip Joshua, 

100 Rose Hill Ln
Stahl, Heather Brianne, 

215 Deer Creek Ln
Stamant, Jean Paul, 3800 

Dorcheat Rd
Stanaland, Ariel Naomi, 

138 Shane Dr
Stanley, Heather Chey-
enne, 810 Tillman Dr

Starkey II, James Leonard, 
15493 Hwy 80

Steiger, Misti Brewer, 915 
Homer Rd #31

Stephens, Arlisha Rayonia, 
302 Camp St

Stephens, Spencer Derrell, 
212 W J Beck Rd

Stogsdill, Aubrey Rebecca, 
139 Colin P Kelly Dr

Stone, Dane Randall, 153 
Roberson Rd

Storey, Donna Janca, 411 
E Todd St

Strange, Elizabeth P, 5165 
Hwy 528

Stricklin, Lucas Allen, 2213 
Old Arcadia Rd

Striplin, Treasure Varleace, 
107 Southfield Park

Sutter, Sydney Nicole, 167 
Almond Cir

Swart, Gary Howard, 1105 
Madison Ave

Swart, Rona Baker, 1105 
Madison Ave

Swilley, Jeffrey Alan, 294 
N Tanglewood Dr

Talley, Janise Melvina, 507 
Hillside Ln

Talley, Judy McMurray, 107 
Methodist Camp Rd

Tatum, Richard Max, 266 
Chrislo Dr

Taulbee, Charles Allen, 
210 Ash St

Taylor, Brittny Tayone, 507 
Sunset Ln

Taylor, Jaquoryne Conte-
cio, 201 S Roosevelt Dr

Taylor, Lauren, 802 
Nella St

Teague, Cody Benjamin, 
958 Almond Cir

Teague, Don David, 512 
East And West St

Temple, Jeffery, 2466 Doc 
Steed Rd

Terral, Rose Marie, 1009 
Almond Cir

Thomas Sr, Robert Andre, 
180 Shane Dr

Thomas, Byron Dale, 109 
Berry Dr

Thomas, Carla Rashelle, 
1005 West St

Thomas, Chasity Danielle, 
1006 Clay St

Thomas, Edna Kelly, 103 
Emerald Dr #118

Thomas, Edward Lloyd, 
264 Katie Ln

Thomas, Jasmine Lenore, 
103 Emerald Dr #123

Thomas, Lee Arthur, 103 
Emerald Dr #118

Thomas, Lovell Lee, 104 
Woodhaven Dr

Thomas, Marilyn Joyce, 
421 Park Ave

Thomas, Marvin, 1015 
Horton St

Thomas, Willie Clyde, 100 
Rose Hill Ln #8

Thomas, Zakia Yasmin, 
180 Shane Dr

Thompson, Cameron Ja-
maal, 1490 Shreveport Rd
Thornton, Lechester Lo-
renzo, 131 George St

Thornton, Olivia Greene, 
1297 Greene Rd

Thurman, Jason Law-
rence, 124 Boy Scout Rd
Torres, Michele Rena, 510 

Richardson St
Tullis, Zachary Ryan, 402 

Chris Dr
Upchurch, Jessica Paige, 

616 Pine St
Vallacchi, Anna Frances 

Pauline, 714 Claiborne St
Vascocu, Ariel Savannah, 

13476 Hwy 371
Waldron, Ty Trenton, 603 

Pennsylvania Ave #1
Walker II, Sawandi Juma, 

1310 Mark Dr
Walker, Benjamin Donnie, 

813 Lewisville Rd
Walker, Betty Musgrow, 

618 Harris Cir
Walker, Eric Leroy, 1587 

Jack Martin Rd
Walker, Hannah Alysse, 

1104 Franklin St
Walker, Janice Fobbs, 300 

Miller St #225
Walker, Kimber Kanecia, 

915 Homer Rd #3
Walker, Mary Elizabeth, 

503 Wr Reeder St
Walker, Salihah Nairi, 

1310 Mark Dr
Wall, Kimberly, 9756 

Hwy 80
Wallace, Donald Anthony, 

1339 Mims Rd
Waller, Cecelia Jane, 4468 

Hwy 528
Waller, Derrick Dewane, 

917 Homer Rd
Wang, Yanan, 1301 

Turner St
Warren, Dominique, 124 

Shane Dr
Washington Jr, Delandra 

Wayne, 718 Yale St
Washington, Katrina Gage, 

718 Yale St
Washington, Sherry Ann, 
1398 Sheppard St #32
Washington, Timothy 
Rashad, 718 Yale St
Watson, Lamont, 445 

Sheppard St
Watson, Rebecca Jean, 

323 Newt Brown Rd
Weaver, Jennifer Eliza-

beth, 1815 Lewisville Rd
Webb, Kenneth Dwayne, 
521 Martin Luther King Dr
Webb, Mary Shirey, 434 

Katie Ln
Webb, Roy Lee, 120 

Hall St
Weber, Wade Eugene, 

3220 Evergreen Rd
Weldon, Jeannie Irene, 

246 Whispering Pines Trl
West, Aundrels Kortez, 

618 Watts Cir
West, Cleveland L, 726 

Plum St
West, Lachacka Naquail, 

804 Nella St
Whitaker, Mary English, 
239 Country Pines Dr
White, Holly Christina, 

1089 Dorcheat Rd
Whitfield, Melinda Sue, 
176 Walter Lyons Rd

Wilcox, Rosemary Gomez, 
206 Summit St

Williams, Angela Moore, 
902 Nella St

Williams, Ashley Brooke, 
902 Madison Ave

Williams, Christopher F, 
100 Azalea Terrace Ln #7
Williams, Christopher, 902 

Madison Ave
Williams, Crystal Lasha, 

206 Hillside Ln
Williams, Harmonie Es-
terica, 109 Hackett Dr

Williams, Jtoya Rikita, 900 
Bayou Ave #245

Williams, Larisa N, 600 
Kennon St

Williams, Rodney L, 803 
Clay St

Williams, Shendeka 
Lachall, 812 Fincher Rd
Williams, Stone Michael, 

1101 Rathbun St
Willis, Zhianne, 714 

Peach St
Wills, Chansity Lashae, 

310 Myers St
Wilmore, Tyler, 204 Bf 

Martin Dr
Wilson, Amanda Augusta, 
289 Whispering Pines Trl
Wilson, Ashton Akeem, 

217 Fuller Rd
Wilson, Brandy Nekia, 141 

Country Ln
Wilson, Jordan Blake, 405 

W Todd St
Wilson, Melissa Gail, 

17250 Hwy 80
Wilson, Timothy Caleb, 

178 Deer Creek Ln
Woods, Cheryl Creamer, 

146 Colin P Kelly Dr
Woods, Jason Michael, 

308 S Abney St
Woods, Richard Douglas, 

146 Colin P Kelly Dr
Woods, Terrence Millard, 

223 Roy St
Wright Jr, Leslie, 418 

Wright Dr
Wright, Darian Robert, 805 

Watterman St
Wrinkles, Sherry R, 107 

Fuller St
Wynne, Tammy Annette, 
1529 Shreveport Rd #31

Yancey, Kelly Doyle, 2290 
Hwy 532

Young, Cody Allen Owen, 
1401 Lewisville Rd #223
Young, Rocky Don, 721 

McIntyre Rd
Young, Rosemary Han-

cock, 409 College St
Zeigler, Joshua Brandon, 

813 Warren St
Ziegler, Ashley Nicole, 200 

Sandy Rd
------ Princeton ------

Gray, Mac Lamont, 8911 
Hwy 80

Kimble, Bobby James, 116 
Parish Line Pk

Rapattoni, Heather Bar-
bee, 2119 Hwy 528

Rapattoni, Joseph Vincent, 
2119 Hwy 528

Scarbrough II, Willie Ed-
ward, 107 Parish Line Pk

------ Sarepta ------
Allison, Ashley Paige, 

24215 Hwy 371
Allison, Lucas Scott, 229 

Denmon Rd
Anderson, Bridgitte 

Vollmer, 215 Bennett Rd
Ashworth, Alisha Lynn, 

904 Denmon Rd
Ashworth, Carrie April, 

5525 Hwy 2
Ashworth, Jamie Lynn, 

904 Denmon Rd
Badeaux, Mary Lavone, 

299 Davenport St
Baker, Francis Coile, 971 

Cook Baker Rd
Baker, Richard Thomas, 

971 Cook Baker Rd
Bell Jr, John Dudley, 171 

Charles Strong Rd
Bennett, James Christo-

pher, 180 Bennett Rd
Blea Jr, James Raymond, 

123 Ball Park St
Bonner, Erica M, 970 

Porterville Rd
Boulware, Benjamin, 215 

Bennett Rd
Brown, Jeffery Scott, 709 

Smithville Rd
Brown, Margie Canterbury, 

269 Jamie Bradley Rd
Butler, Daphne Thomas, 
391 Old Sarepta Church 

Rd
Carter, Pamela Sanders, 

148 Avera St
Cherry, Betty Danzell, 108 

Carraway Ln
Clements, Tabitha Lynn, 
136 Jamie Bradley Rd
Cole, Ashley D, 5368 

Hwy 2
Cole, Savannah Maureen, 

860 King Orchard Rd
Cook, Collin Clay, 514 

Smithville Rd
Cooper, Lendi Sikes, 783 

Denmon Rd
Corbell, Hayden Brian, 499 

Hwy 802
Couch, Crystal Lee, 130 

Bagwell Rd
Crumpler, Daniel Paul, 610 

Church St
Dancer, David A, 24107 

Hwy 371
Dancer, Pamala Kay, 

24107 Hwy 371
Davis, Candice Michele, 
1093 King Orchard Rd
Dawson, Brittany Anne, 

5651 Hwy 2
Dinkins II, Danny Arvil, 260 

Providence Rd
Gardner, Bobby O, 213 

Crow Lake Rd
Goodgion, Dakota Scott, 

6218 Hwy 2
Goodgion, James Jay, 

6218 Hwy 2
Goodgion, Marsha Le-

anne, 6218 Hwy 2
Gould, John Leslie, 220 

Bennett Rd
Graves, Brittney Danielle, 

310 Duck Cir
Griffin, William Dean, 

25270 Hwy 371
Guidroz, Kerry, 148 

Avera St
Hair, Cynthia W, 780 

Denmon Rd
Hano II, Lonnie R, 7139 

Hwy 2
Harris, Chad Dalton, 299 

2nd St
Hays II, Richard Odus, 313 

Bennett Rd
Heflin, Dylan Kyle, 148 

Avera St
Hefner, John David, 235 

Palmer St
Hendricks, Tina Denise, 

25507 Hwy 371
Hicks Jr, William Lee, 6309 

Hwy 2
Hicks, Angela Farmer, 

6309 Hwy 2
Hilliard, Rodney Taylor, 

132 Carraway Ln
Hinton III, William Henry, 

833 Thomasville Rd
Hoskins, John Franklin, 

6072 Hwy 2
Hoskins, Mary Frances, 

6072 Hwy 2
Hurley, Kegan Christine, 

271 Duck Cir
Jenkins, Heather Nicole, 

244 Crow Lake Rd
Jenkins, Jonathan David 
Brian, 244 Crow Lake Rd
Jordan, Jerry Louis, 784 

Porterville Rd
Jordan, Rosalinda Tamon-
dong, 784 Porterville Rd

Kennington, Kenny David, 
131 Kelly Dr

Ketchum, Chad Daniel, 
269 Jamie Bradley Rd
Knippers, Brian Zeth, 

25507 Hwy 371
Knippers, Maegun A, 

25507 Hwy 371
Knippers, Wayne David, 

25507 Hwy 371
Kykendall, Loryn Kate, 174 

Crow Lake Rd
Lafleur, Caleb Gage, 571 

Cook Baker Rd
Largent Jr, Starling L, 399 

Morgan Rd
Lee, Britney C, 373 Por-

terville Rd
Lee, John H, 373 Porter-

ville Rd
Leslie, Jason M, 5970 

Hwy 2
Lewis, Glen Edward, 264 

Langley Rd
McDaniel, Melissa Strick-

land, 25053 Hwy 371
McEachern, Wesley Tan-

ner, 325 Frazier Rd
McGill Jr, Odie, 3014 

Walnut Rd
McKnight, Deborah E, 279 

Morgan Loop
Mitchell, Cynthia Joan, 

25004 Hwy 371
Muir, Amy Marie, 164 

Coyle St
Owens, Fredna Calhoun, 

504 Nickerson Rd
Pool, Dana Neal, 322 

Frazier Rd
Pool, Kevan Troy, 322 

Frazier Rd
Pool, Melody Susann, 322 

Frazier Rd
Riser Jr, Anderson, 817 

Thomasville Rd
Sanders, Michael Glynn, 

146 Avera St
Shepherd, Debra Faye, 

101 Ward Rd
Sheppard, Virginia L, 5294 

Hwy 2
Slack, Jeremiah David, 

136 Thomas St
Taylor, Joe Kyle, 24118 

Hwy 371
Thomas, Brytlanie Trach-

ell, 842 Hwy 802
Thomas, Chelsie Le'anne, 

1894 King Orchard Rd
Turgeon, Patrick A, 303 

Palmer St
Vaughan, Paul Stanley, 

1001 Hwy 802
Vowell Jr, Donald W, 163 

N Matthews St
Ware, Bridget Ann, 491 

Smith Lp
Ware, Laura Dell, 5705 

Hwy 2
Watson, Eleanor Sunday, 
334 Old Sarepta Church 

Rd
Watson, James Seth, 166 

Morgan Loop
Watson, Lesley Ann, 166 

Morgan Loop
Watts, Lisa Bernard, 426 
Old Sarepta Church Rd
Weems, Lessie Jones, 

5688 Hwy 2
Whiseant, Ricky Ray, 677 

King Orchard Rd
Yates, Stormilee Ann, 890 

Hwy 802
Young, Christopher Lance, 

777 Hwy 802
------ Shongaloo ------

Baker, Phillip Raymond, 
13825 Hwy 159

Barnard, Camille Mat-
thews, 25762 Hwy 157
Bauldree, Dalton Boyd, 
149 Elmer Moore Rd

Beckett, Alan, 187 Baker 
Rd

Beene, Kededrick Damon-
tre, 1014 Wiley Rd

Berry, William Gabriel Ben-
son, 1297 Mimosa Ln

Boothe, Joni Alexandria, 
1297 Mimosa Ln

Britt, Stacia Lynn, 2364 
Haynes Rd

Chandler, Michael Edward, 
454 Elton Wise Rd

Chreene, Victoria Danielle, 
2486 Rodney Martin Rd
Collins I, Cliff Brandon, 

11328 Hwy 160
Creamer, Austin Dale, 667 

Fire Tower Rd
Daniels, Ainsley Brianne, 

430 Country Pl
Day, Stevie Nicole, 9473 

Hwy 159
Dewhurst, Deanna Marie, 

965 Loyd Whitaker Rd
Drewery, Rodney Wayne, 

182 S Willow Rd
Farrington, Natalee Blake, 

26542 Hwy 157
Faulk Jr, Melton Earl, 113 

Hwy Alt 2
Faulk, Kayla Renee, 11333 

Hwy 160
Fields, Abby Nicole, 229 

Bobby Davis Rd
Gryder, John Christopher, 

887 Fire Tower Rd
Hall, Joshua Paul, 1147 

Mimosa Ln
Hamilton, Amandia Renee, 

1089 John Pope Rd
Harper, Sonya Lanette, 

119 Barge Rd
Hart, Linda Janine, 28010 

Hwy 157
Herron, Sarah Ashley, 

10515 Hwy 160
Jester, Jessica Dawn, 

27305 Hwy 157
Knighton, Clark Wayne, 

270 Elmer Moore Rd
Lablue, Cassidy Lynn, 

1080 Hwy Alt 2
Lablue, Lauren Lynn, 1080 

Hwy Alt 2
Law, Susan Clair, 490 

Hilltop Rd
Lennard, Justin Michael, 

12831 Hwy 159
Martin, Kathy Jean, 1054 

John Pope Rd
McDaniel, Gabriel Adam, 
205 Jewell Manning Rd
McKenzie, Anessa New-
ton, 1950 Newsom Rd
Mendenhall, Barbara 
Denise, 2416 Rodney 

Martin Rd
Miller, Miranda Kathleen, 

2056 Haynes Rd
Morris, Derek Byran, 351 

Teutsch Rd
Nance Jr, Charles Allen, 

567 Mimosa Ln
Powell, Teresa Johnson, 

903 Hilltop Rd
Riley, Christopher Scott, 

285 Willow Rd
Ritzell, Zachary Hunter, 

154 Newsom Rd
Roach, Tiffany L, 1285 

Haynes Rd
Robinson, Delmer Paul, 

25495 Hwy 157
Robinson, Melissa Ponder, 

297 S Willow Rd
Rowe, April Rene, 12761 

Hwy 159
Sanders, Brian Keith, 9465 

Hwy 159
Shepherd, Karen R, 195 

Hwy Alt 2
Smith, Stacey Liane, 700 

Mimosa Ln
Sneed, Hunter Kane, 8975 

Hwy 2
Taylor, Charlotte Andrews, 

9230 Hwy 2
Taylor, Michelle L, 10303 

Hwy 2
Thomas, Carrie Rose, 

11740 Hwy 159
Varnado, Samuel William, 

257 Hwy Alt 2
Vaughan, Sherry Stanley, 

160 Stanley Rd
Vines, Randell Neal, 815 

Hwy 615
Welch, Jeffrey Scott, 880 

Ponder Rd
White, Roger Dewayne, 

260 Bobby Davis Rd
Wortham, Kierra Somon, 

171 Half Pint Rd
------ Sibley ------

Adams, Bobbie Foster, 
130 Tharpe Ln

Adams, Cheyenne Isa-
bella, 130 Tharpe Ln
Adams, Mitzi R, 107 

Grice Ln
Alford, James Eddie, 266 

Weatherton St
Allison, Robin Shirey, 214 

W Justin Dr
Anderson, Amy Jo, 225 

Cook Rd
Anderson, Ashley Eliza-

beth, 225 Cook Rd

Aultman, Alexis Cheyenne, 
265 Frazier Ave

Aultman, Gloria Savannah, 
265 Frazier Ave

Bailey Jr, Kenneth Lamar, 
214 Nursery Rd #35

Banks, Kamecia Mitchell, 
163 Trailer Park Dr

Barnes, William Frank, 
1739 Yellow Pine Rd

Berdan, Erica Nichole, 366 
Frazier Ave

Berdan, Todd David, 366 
Frazier Ave

Beshirs, Julia Megan, 132 
McDade Ave

Bickford Jr, Jeff Leff, 155 
Frazier Ave

Box, Elkeshius Jovan, 116 
Trailer Park Dr

Bradford, Tequarius De La 
Jame, 323 Winwood Dr
Braumiller, Jeffrey Scott, 

155 Frazier Ave
Braumiller, Martha, 155 

Frazier Ave
Burris, Daphne Morris, 214 

Nursery Rd #7
Calloway Jr, Anton Osha, 

476 Pero Church Rd
Cannon, Jared Lane 

Albright, 519 S Natchi-
toches St

Carter, Hunter Cade, 373 
SE 4th Ave

Carter, Sharon Annette, 
109 Rock St

Cherry Jr, Newell King, 
122 SE 3rd Ave

Childers, Kimela Jo, 418 S 
Main St #107

Clark, Franchester 
Rashell, 511 S Main St

Coleman, Catherine 
Nanatte, 113 Rock St

Comer, Mike Alan, 371 
Frazier Ave

Cooper, Jason Travis, 585 
N Main St

Cox, David Lee, 123 NE 
1st Ave

Cox, Shannon Rena 
Wrenn, 123 NE 1st Ave

Crawford, Justin Paul, 180 
Tacoma Trl

Crawford, Lovie Frazier, 
195 Winwood Dr

Crow Jr, Isaac, 149 
Olympia Dr

Donovan, Susan Terral, 
160 Frazier Ave

Doskocil, Eric Anthony, 
118 SE 2nd Ave

Duck, Caitlin Danae, 9471 
Hwy 371

Elkins, Lamario Jermaine, 
105 Rock St

Ferrell, Lashayla Unique, 
183 Winwood Dr

Flores, Miranda Marie, 621 
N Main St

Franks, Julie Carver, 145 
Melanie Ln

Frazier, L C, 289 SE 
Claiborne Ave

Fuller, Heather Dawn, 662 
Miller Briarwood Rd

Germany, Altecko Tywon, 
288 SE 2nd Ave

Gorman, Clifton Eugene, 
959 N Main St

Graham, Timothy Douglas, 
138 SE 1st Ave

Graves, Kimberly 
Rochelle, 106 William 

Brown Rd
Green, Shaniquwa Nicole, 

943 Nursery Rd
Gregg, Daisy Nicole, 206 

Oil Tank Rd
Guthrie, Raylee Kaye, 312 

Saltworks Rd
Haley II, Lawrence An-

thony, 527 Penal Farm Rd
Hall, Mamie Boyette, 355 

SE 2nd Ave
Hanson, Jean Ethel, 103 

Grice Ln
Harris, Sabrina Raven, 

215 Frazier Ave
Henry Jr, Victor, 147 NE 

2nd Ave
Henry, Joseph Lee, 9439 

Hwy 371
Hicks, Wesley Blake, 8483 

Hwy 371
Houston, Samuel Connor, 

101 Joyce Ln
Howard, Breeze Shannell, 

136 Lone Oak Ln
Humphrey, Jeffrey Neil, 

218 Smith Ln
Kemp, Deterion Dandre, 

102 Sierra Dr
Kennon, Jimmy R, 257 

Weatherton St
Kennon, Shequita D, 286 

Hawk Ln
Key, Damiano D, 231 

Winwood Dr
King, Modesty Dawn, 1442 

Yellow Pine Rd
Kinsey, Sharneta Shyrel, 

170 Jones St
Kopf, Christopher Donald, 

450 Nursery Rd
Krabill II, Ralph Edward, 

369 SE 4th Ave
Laney, Joshua Dale, 133 

Melanie Ln
Lawrence, Keoceasha 

Gwendolyn, 1591 Penal 
Farm Rd

Lister, Alexis Chakiyah, 
159 Trailer Park Dr

Lonidier, Rachael Alayne, 
716 Pero Church Rd

Lowrie, Jonathan Allen, 
8460 Hwy 371

Macks, Kimberlee Denise, 
548 N Main St

Malone Jr, Tommie Lee, 
213 Frazier Ave

Mason, Fredrick Leon, 287 
SE Claiborne Ave

Mason, Latonya Yavonne, 
287 SE Claiborne Ave

McBroom, Krystal Nicole, 
504 S Main St

McKinney, William E, 432 
Yellow Pine Rd

Mellen, Breanna Nicole 
Lynn, 241 S Almond 

Lake Rd
Mellen, Tamie Lynn, 115 

Saltworks Rd
Michaud, Matthew Robert, 

195 Sherwood Ln
Miles, Donzel M, 183 

Trailer Park Dr
Miles, Kimberly Lashone, 

5478 Hwy 164
Miller, Timothy Eric, 215 

Frazier Ave
Mims, Melvin Kadarrel, 

267 Weatherton St
Moore, Ricky Charles, 535 

N Main St
Morris, Jasmine Calvinesa, 

341 Winwood Dr
Mulkey, Lillian Burnham, 

432 Yellow Pine Rd
Nelson, Ethan Tyler, 9451 

Hwy 371
Odoms, Tcoyia Monia, 195 

Trailer Park Dr #28
Owens Jr, Johnny Lev-
ance, 301 NE 2nd Ave

Parker, Gwendolyn Hunter, 
322 S Natchitoches St
Parker, Melissa Lynn, 
1670 Penal Farm Rd

Phillips, Paulette Walker, 
160 Miller Briarwood Rd
Pierce, Morgan Adrianna 

Jane, 104 Doodle Trl
Presnell, Carol Bobbit, 104 

Joyce Ln
Quarles, Deandrea 

Tainice, 486 SE 5th Ave
Randle, Jasmine, 112 

Colby Ln
Red, Velvet Lashawn Ew-

ing, 323 Winwood Dr
Redd, Octavia B, 323 

Winwood Dr
Reese, Terika June, 8166 

Hwy 371
Rodgers, Tiffany Renee, 

425 SE Railroad Ave
Roton, Tommie Jean 

Shockley, 214 Nursery 
Rd #16

Schenck, Heather Marie, 
176 E Kelly Ln

Schenck, Kyle Levi, 176 E 
Kelly Ln

Schober, Seth Benjamin, 

9458 Hwy 371
Seegers, Kelly Elia, 150 

Seegers Ln
Shirey, Tina Ruth, 586 S 

Main St
Shockley, Whitney Nicole, 

214 Nursery Rd #4
Slone, Shawn C, 130 

Kayla Ln
Smith, Carlon Gilmer, 554 

N Main St
Smith, Sharon Williams, 

5574 Hwy 164
Smithey, Jamey Lane, 115 

SE 3rd Ave
Sparks, Shaun Cooper 

Alan, 166 Pero Church Rd
Stanley, Kavasha Meshall, 

109 Rock St
Stephens, Shelby Leeann, 

119 Pero Church Rd
Stern Jr, Travis Lee, 116 

Adeline Ln
Swiger, Alexis A, 450 

Nursery Rd
Switek, Anthony, 8166 

Hwy 371
Switek, Pamela Smith, 

8166 Hwy 371
Taylor, Lauren Lee, 193 

SE 5th Ave
Thomas, Brandon Marcle, 

518 S Main St
Thomas, Brittany Nicole, 

518 S Main St
Thompson, Tamara Nicole, 

214 Nursery Rd
Tippins, Kennie Laveal, 

271 Weatherton St
Tippins, Latrice L, 267 

Weatherton St
Torres, Anna Belle, 460 SE 

5th Ave
Wagner, Harold Alvin, 301 

Frazier Ave
Wagner, Linda Kay, 301 

Frazier Ave
Walker, Asheal L, 183 

Trailer Park Dr
Washington, Kanese 

Lakia, 189 Trailer Park 
Dr #25

Watkins, Deanne Denett, 
255 S Almond Lake Rd

Webb, Cassidy Ma Ryan, 
214 Nursery Rd

Wells, Chloe Marie, 8166 
Hwy 371

White, Staci Renee, 381 
Lake Rd

Williams, James Gregory, 
887 Yellow Pine Rd

Williamson Jr, Terry Milton, 
127 Tharpe Ln

Williamson, Bonnie Kris-
tine, 127 Tharpe Ln

Woodall, Sheila, 8440 
Hwy 371

Yorks, Oshinay, 214 Nurs-
ery Rd #38

------ Springhill ------
Adkison, David Wayne, 
268 Daniel Thomas Rd

Alexander, Lakisha R, 303 
N Park Dr

Allen, Larry Ray, 1006 
7th St Se

Arceneaux, Jenaya, 904 
Obier St

Armstrong, Michelle 
Denise, 106 Jeter St

Aycock, Suzanne Michelle, 
393 14th St Sw

Ayers, Seth, 507 12th 
St Nw

Baker, Jennifer Rochelle, 
1112 4th St Sw

Baker, Lacora M, 702 
Rosebud Loop

Balentine, Richard Owen, 
572 Spring Branch Rd

Ball, Danielle Marie, 414 
Walnut St

Barnard, Linda Lois, 111 
Forest St

Barrower, James Lamond, 
402 Center Park Dr

Benson, Colby Jace, 502 
6th St Ne

Benson, Vicky L, 403 
Rosebud Loop

Berry, Jason Alan, 703 
Herrington Dr

Berryman, Ceairra Shyian, 
508 6th St Ne

Bethany, Jennifer Renee, 
705 Dennis St

Billingsley, Kathleen 
Chrystene, 101 Moore St
Blanks, Jeremy Antoin, 

202 Rosebud Loop
Bohrer, Brian Lester, 710 

Butler St
Bonner, Shauana Latrese, 

1501 7th St Se
Booth, Shawn Michael, 

200 Oak Dr
Boyd, Tamia Latana, 1401 

7th St Se
Boyett, Billy Ray, 504 Her-

rington Dr #10
Bradford, Mayray F, 1305 

3rd St Se
Brewer, Torance Darell, 
226 3rd Street Pinehill
Broom, Nicole, 908 7th 

St Se
Broom, Quadrick Markell, 

166 Brady St
Brown Sr, Monquel Dean-

dre, 706 Coyle St
Brown, Rose M, 304 Rose-

bud Loop
Burchfield, Elvaretta 

Darden, 506 7th St Nw
Burns, Betty Simmons, 

205 Roy St #2
Bush, Mona Elisa, 503 

Herrington Dr #5
Cain, Phillip Jerome, 17 

Camelot Dr #83
Caldwell, John Edrica, 

1012 3rd St Sw
Carey, Mary McDonald, 

148 Angela Dr
Carpenter, Kelly Moore, 

903 Obier St
Carter, Charles Ray, 1001 

S Main St
Carter, Lacy Brianna, 407 

5th St Se
Carter, Tiffany, 708 9th 

St Nw
Caswell, Jessica Briann, 
100 Piney Springs Mill 

#306
Chapman, Rebecca 
Bacon, 19 Reiny Cir

Cheatham, Felicia Lean, 
904 2nd St Se

Chipps, Shania Shontel, 
582 Spring Branch Rd
Coleman, Anthony Mi-

chael, 610 Park Lp
Collins, Tammy Jo Balen-

tine, 1208 Reynolds St
Cone, Rebecca Mouser, 
1012 Plain Dealing Rd

Cook, Shameka Rosha, 
1104 4th St Sw

Cooper, Destinee Delen, 
347 14th St Sw

Cooper, Jaquetta Shante, 
1005 4th St Sw

Cooper, Sandra Leveth, 
304 Rosebud Loop

Cotterell, Joshua Daniel, 
128 15th St Nw

Cox Jr, Mack Lester, 102 
Lyndie Ln #2

Crook, Trent Scott, 107 
8th St Sw

Dagner, David Alan, 403 
S Park Dr

Daigle, Nicholas Law-
rence, 511 B And S Dr

Daniel, Stephanie Berry, 
503 Hill St

Darst, Cody Lee, 613 
Montgomery Dr

Davis, Jimi Rechelle, 910 
2nd St Se

Day III, George Britton, 
310 1st St Nw

Dean, Debra McCuen, 
1055 Payne St

Denmon, Mary A, 303 8th 
St Ne

Denmon, Zachery Lee, 
303 8th St Ne

Dennis Jr, John C, 210 
Willow St

Dillard, Christopher Dalton, 
110 Taylor St

Dillard, Latasha Rena, 
1011 Baker St

Domingue, Dawn Annette, 

417 4th St Se
Doyle, Joshua Alexander, 

714 9th St Nw
Doyle, Kyler Pope, 714 

9th St Nw
Duck, Sharon Martin, 607 

4th St Nw
Duke, Jamie Joe, 170 

Brown Rd
Dunlap, Michael Vincent, 

715 9th St Nw
Dupree, Brandy Nichol, 

501 Rosebud Loop
Dupree, Carolyn Sumpter, 

17 Camelot Dr #62
Dupree, Kaleb Keion, 17 

Camelot Dr #62
Eason, Davien J, 505 

Taylor St
Eason, Roy Antonio, 203 

Legion Dr
Eason, Shayla Cunning-

ham, 203 Legion Dr
Easter, Dewayne Mar-
quella, 301 Edgar St

Eastwood, Kimberly Mi-
chelle, 207 2nd St Nw
Edmonds, Darryl Keith, 
541 Spring Branch Rd

Edwards, Ronald Ray, 605 
Center Park Dr

Etue, Dewon Wayne, 607 
9th St Nw

Evans, Rethell Traylor, 
1012 3rd St Sw

Ewing, Lois Ann, 500 N 
Park Dr

Fielding, Jennifer Marie, 
604 Douglas St

Fink, Rebecca Ann, 605 
Butler St

Fleming, Melvin Ross, 904 
Kaye St

Garcia, Stacy Herold, 1366 
Machen Dr

Gardner, Michael Brandon, 
406 Forest St

Garleigh, Miranda Dani-
elle, 212 1st Street Pinehill
Gay, Tytiyana, 17 Camelot 

Dr #76
Gibson, Duran, 304 7th 

St Sw
Gibson, Elijah Tyreek, 600 

7th St Se
Gibson, Mynetta Latrice, 

600 7th St Se
Gilbert, Kaniya Shaneek, 

604 5th St Ne
Gilmore, Mary Ann, 501 

Herrington Dr #10
Gipson, Clara Grigsby, 402 

Center Park Dr
Gipson, Leiah Demetrice, 

805 3rd St Se
Gipson, Renada Deshe, 

17 Camelot Dr #92
Godwin, Davien, 805 3rd 

St Se
Goodwin Jr, Robert 

Edward, 904 Obier St
Goodwin, Robert E, 904 

Obier St
Grigsby, Shacora Renee, 

409 Center Park Dr
Gryder, Sarah Adeline, 17 

Camelot Dr #30
Hall, Candace Machel, 222 

1st Street Pinehill
Hall, Jimmy Glenn, 1559 

Machen Dr
Hall, Kathy Lynn, 1559 

Machen Dr
Hardy, Zhane Shartrez, 

710 Curry St
Harris, Lashonda Frazier, 

1001 S Main St
Harris, Melissa Leshea, 

300 Williams St
Harvey, Jessica Lynn, 106 

Morgan St
Hawkins, Dishika Monique, 

1305 3rd St Se
Hawthorne Sr, Gerald 

Dewayne, 710 Curry St
Hawthorne, Eddie Ray, 17 

Camelot Dr #7
Hawthorne, Lataress 

Corvett, 309 S Park Dr
Hawthorne, Myangelio 

Darchavious Lis, 710 5th 
St Ne

Head, Alice Scogin, 207 
Hickory St

Hearn, Erica Hope, 824 
Butler St

Hicks, Virginia Lee, 914 
Reynolds St

Hodges, Lisa Dawn, 166 
Airport Lp

Holden, Carmeshia Shan-
trece, 17 Camelot Dr #99

Hollis, Barbara H, 119 
Lakewood Dr

Hollis, Donald Leon, 119 
Lakewood Dr

Holmes, Jean L, 12 
Reiny Cir

Hood, Donald Eugene, 
314 1st St Nw #B

House, Judy Wynne, 222 
3rd Street Pinehill

Howard, Karen Renee, 
408 8th St Se

Hubert, Jasmine Dianne, 
17 Camelot Dr #65

Hudson, Keasha Cherrelle, 
17 Camelot Dr #92

Hunt, Bryan Heath, 824 
Butler St

Hux, Rachel Elizabeth, 
360 Frye Rd

Jacobs, Johnny Ray, 407 
Fir St

James, Joyce Mendenhall, 
207 Beck St

Jeane, David R, 305 
Hickory St

Jeane, Ruth E, 305 
Hickory St

Jefferson, Meosha San-
trice, 295 Mill Pond Rd

Jennings, Horace D, 507 
10th St Ne

Jennings, John David, 803 
Butler St

Johnson, Delephine Ra-
mance, 1110 4th St Sw

Johnson, Jeffery Fitzger-
ald, 1101 Rosebud Loop
Johnson, Nina Mae, 304 

Rosebud Loop
Jones Jr, Lorenzo Deunte, 

402 6th St Se
Jones, Isaiah Eugene, 402 

6th St Se
Jones, Kathryn R, 301 

Willow St
Jones, Lauren Taylor, 803 

Coyle St
Jordan, Janice Renee, 362 

Springhill Airport Rd
Joyner, Sally Strong, 501 

Rosebud Loop
Kelley, Jordan Alexandra, 

708 N Arkansas St
Kemp, Tanya Latia, 17 

Camelot Dr #88
Kimble, Germaine 

Shaquille, 226 3rd Street 
Pinehill

Kyles, Matthew Bryan, 705 
Herrington Dr

Lane, Vernon, 1101 4th 
St Sw

Laprarie, Tyler Reece, 12 
Ensey St #2

Lawson, Ayanna Kay, 200 
Sherwood Ln #21

Lawson, Larry Lynn, 501 
S Park Dr

Lawson, Rosalyn, 217 3rd 
Street Pinehill

Leal-Ramirez, Leonel, 
1003 10th St Nw

Lewis, Alan Marvelle, 173 
Sanders Rd

Lewis, Ashley Dawn, 100 
Piney Springs Mill #306

Lewis, Chadrick Kendrell, 
1304 7th St Se

Lewis, Traci Mims, 173 
Sanders Rd

Long, Aaron, 111 Bay-
singer Rd

Lowry, Nicholas Gunner 
Lamb, 109 Lakewood Dr
Lyons, Laura H, 21500 

Hwy 157
Mallory, Stephen Deuntae, 

17 Camelot Dr #92
Malone, Larry Randell, 147 

Airport Lp
Malos, Robert Wayne, 148 

Angela Dr
Mason, Calvin Tywon, 

1102 Reynolds St

Matthews, William Alexan-
der, 17 Camelot Dr #80

Mccoy, Nathaniel Wesley, 
541 Spring Branch Rd

McCrary, Adam Wayne, 
209 Oak Dr

McDaniel, Charles Earl, 
202 Rosebud Loop

McDaniel, Evon Victoria, 
12 Ensey St #1

McLain, Ronald Patrick, 
701 7th St Nw

McMullan, Quinley Que, 
106 6th St Ne

McNees, Kevin David, 401 
Reynolds St

Mendenhall, Chermekia 
Latre, 206 3rd St Nw

Mesenhimer, Lorna Elaine, 
725 Coyle St

Miller, Heather Bland, 110 
Martin St

Miller, Myron M, 24044 
Hwy 157

Mitchell, Gwenda White, 
1275 Springhill Airport Rd
Mitchell, Thomas, 205 6th 

St Sw
Monday, Rita Elaine, 712 

12th St Nw
Monday, Steven Wade, 

712 12th St Nw
Mondello, Brittany Kay-

lene, 1164 Percy Burns Rd
Mondello, Corey James, 

1164 Percy Burns Rd
Montgomery, Candace 
Berry, 402 Service St

Montondo, Joseph Paul, 
711 6th St Nw

Moore, Cassandra L, 105 
8th St Sw

Moore, Dabolique 
Dmonde, 105 8th St Sw

Morgan, James Dewayne, 
207 3rd St Nw

Morris, Roastanna 
Melsheilia, 1108 Hodges 

St
Murphy, Helen Marian, 

1106 5th St Sw
Nations, Russell Reed, 
265 Spring Branch Rd

Neal, Sherry Renea, 503 B 
And S Dr

Nehls, Debra June, 207 
Roy St

Okeke, Alicia, 300 Wil-
liams St

Oneal, Melissa Danielle, 
1309 7th St Se

Osborn, Nancy Haag, 920 
Plain Dealing Rd

Osborn, Richard Eugene, 
920 Plain Dealing Rd

Owens, Nancy Davis, 304 
6th St Nw

Palmer, Cody Lynn, 1013 
Baker St

Park, Lisa Kathryn, 1015 
Janice Dr

Parker, Linsey Nicole, 100 
11th St Se

Parrish, Paige Jenae, 126 
Percy Burns Rd

Patel, Nishaben S, 805 S 
Arkansas St

Patterson, Nickolas 
Hunter, 803 Coyle St

Pickett, Kristy Michelle, 
503 N Park Dr

Player, Kayla, 715 9th 
St Nw

Ponto, Vincent Dean, 212 
1st Street Pinehill

Pool, Josh Martin, 504 S 
Park Dr

Porter, Margaret A, 506 N 
Park Dr

Porter, Michael Wayne, 
503 Rosebud Loop

Porter, Tommie Derel, 
1004 Coyle St

Pyle, Angel Lashay, 105 N 
Arkansas St

Rankin, Alma Dean, 1104 
4th St Sw

Rankin, Lakymdra Shante, 
901 Rosebud Loop

Ransom, Lawrence Cee, 
187 Mill Pond Rd

Rasberry, Laurie Nicole, 
115 Penny Cir

Ratliff, Kenneth Dale, 207 
3rd Street Pinehill

Ray, Diane L, 305 S 
Park Dr

Ray, Marvin Lee, 602 
Rosebud Loop

Reynolds, Michael Lynn, 
201 3rd St Se

Richardson, Ebony Latrice, 
604 7th St Se

Richardson, Jesaveus 
Dmonte, 209 6th St Sw
Riser, Tangela Chalise, 

1005 3rd St Sw
Roberson Jr, Alvie Leo, 

711 6th St Nw
Roberson, Cynthia Renee, 

711 6th St Nw
Roberts, Richard L, 212 

Meadow Creek Dr
Robins, Richard, 206 11th 

St Ne
Robinson, Alicia Shunta, 

1006 N Arkansas St
Roby, Hoprecious Darling, 

504 Rosebud Loop
Roe, Tyshanekquel T Sha, 

104 7th St Se
Ross, Gwendolyn 

Reniece, 213 3rd Street 
Pinehill

Rowe, Sergius Ivan, 1407 
3rd St Se

Rushing, Jona Lenel, 503 
Shady Oak St

Sabin Ervin, Wendy 
Tamara, 13 Reiny Cir

Salisbury, Shawnteese 
Lakisha, 203 2nd Street 

Pinehill
Salsberry, Cortney J, 115 

7th St Ne
Salsberry, Jeri Monique, 

115 7th St Ne
Sanders, Brad Cook, 603 

5th St Ne
Sanders, Carneisha 

Anntroinette, 17 Camelot 
Dr #79

Sanders, Chris James, 
301 Moore St

Sanders, Meosha A, 17 
Camelot Dr #98

Shaver, Kimberly Diane, 
206 Roy St

Shockley, Brittany Renee, 
1518 Walnut Rd

Simons, Jennifer Michelle, 
105 Forest St

Slack, Norma Dorman, 
107 6th St Ne

Smiley, Ernestine Lee, 348 
Mill Pond Rd

Smith Jr, Timothy 
Dewayne, 200 Sherwood 

Ln #21
Smith, Carneshia Yvette, 
804 Martin Luther King Dr
Smith, Gloria T, 703 8th 

St Nw
Smith, Jalen, 804 Martin 

Luther King Dr
Smith, Janette Hall, 114 

Hortman Dr
Smith, Jaorrius Reshard, 

230 1st Street Pinehill
Smith, Jasmaine Denise, 

1542 Walnut Rd
Smith, Yvette, 804 Martin 

Luther King Dr
Souter, Anthony Wayne, 

124 Penny Cir
Souter, Ashley Elizabeth, 

705 8th St Nw
Souter, Michele Elise, 601 

Browning Dr
Souter, Steven Edward, 

705 8th St Nw
Sparkman, Ashley Dani-
elle, 268 Daniel Thomas 

Rd
Spencer, Joe Garland, 

1101 7th St Se
Stanley, William Cade, 138 

Woods Ln
Stauber, Billy Joe, 910 N 

Arkansas St
Stephens, Jeffery M, 204 

Legion Dr
Stephens, Megan, 205 

6th St Sw
Stutsman, Christopher 

Ray, 155 Burns Rd
Sullivan, April N, 207 3rd 

Street Pinehill
Sykes, Freddie Mae, 719 

Curry St
Taylor, Janet Marie, 702 

Rosebud Loop
Taylor, Moriah Hope, 400 

Oak Dr
Taylor, Tyrone David, 710 

W Church St
Taylor, Victoria, 707 

Browning Dr
Taylor, Yvonne Andrews, 

606 2nd St Nw
Thomas III, James William, 

2196 Walnut Rd
Thomas, Chardrekus Ray, 

211 Cobb St
Thomas, India Sharday, 17 

Camelot Dr #43
Thomas, Julie Carnell, 413 

5th St Se
Tidwell, James Morgan, 

608 N Giles St
Tindall, Lane Colton, 108 

Sherman Dr
Toups, Angel Ann, 585 

Farrington Rd
Tubbs, Emma, 1016 

Machen Dr
Twite Jr, Lee Earl, 719 

10th St Nw
Tyson Jr, E D, 713 Dennis 

St #3
Tyson, Robert Allen, 314 

1st St Nw #A
Walker, Calvin Ashley, 

1101 N Acres Cir
Walker, Margaret Ann, 

1101 N Acres Cir
Ward, Shelia Hoof, 1304 

7th St Se
Watkins, Kiera Shanta, 

403 Morgan St
Watson, Patricia Nicole, 
501 Herrington Dr #15

Watson, Rachael Denise, 
1105 Hodges St

Watts, Michael David, 
2180 Walnut Rd

Wells, Isaac Hayden, 606 
5th St Ne

West, Lisa Bernae, 17 
Camelot Dr

White, Jarvis, 328 Pat-
terson St

White, Lachardius Dey-
mont, 1101 Hodges St

White, Latavia Jopreya, 17 
Camelot Dr #58

White, Marva Richarda, 17 
Camelot Dr #74

White, Mary W, 300 
Morgan St

Whitham, Gregory William, 
200 Butler St

Williams, Alisa Danielle, 
401 Montgomery Dr

Williams, Lakeisha Tetoni, 
408 3rd St Se

Williams, Lezlie Delaine, 
300 Williams St

Wilson, Jamie, 1006 7th 
St Se

Wilson, Meredith Lea, 783 
Montgomery Dr

Wood, Sherry McLemore, 
1006 7th St Se

Wortham, Ashunti Dynell, 
1004 7th St Se

Young, Eva M, 605 
Douglas St

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

“We are applying to the 
Collector of Revenue of 
Louisiana for a permit to 
sell beverages of Low 
Alcoholic Content at Retail 
at the following address: 
Family Dollar #21587 at 
138 E Union St in the City 
of Minden, Parish of Web-
ster, State of Louisiana” 

December 6, 2023 and 
December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

“We are applying to the 
Collector of Revenue of 
Louisiana for a permit to 
sell beverages of Low 
Alcoholic Content at Retail 
at the following address: 
Family Dollar #25014 at 
1019 Homer Rd, in the City 
of Minden, Parish of Web-
ster. State of Louisiana.” 

December 6, 2023 and 
December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

"Anyone with any knowl-
edge of the whereabouts 
of Sharon Denise Spear-
man, please contact Wal-
ter Gerhardt at 318-869-

1221. A lawsuit is pending 
against Ms. Spearman in 
Bossier Parish, Louisiana, 
for eviction from a house in 

Bossier City, Louisiana."

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

PRESBYTERIAN    
VILLAGE OF HOMER 

Presbyterian Village 
of Homer is accept-
ing applications for 
a Van Driver. Must 
have a clean driving 
record. Contact: Alex 
White Director of 
Nursing @ 318-927-
6133. 

December 6, 2023 
December 13, 2023
Minden Press 

NOTICE 

Webster Parish Special 
Education will be destroy-
ing all Special Education 
records for students who 
exited the program on or 
before May 2017 and /
or have reached their 

27th birthday (birth year 
of 1995). If you would like 
your records,contact the 
Webster Parish Special 

Education Office at (318) 
377-7052 before Friday, 
April 28, 2023. You must 
provide a picture ID and 

your signature will be 
required to obtain these 

records. 

December 13, 20 and 
27, 2023
January 3 and 10, 2024
Minden PressHerald

LEGAL ADVERTISMENT

Loyce Hudson Family 
Trust v Leeann Dupree 

Cain and Ricky R.
Cain; Docket No. 80955 
C; 26 th Judicial District 
Court; Webster Parish, 

Louisiana. Please
notice that LEANN DU-

PREE CAIN and RICKY R. 
CAIN have been named as 

defendants in
the above styled action. 
Anyone knowing where-

abouts or having informa-
tion on LEANN

DUPREE CAIN and/
or RICKY R. CAIN is 

asked to contact Attorney 
Taunton Melville at (318)
200-0897, or by email at 
TMelville@MelvilleLaw-

Firm.com.

December 13, 2023
Mindem Press Herald
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Box Truck Delivery Driver
New Higher Pay Scale !
Bill &amp; Ralph’s Inc.
118 B &amp; R Drive, 
Sarepta, La. 71071

Accepting Applications For
Box Truck Delivery Driver
Must have at least a Class 

D License.
Get paid to train for a CDL-

A License
if interested, but not 

mandatory.
Free Medical Insurance 

for Driver,
Family Medical Insurance 

available.
Dental and 401K Benefits,
Hourly plus Incentive Pay,
Yearly Safety Bonus Pay,

Monthly Safety/Perfor-
mance Pay.

Apply at Bill &amp; 
Ralph&#39;s

Contact Mickey Hodges at 
(318)539-2071

mickey.hodges@billandral-
phs.com

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

Accepting Applications for 
Drivers

Bill &amp; Ralph’s Inc.
118 B &amp; R Drive, 
Sarepta, La. 71071

Accepting Applications For
Delivery Route Drivers 

with
a CDL(Class A) Drivers 

License.
Free Medical Insurance 

for Driver,
Family Medical Insurance 

available.
Dental and 401K Benefits,
Hourly plus Incentive Pay,
Yearly Safety Bonus Pay,

Monthly Safety/Perfor-
mance Pay.

Apply at Bill &amp; 
Ralph&#39;s or

Contact Mickey Hodges at 
(318)539-2071

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

Product Engineer
(Bossier City, La)

Provide design as-
sistance for the custom 
system projects, incl 
metal ceiling systems, 
wall systems, struc-
tural greds, & associated 
components as per cus-
tomer reqmnts. Work on 
the exterior curtain wall 
systems. Assist product 
development Team w/
designing & updating 
the existing systems. 
Run load calculations 
for data center/clean 
room prokect based 
on the customer liad 
reqmnts & propose the 
grid system to be used 
for the project. Run finite 
element analysis (FEA) 
for validating the load 
bearing capacity of the 
systems. Perform actual 
load test on the systems 
to validdate the FEA re-
sults. Perform third party 
testing to get Gordon 
systems certified & rated 
(Wind load rating/sount 
testing/fire rating) Work 
on material allocations 
& internal job entries 
using ERP system. Help 
CAD team w/design & 
manufacturing issues.
Work on quality check-
ing the fabrication & 
shop drawings. Work w/
sales team on producing 
proposaal drawings & 
mockups/samples. Reqs 
a Mstr’s deg. in mechani-
cal engineering.

Mail Resumes to HR, 
5023 Hazel Jones Rd., 
Bossier City, La 71111

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald

EMPLOYMENT

CHER 
SEAL 
THE 
COURE 
AA 
PARISH 
OF 
ERSTER 
TOLLI VINING 
RECORDED INSTRU-
MENTS 
LEGAL NEWS 12/1/2023 
TO 12/7/2023 
# 
INDEX 
DATE FILED INSTRU-
MENT 
ITEM 
1 
MTG 
2 
CON 
12/01/2023 12/01/2023 
3 
CON 
12/01/2023 
605420 605422 605421 
JUDGMENT POWER OF 
ATTORNEY CORREC-
TION 
PARTY ONE(S) 
BRUNO JOSHUA 
FULLER BOBBIE BLAINE 
4 
MTG 
12/01/2023 605423 
ASSIGNMENT 
CON 
12/01/2023 605424 
DEED 
LAKEVIEW LOANS SER-
VICING LLC 
PARKER NICHOLAS 
GARNER MARY LOUISE 
FIGURE LENDING LLC 
GOMILLION GEORGE 
6 
MTG 
12/01/2023 
605425 
GILBERT CHARLETTE 
CON 
8 
CON 
605426 12/01/2023 
12/01/2023 605427 
DEED 
CON 
12/01/2023 
605428 
DONATION 
10 
CON 
12/04/2023 
605429 
CREDIT DEED 
11 
MTG 
12/04/2023 
605429 
CREDIT DEED 
12 
CON 
12/04/2023 
605430 
RIGHT OF WAY 
13 
MTG 
12/04/2023 
605431 
POWER OF ATTORNEY 
BANKERS INSURANCE 
COMPANY 
14 
CON 
12/04/2023 
605432 
JUDGMENT 
BRISTER KENNETH 
DELEE SUCCN 
15 
CON 
12/04/2023 
605433 
QUITCLAIM DEED 
KERRICK SHARON R 
16 
CON 
12/04/2023 
605434 
17 
MTG 
12/04/2023 
605435 
QUITCLAIM DEED CER-
TIFICATE 
KERRICK CARLOS 
PRECISION CONSTRUC-
TION & CONTRACTING 
LLC 
NOTICE OF REPOSSES-
SION 
JUDGMENT 
SMITH SHERRELENE 
ADKINS SUCCN 
WALLACE THERESA 
LYNNE 
JOSEPH BURLEY JR 
AND ETHEL R BURLEY 
REVOCABLE INTER 
VIVOS TRUST 
RAMSEY MICHAEL H 
MCCORKEL MATTHEW K 
RAMSEY MICHAEL H 
CHACON AUTOS LTD 
LARSON TANYA SMITH 
CAMERON MARY LOU-
ISE SMITH LATANJOREA 
BURLEY 
MCCORKEL MATTHEW 
K RAMSEY MICHAEL H 
MCCORKEL MATTHEW 
K HUGH KNOTTS BAIL 
BONDS BRISTER CHER-
YL FREEMAN KERRICK 
FAMILY REVOCABLE 
TRUST 
KERRICK FAMILY 
REVOCABLE TRUST 
WEBSTER PARISH 
SCHOOL BOARD 
2 
$34,957.15 
3 
$10,000.00 ****FILING 
COPY OF DOCUMENT 
PER CUSTOMER RE-
QUEST**** 
1 
2018 KIA FORTE 
1 
PROBATE #17837 
4 
$25,750.00 
SEE ORIGINAL FOR 
PROPERTY 
$115,000.00 
$115,000.00 
SHARED DRIVEWAY 
2024 BAIL BOND 
jop - DESOTO PARISH 
#84554 
$10.00 OVC 
$10.00 & ove 
PROJECT NO. 2022-15 
SOFTBALL IMPROVE-
MENTS LAKESIDE JR/SR 
HIGH SCHOOL 
PARTY TWO(S) 
FEDERAL NATIONAL 
MORTGAGE ASSOCIA-
TION 
CHAPMAN ROYCE 
BLAINE JR 
SECRETARY OF VETER-
ANS AFFAIRS 
DESCRIPTION 
PAGES 
$10,000,000.00+ UNITED 
STATES DISTRICT 
COURT #22-2588 
1 
AMANDALAMAN MAHA 
MATHU NAM SIMILAR 
APARATAPORE PORTY 
GAGAL Myla 
00 
сл 
5 
сл 
2 
2 
J 
2 

3 
--- - 
18 
OAT 
12/04/2023 11815 
DEPUTY CLERK OF 
COURT 
COX CAYLA 
19 
CON 
12/04/2023 605436 

AFFIDAVIT 
PULLIG LIZZIE MCDAN-
IEL DECEDENT 
20 
CON 
21 
CON 
12/04/2023 
22 
MTG 
12/04/2023 605437 
605438 12/04/2023 
605439 
AFFIDAVIT 
MCINTYRE GRADY L 
DECEDENT 
CORLEY CATHY DE-
LOACH CORLEY CATHY 
DELOACH 
SMALL SUCON 
SMALL SUCON 
5 
AFFIDAVIT 
DELOACH CARRIE BELL 
PULLIG DECEDENT 
CORLEY CATHY DE-
LOACH 
SMALL SUCCN 
G 
CANCELLATION 
JACKSON RHONDA 
DUTY 
23 
MTG 
24 
MTG 
12/04/2023 
25 
MTG 
12/04/2023 605440 
605441 12/05/2023 
605442 
CANCELLATION 
JACKSON RHONDA 
DUTY 
MORTGAGE 
GOYANES FLORENCE 
PAUL 
MORTGAGE 
BROWN NORMA 
26 
CON 
27 
MTG 
12/05/2023 605443 
12/05/2023 605443 
DONATION 
BOLEY DANIEL 
INTERNAL REVENUE 
SERVICE 
$7,891.68 
INTERNAL REVENUE 
SERVICE 
$5,030.27 
HOLDER 
$50,000.00 
21ST MORTGAGE COR-
PORATION 
$95,873.04 
BOLEY RUTH SWEAREN-
GIN 
1 

21 
*** VOIDED *** 
O 
Hon. HOLLI VINING, 
WEBSTER Parish Clerk 
of Court Copyright © 2023 
ClerkNet App 
Created 12/B/2023 
Page 1 of 4 
SEAL 
CLERK 
OF THE 
OF 
COURT 
AJA 
PARISIL 
OFWERSTER 
HOLLI VINING 
LEGAL NEWS 12/1/2023 
TO 12/7/2023 
# 
INDEX 
DATE FILED 
INSTRUMENT 
ITEM 
PARTY ONE(S) 
# 
29 
CON 
12/05/2023 
29 
CON 
30 
CON 
31 
CON 
605444 12/05/2023 
605445 12/05/2023 
605446 12/05/2023 
605447 
DONATION 
BOLEY DANIEL 
DONATION 
DEED JUDGMENT 
BOLEY RUTH SWEAREN-
GIN 
WATERS CHARLES 
HIRAM JOHNSON WILLIE 
NELL SUCON 
PARTY TWO(S) 
BOLEY RUTH SWEAREN-
GIN 
BOLEY BILLY JACK 
JACKSON JAMES 
MICHAEL 
DESCRIPTION 
PAGES 
3 
HUDSON ROSE JOHN-
SON 
32 
OAT 
12/05/2023 
33 
OAT 
34 
MTG 
35 
CON 
36 
CON 
37 
OAT 
11816 12/05/2023 11817 
12/05/2023 605448 
12/05/2023 605449 
12/05/2023 605450 
12/05/2023 11818 
POLICE OFFICER PO-
LICE OFFICER 
BUCHANAN HUNTER 
KAPIDADANGI PADA 
PASTATASANGAN DAN 
WAUNAKANDAANIST 
ENGINEER AAN HAAS-
TESTIMONIA SOLOMON 
DANISASINAZIONET-
AWAYS PANTS 
COOPER BRIA 
$40,000. 
EAST BATON ROUGE 
PARISH PROBATE 
P-114210 - SEE 
ORIGINAL FOR MINERAL 
INTERESTS 
CITY OF MINDEN 
CITY OF MINDEN 
N 
4 
N 
CANCELLATION TRANS-
FER DONATION DEPUTY 
MARSHAL 
MCELWEE RANDY GENE 
POCO PROPERTIES LLC 
SCHILLINGS DEBBIE 
WYMAN 
HILE RODNEY 
FIRST GUARANTY BANK 
BLAZER LAND LLC 
NORMAN REBEKAH R 
2 
2 
TRANSFER FOR EQUITY 
w 

38 
OAT 
12/05/2023 11819 
DEPUTY MARSHAL 
LYND WILL 
39 
OAT 
40 
OAT 
41 
CON 
42 
CON 
43 
CON 
44 
MTG 
12/05/2023 11820 

12/05/2023 11821 
12/05/2023 605451 
12/05/2023 605452 
12/05/2023 605453 
12/05/2023 605454 
DEUPTY MARSHAL 
POLICE OFFICER DONA-
TION EXTRACT TRUST 
DONATION 
JUDGMENT 
GRISBY CASANDRA 
45 
CON 
12/05/2023 605455 
JUDGMENT 
JONES FINAS P III 
SILVERS DAVID 
JONES CHRIS 
GILES JACK MAXIE 
DALE ARLEN AND 
CYNTHIA GRACE GOSS 
REVOCABLE TRUST 
GOSS DALE ARLEN 
HOWELL DUSTIN 
EDWARD 
GOSS DALE ARLEN 
DALE ARLEN AND 
CYNTHIA GRACE GOSS 
REVOCABLE TRUST 
CAVALRY SPVILLC 
JONES DERRY SHAN-
NON 
2 
DEPUTY WARD TWO 
MARSHAL 
1 
DEPUTY WARD TWO 
MARSHAL 
1 
DEPUTY WARD TWO 
MARSHAL 
1 
DEPUTY WARD TWO 
MARSHAL 
1 
3 
46 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605456 
MODIFICATION OF 
MORTGAGE 
MONDAY MARK LUCAS 
FIDELITY BANK 
$1,429.79+ NO. 80872 
26TH JDC 
1 
JOP #2023-30470 22ND 
JDC ST. TAMMANY PAR-
ISH - SEE ORIGINAL FOR 
PROPERTY $461,700.00 
7 
4 
47 
CON 
12/06/2023 605457 
48 
CON 
12/06/2023 605458 
49 
CON 
12/06/2023 605459 
50 
CON 
12/06/2023 605460 
51 
CON 
12/06/2023 605461 
AMENDMENT ASSIGN-
MENT MINERAL DEED 
AGREEMENT AGREE-
MENT 
THOMPSON ROBERT 
GRANT DECEDENT 
FPCC USA INC 
SULLIVAN EUGENIA FAIR 
ALLISON CHAD WAYNE 
52 
CON 
12/06/2023 605462 
DEED 
53 
CON 
12/06/2023 605463 
CANCELLATION 
54 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605464 
CANCELLATION 
55 
CON 
12/06/2023 605465 
MINERAL DEED 
56 
MTG 
57 
CON 
12/06/2023 605466 
12/06/2023 605467 
CANCELLATION BOND 
FOR DEED 
STEELMAN DAVID 
ANTHONY 
ALLISON CHAD WAYNE 
PERSONAL FINANCE 
COMPANY OF CULLEN 
INC PERSONAL FI-
NANCE CO OF CULLEN 
INC HOOF EVA MAE 
DAVID B MANN MARITAL 
TRUST 
THOMPSON TONYA 
HANSEN ROBIN 
ELIZABETH ASQUARED 
RESOURCES LLC DIXIE 
LAKE ROYALTY LLC 
SHONGALOO WATER 
SYSTEM INC SHONGA-
LOO WATER SYSTEM 
INC DELONEYS PROP-
ERTIES LLC 
WILLIAMS DENNIS W 
PERSONAL FINANCE CO 
OF CULLEN INC 
THOMAS AND KARA 
MANN FAMILY TRUST 
81BANK 
MYLES THOMAS 
AMENDED AFFIDAVIT OF 
SMALL SUCCN 
ASSIGNMENT OF ROY-
ALTY INTEREST 
10 
SHONGALO0 WATER 
SYSTEM WELL 6 SITE 
6 
SHONGALOO WATER 
SYSTEM WELL 7 SITE 
$60,000.00 
10 
$30,000.00 
$122,000.00 UP 
TO $50,000,000.00 
$16,500,00 
2 
4 
LO 
6 
3 
3 
2 
Hon. HOLLI VINING, 
WEBSTER Parish Clerk 
of Court Copyright © 2023 
ClerkNet App 
Created 12/8/2023 
Page 2 of 4 
CLES 
SEAL 
ARISH 
OF 
OF 
THE 
COURT 
AJA 
OF WEBSTER 
HOLLI VINING 
STEELMAN DAVID 
ANTHONY ROBINSON 
LINDA LOUISE SUCCN 
MCCLARAN CHRISTO-
PHER WADE 
LEGAL NEWS 12/1/2023 
TO 12/7/2023 
PARTY TWO(S) 
MYLES THOMAS 
ROBINSON ROBERT 
ROY 
GIBSLAND BANK & 
TRUST COMPANY 
UNITED STATES 
SMITH GREG W 
DESCRIPTION 
$8,000.00 
BOSSIER PARISH PRO-
BATE #20617 
PAGES 
4 
13 
$45,000.00 UP TO 
$50,000,000.00 
21 
RELEASING PROPERTY 
LIEN REMAINS IN EF-
FECT 
2 
5 
DURABLE FINANCIAL 

POA 
14 
JOP CIVIL #17939 
CONGREGATION OF 
THE SACRED HEART OF 
JESUS ROMAN CATHO-
LIC CHURCH OF THE 
PARISH OF WEBSTER 
POE CHASE ZACHARY 
WHITE TAWANSKI L 
# 
INDEX 
DATE FILED 
INSTRUMENT 
ITEM 
PARTY ONE(S) 
# 
58 
CON 
12/06/2023 
59 
CON 
12/06/2023 
60 
MTG 
61 
MTG 
62 
CON 
63 
218 
CON 
64 
CON 
605468 605469 
12/06/2023 605470 
12/06/2023 605471 
12/06/2023 605472 
12/06/2023 605473 
12/06/2023 605474 
BOND FOR DEED 
JUDGMENT MORTGAGE 
PARTIAL RELEASE 
JUDGMENT POWER OF 
ATTORNEY AFFIDAVIT 
REEVES WILLIAM V 
SMITH JERRY W SUCCN 
MATHIS LATRESSA 
LONG LONG LINDA ANN 
WRIGHT 
65 
CON 
12/06/2023 605475 
DEED 
MATHIS LATRESSA ANN 
LONG 
66 
CON 
12/06/2023 605476 
DONATION 
GLADNEY HELEN 
GREEN 
67 
CON 
12/06/2023 605477 
AFFIDAVIT 
TATUM JENNIE LYNN 
BURDINE DECEDENT 
68 
CON 
12/06/2023 605478 
DEED 
69 
CON 
12/06/2023 605479 
AFFIDAVIT 
70 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605480 
JUDGMENT 
71 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605481 
CANCELLATION 
LOGAN LESLIE H 
72 
CON 
12/06/2023 605482 
DONATION 
73 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605483 
74 
CON 
12/06/2023 605484 
75 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605485 
76 
CON 
12/06/2023 605486 
77 
CON 
12/06/2023 605487 
78 
CON 
12/06/2023 605488 
TRANSFER 
79 
MTG 
80 
CON 
81 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605489 
12/06/2023 605490 
12/06/2023 605491 
MORTGAGE 
ASSIGNMENT 
JUDGMENT 
82 
CON 
12/06/2023 605492 
JUDGMENT 
83 
CON 
84 
MTG 
85 
MTG 
12/06/2023 605494 
12/06/2023 605493 
12/06/2023 605495 
TRANSFER 
STILL THOMAS CHAD 
JUDGMENT 
JUDGMENT 
86 
CON 
12/06/2023 605496 
ASSIGNMENT 
KENNON TRACEY L 
JONES LABRISTHA C 
ASQUARED RESOURC-
ES LLC 
87 
CON 
12/07/2023 
605497 
CREDIT DEED 
BUCKHORN FAMILY LLP 
MORTGAGE JUDGMENT 
NOTICE SEIZURE AS-
SIGNMENT 
ASSIGNMENT 
DREW JAMES C 
FISHER ANTRONEIKA 
DETRONETTE 
DEMOSS MICHAEL R 
SUCCN 
DISON BRENT A 
ASQUARED RESOURC-
ES LLC 
ASQUARED RESOURC-
ES LLC DEES RONALD E 
DEESON PROPERTY 
LLC ASQUARED RE-
SOURCES LLC CALLO-
WAY JEMIA 
MCKENZIE CHARLES 
RAY SUCCN 
LONG RICHARD 
MATHIS LATRESSA 
LONG 
WRIGHT WILLIAM 
HENRY 
GLADNEY TORIN 
KENDALL 
TATUM BILLY RAY 
BRIAN BOHRER DES-
TINY MINISTRIES 
PUBLIC 
REPUBLIC FINANCE LLC 
BANK OF AMERICA NA 
FISHER ANTRONEIKA 
DETRONETTE 
21ST MORTGAGE 
CORPORATION DEMOSS 
GLENDA FAYE PUBLIC 
ARKOMA LOUISIANA LLC 
FPCC USA INC 
DEESON PROPERTY 
LLC 
CITIZENS NATIONAL 
BANK NA CASTEGGIO 
MINERALS LLC REPUB-
LIC FINANCE LLC 
MCKENZIE LOLA DIANE 
CONCORDIA LANE LLC 
REPUBLIC FINANCE LLC 
UNIVERSITY OF LOUI-
SIANA SYSTEM BOARD 
OF SUPERVISORS 
THROUGH GRAMBLING 
STATE UNIVERSITY 
CASTEGGIO MINER-
ALS LLC 

GRAY WESLEY 
SMALL SUCCN - 1/4 
UNDIVIDED INTEREST 
IN LOT 24, SUNNYSIDE 
SUBD 
AFF OF DEATH & HEIR-
SHIP $135,000.00 
IMMOBILIZATION - SEE 
ORIGINAL FOR DE-
SCRIPTION 
$4,952.91+ BOSSIER 
CITY #103252 
$50,000.00 

5 
10 ( 
1 
1 
2 
3 
$154,052.84 
21 
QUACHITA PARISH 
PROBATE 17-3390 
4 
CIVIL 81087 $10.00 OVC 
$55,322.21 UP 
$50,000,000.00 
PARTIAL ASSIGNMENT 
OIL GAS & MINERAL 
LEASE $1,095.44+ CIVIL 
#81016 26TH JDC 
JOP CIVIL #17941 26TH 
JDC 
6 
2 
17 
$4,509.54+ CIVIL #81015 
$3,964.88+ BIENVEILLE 
PARISH 
1 
3 
1 
1 
2 
PARTIAL ASSIGNMENT 
OIL GAS MINERAL 
LEASES - SEE ORIGINAL 
7 
$202,000.00 
3 
Hon. HOLLI VINING, 
WEBSTER Parish Clerk 
of Court Copyright © 2023 
ClerkNet App 
Created 12/8/2023 
Page 3 of 4 
OF 
OF 
CLERK 
SEAL 
THE 
AJA 
HOLLI VINING 
LEGAL NEWS 12/1/2023 
TO 12/7/2023 
# 
INDEX 
DATE FILED 
INSTRUMENT 
ITEM 
PARTY ONE(S) 
# 
88 
MTG 
12/07/2023 
89 
MTG 
90 
CON 
12/07/2023 
91 
MTG 
605497 12/07/2023 
605498 605499 
12/07/2023 605500 
CREDIT DEED NOTICE 
SEIZURE DEED 
GRAY WESLEY 
DISON BRENT A 
MINDEN RETAIL LLC 
92 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605501 
93 
CON 
12/07/2023 605502 
REINSCRIPTION AS-
SIGNMENT ASSIGN-
MENT 
COMEGYS JOHN STAF-
FORD 
MORGAN MELBA 
HOLCOMB ASQUARED 
RESOURCES LLC 
94 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605503 
95 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605504 
96 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605505 
97 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605506 
98 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605507 
99 
MTG 
12/07/2023 605508 
101 
100 CON CON 
12/07/2023 
102 
CON 
12/07/2023 
12/07/2023 605509 
605510 605511 
ASSIGNMENT MORT-
GAGE REINSCRIPTION 
NOTICE OF REPOS-
SESSION NOTICE OF 
REPOSSESSION NOTICE 
OF REPOSSESSION 
JUDGMENT QUITCLAIM 
DEED ASSIGNMENT 
ALLEN STARLA 
LAEDAWN 
PARTY TWO(S) 
BUCKHORN FAMILY LLP 
PUBLIC 
BOARDWALK ROUTH 
LLC 
ORIGIN BANK 
FEDERAL HOME LOAN 
MORTGAGE CORPORA-
TION 
CASTEGGIO MINER-
ALS LLC 
FREEDOM MORTGAGE 
CORPORATION 
DESCRIPTION 
$202,000. 
#81087 26TH JDC 
$6,487,600. 
$50,000,00. 
$145,500.00 
PARTIAL ASSIGNMENT 
OF OIL GAS MINERAL 
LEASE 
PAGES 
10 
મ 
2 
 نت
SAMUEL DAWSON 
GLENN 
CLAVIER CHARLENE E 
LEWIS RANKIN JEFFERY 
B1BANK 
B1BANK 
SMITH JALEN 
ASHLEY MICHAEL 
103 
MTG 
12/07/2023 
605512 
REINSCRIPTION 
104 CON 105 CON 106 
CON 107 CON 108 CON 
12/07/2023 605513 
12/07/2023 605514 
12/07/2023 605515 
12/07/2023 605516 
12/07/2023 605517 
DONATION 
ASSIGNMENT 
REVOCATION 
POA 
BENEFIELD JOYCE 
COMPTON HARMONI 
TOWERS LLC PITMAN 
LILLIE JEAN HEARD PIT-
MAN LILLIE JEAN HEARD 
AFFIDAVIT 
REEVES RICKIE BECK 
DECEDENT 
LEWIS DAPHNER 
SUCCN SWAFFORD 
MYRTLE VIRGINIA 
ASQUARED RESOURC-
ES LLC PARKER MARY E 
SWAFFORD ARTIS JR 
FPCC USA INC 

BOSSIER FEDERAL 
CREDIT UNION 
MOUSER DAKOTA LANE 
HARMONI TOWERS AS-
SETCO || LLC 
PITMAN CHARLOTTE E 
HENLEY LETTIE 
REEVES DONNA 
WELLS FARGO 
1 
KAMAL AJALATIA LA 
LLALLAS ALTAS DAH-
LUAINTING INTUSLAU-
DATTATORI LAKS 
EXETER FINANCE CORP 
2014 DODGE CHARGER 
PANGA PARgang upua-
nAndy My AAAAAAA put 
my rehvi KAILANGAN 
JASELONA ATSAR 
CREDIT ACCEPTANCE 
2020 NISSAN ALTIMA 
LEWIS GARRETTE 
CLAIBORNE PARISH 
PROBATE #11528 
$4,000.00 
$10.00 OGVC - SEE 
ORIGINAL 
$350.00 CIVIL #68394 
Burnerdermerek Belalderd 
4 
3 
16 

1 
$409,553.48 UP TO 
$50,000,000.00 $27,000. 
2019 DODGE RAM 3500 
PICKUP 4WD 
Cocobeo. Čond. Ex Com » 
2005 »Hv! 15 : ASUMANI-
TAWINAN ANNUM WAA-
RIN ALMAMALLA MAJ 
MEMORANDUM OF AS-
SIGNMENT 
7 
REVOCATON OF POA 
DATED SEPTEMBER 
21, 2011 
1 
POA 
MINERAL INTERESTS IN 
WEBSTER PARISH 
4 
5 
MARRIAGE LICENSE 
# 
INDEX 
DATE FILED 
INSTRUMENT # ITEM 
GROOM/PARTY 1 
1 
MAR 
12/06/2023 
87683 
MARRIAGE LICENSE 
LEE DENZELL RAYONTE’ 
Hon. HOLLI VINING, 
WEBSTER Parish Clerk 
of Court 
Copyright © 2023 ClerkNet 
App 
BRIDE/PARTY 2 
COLLINS DOMINIQUE 
LASHAE 
Created 12/8/2023 
Page 4 of 4 
CIVIL CASES 
SE 
OF 
Gr 
THE 
COURT 
OF 
WEBSTER 
HOLLI VINING 
26TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT 
COURT 
PARISH OF WEBSTER 
STATE OF LOUISIANA 
CIVIL LEGAL NEWS 
CASES FILED FROM 
12/1/2023 TO 12/7/2023 
Case # 
81108 
Date Filed 
Case Title 
Туре 
Proceeding 
Judge 
12/4/2023 
UNIVERSITY OF LOUI-
SIANA SYSTEM BOARD 
OF SUPERVISORS 
THROUGH GRAMBLING 
STATE UNIVERSITY VS 
LABRISTHA C JONES 
CIVIL 
JUDGMENT EXECUTORY 
& GARNISHMENT 
R LANE PITTARD 
81109 
12/4/2023 
AVA MATTHEWS VS 
JONATHAN WILLIAMS 
CIVIL 
PROTECTIVE ORDER 
81110 
12/5/2023 
KASSI LASHAE 
CHARLES VS JEREMY 
MICHAEL STOCKWELL 
CIVIL 
DIVORCE (103) 
81111 
12/5/2023 
TRIVEYA $ HAWKINS VS 
KALEEB L HAWKINS 
CIVIL 
DIVORCE (103) 
81112 
2/6/2023 
PNC BANK NATIONAL 
ASSOCIATION VS COL-
LIN B MERRITT ET AL 
CIVIL 
EXECUTORY PROCESS 
81113 
81114 
12/6/2023 
DARBY TURNER VS 
JOSHUA OPITZ 
CIVIL 
CUSTODY 
12/7/2023 
CARTER FEDERAL 
CREDIT UNION ET AL VS 
QUANTRELL J WALKER 
ET AL 
CIVIL 
MONIES DUE 
MICHAEL CRAIG 
R LANE PITTARD 
DOUGLAS STINSON 
MICHAEL NERREN 
CHARLES SMITH 
PROBATE CASES 
Case # 
Date Filed 
Case Title 
Type 
Proceeding 
Judge 
17938 
12/1/2023 
SUCCESSION OF 
THOMAS D REILLY 
PROBATE 
17939 
12/4/2023 
SUCCESSION OF JERRY 
W SMITH 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION OVER 
$125K 
SUCCESSION OVER 
$125K 
17940 
12/5/2023 
SUCCESSION OF 
JOHNNY JAMES BAKER 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION UNDER 
$125K 
17941 
17942 
17943 
17944 
12/5/2023 
SUCCESSION OF 
CHARLES RAY MCK-
ENZIE 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION OVER 
$125K 
12/5/2023 
SUCCESSION OF DAR-
RON K HARVEY 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION UNDER 
$125K 
12/6/2023 
12/7/2023 
SUCCESSION OF BETTY 
LUCILLE KENDRICK 
FARMER 
SUCCESSION OF ROB-

ERT LEE FERGUSON 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION UNDER 
$125K 
PROBATE 
SUCCESSION UNDER 
$125K 
HON, HOLU VINING, 
WEBSTER PARISH 
CLERK OF COURT 
Copyright © 2023 ClerkNet 
App 
Created 12/8/2023 
Page 1 of 1 
Uniform Commercial Code 
Verified Filings By Debtor 
Name 
For Parish WEBSTER and 
Date Type Filing Date and 
Begin Date 12/1/2023 and 
End Date 12/7/2023 and 
Mask Tax Id Numbers True 
Debtor 
ALFORD, TAVORIOUS 
ARKEINO / ########### 
5058 HWY 371, RING-
GOLD, LA, USA 71068 
FILE NO. 60-363141 
FILED 12/1/2023 3:43:00 
PM 
ALLEN-ROSTON, YVON 
DEELOIS /### 
6933 NEVADA AVE, 
SHREVEPORT, LA, USA 
71129 
FILE NO. 60-363157 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
BODCAU FIBER LLC / 
##### 
FILE NO. 60-363150 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:09:00 
AM 
Secured Party 
GIBSLAND BANK AND 
TRUST COMPANY / ## 
1246 S. THIRD ST., GIB-
SLAND, LA, USA 71028 
FS ORIGINAL 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN / ###### 217 
MADLO LANE, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FS ORIGINAL 
DELAGE LANDEN 
FINANCIAL SERVICES, 
INC. / 1111 OLD EAGLE 
SCHOOL ROAD, WAYNE, 
PA, USA 19087 
TR TERMINATION 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
358132 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / P.O. BOX 
1098, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71058 
796 SMITHVILLE RD, 
SAREPTA, LA, USA 
71071-2836 
BURLEY, TAMMY /### 
3741 HIGHWAY 2 ALT, 
HAYNESVILLE, LA, USA 
71038-5823 
FILE NO. 60-363164 
FILED 12/6/2023 9:21:00 
AM TR TERMINATION 
CROW, MURDELL 
/######### 
21236 HIGHWAY 371 APT 
32, COTTON VALLEY, LA, 
USA 71018-2804 
FILE NO. 60-363140 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
362787 
GULFCO OF LOUISIANA, 
LLC / ######### P.O. 
BOX 157, SPRINGHILL, 
LA, USA 71075 
FILED 12/1/2023 11:41:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
CRUMP OIL COMPANY 
LLC /############# 
P.O. BOX 748, HAYNES-
VILLE, LA, USA 71038 
FILE NO. 60-363149 
FIRST GUARANTY BANK/ 
10065 HWY. 79, HAYNES-
VILLE, LA, USA 71038 
FILED 12/4/2023 4:13:00 
PM CN CONTINUATION 
DORSEY, KATRINA 
/######### 
1401 LEWISVILLE RD 
APT 226, MINDEN, LA, 
USA 71055-2120 
FILE NO. 60-363169 
FILED 12/7/2023 10:51:00 
AM TR 
ELLIOTT, SYBLE J 
/######### 
399 MILLER BRIAR-
WOOD RD, SIBLEY, LA, 
USA 71073-2703 
FILE NO. 60-363142 
FILED 12/4/2023 12:26:00 
PM FS 
FERRELL, DOUGLAS 
/#####I 
226 THOMASVILLE 
RD, SAREPTA, LA, USA 
71071-3138 
FILE NO. 60-363166 
GILL JR., JOHNNY 
/######## 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
350511 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC / ######### PO BOX 
1460, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71055 
TERMINATION 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
360362 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC / ######## PO BOX 
1460, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71055 ORIGINAL 
GULFCO OF LOUISIANA, 
LLC /### P.O. BOX 157, 
SPRINGHILL, LA, USA 
71075 
FILED 12/6/2023 10:42:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
839 HARRIS ST, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 FILE NO. 
60-363156 
GILL, MYESHIA /###### 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN / : 217 
MADLO LANE, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FS ORIGINAL 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC / ## PO BOX 1460, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055 
906 DURWOOD DR, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055-
5606 
FILE NO. 60-363138 
GRAY, HARLIE /######## 
FILED 12/1/2023 11:41:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
475 MILLER BRIAR-
WOOD RD, SIBLEY, LA, 
USA 71073-2705 
FILE NO. 60-363143 
GRIGSBY, JEFFERY 
/##### 
FILED 12/4/2023 12:26:00 
PM FS 
201 NORTH ST, SPRIN-
GHILL, LA, USA 71075-
2837 FILE NO. 60-363163 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC /### PO BOX 1460, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055 
ORIGINAL 
GULFCO OF LOUISIANA, 
LLC / ############# 
P.O. BOX 157, SPRING-
HILL, LA, USA 71075 
FILED 12/5/2023 11:02:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
HARRIS, JOHNNIE LEE 
/#######! 
610 COLLEGE ST, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 
FILE NO. 60-363159 
HAWKINS, ALVIN / 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
P.O. BOX 90, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71058 FILE NO. 
60-363148 
FILED 12/4/2023 2:38:00 
PM 
HOLDEN, CLINTON 
RICHARD / ########### 
155 RATLIFF DRIVE, 
SAREPA, LA, USA 71071 
FILE NO. 60-363144 
FILED 12/4/2023 1:47:00 
PM 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 

OF MINDEN / ######### 
217 MADLO LANE, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 FS 
ORIGINAL 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / P.O. BOX 
1098, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71058 
TR TERMINATION 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
355997 
GIBSLAND BANK AND 
TRUST COMPANY / 1246 
S. THIRD ST., GIBSLAND, 
LA, USA 71028 FS 
ORIGINAL 
User ID: FJackson1 
Page 1 of 3 on 12/8/2023 
9:32:13 AM 
Uniform Commercial Code 
Verified Filings By Debtor 
Name 
For Parish WEBSTER and 
Date Type Filing Date and 
Begin Date 12/1/2023 and 
End Date 12/7/2023 and 
Mask Tax Id Numbers True 
Debtor 
HOLLINGSWORTH CON-
STRUCTION COMPANY, 
INC. / 
886 HIGHWAY 531, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 
FILE NO. 60-363137 
FILED 12/1/2023 9:38:00 
AM 
ISREAL, JOSALINE S / 
######### 
1934 PEARL ST APT 
6, GIBSLAND, LA, USA 
71028-4403 
FILE NO. 60-363152 
Secured Party 
WELLS FARGO BANK, 
N.A. / #### 
800 WALNUT STREET, 
F0005-044, DES MOINES, 
IA, USA 50309 
FS ORIGINAL 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / # 1124 
HOMER ROAD, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
FS ORIGINAL 
JOHNSON, COMMILISA E 
/ ########## 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / P.O. BOX 
1098, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71058 
AMENDMENT 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
359125 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / ##### 1124 
HOMER ROAD, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
100 NE NATCHITOCHES 
ST, SIBLEY, LA, USA 
71073-3906 
FILE NO. 60-363146 
FILED 12/4/2023 2:38:00 
PM 
AM 
LEE, PAMELA /###### 
187 BRYANT RD, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055-
7394 FILE NO. 60-363153 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
FS ORIGINAL 
LEMAY, COLTON /##### 
105 AIRPORT LOOP, 
SPRINGHILL, LA, USA 
71075 
FILE NO. 60-363162 
GULFCO OF LOUISIANA, 
LLC / ####### 
P.O. BOX 157, SPRING-
HILL, LA, USA 71075 
FILED 12/5/2023 11:02:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / 1124 HOMER 
ROAD, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71055 
FS ORIGINAL 
LEWIS, LATOYA A / ## 
213 S E CLAIBORNE 
AVE, SIBLEY, LA, USA 
71073 
FILE NO. 60-363165 
FILED 12/6/2023 9:26:00 
AM 
LUMBERLAND OF WEB-
STER, INC. / ######### 
14909 HWY 80, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055-6501 FILE 
NO. 60-363170 
FILED 12/7/2023 1:27:00 
PM AM AMENDMENT 
MILLER, BRANDY 
/######### 
117 DAVIS TRAIL, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 
FILE NO. 60-363147 
NORTON, LEE /##### 
FILED 12/4/2023 2:38:00 
PM 
6982 HIGHWAY 159, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055-
6045 
FILE NO. 60-363139 
WELLS FARGO COM-
MERCIAL DISTRIBUTION 
FINANCE, LLC / ### 5595 
TRILLIUM BLV, HOFF-
MAN ESTATES, IL, USA 
60192 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
322014 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / #### P.O. 
BOX 1098, MINDEN, LA, 
USA 71058 
TR TERMINATION 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
351095 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC / ############### 
PO BOX 1460, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FILED 12/1/2023 11:41:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
OWEN, KIM-
BERLY STROTHER 
/#########||||| 
8101 HWY 160, COTTON 
VALLEY, LA, USA 71018 
FILE NO. 60-363160 
SMITH, NOBIE L / ### 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN / ##### 
217 MADLO LANE, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
111 SMITH TRAIL, DOY-
LINE, LA, USA 71023 FILE 
NO. 60-363161 
SMITH, NOBIE L / 
######## 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC /## PO BOX 1460, 
MINDEN, LA, USA 71055 
FILED 12/5/2023 11:02:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
111 SMITH TRAIL, DOY-
LINE, LA, USA 71023 
FILE NO. 60-363167 
SNIDER, RONNIE 
/######### 
FIRST TOWER LOAN, 
LLC /##### PO BOX 
1460, MINDEN, LA, USA 
71055 
FILED 12/7/2023 10:33:00 
AM TR TERMINATION 
154 S MARKHAM RD, 
SAREPTA, LA, USA 71071 
FILE NO. 60-363168 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
361910 
FOUNDATION FINANCE 
COMPANY LLC / 
######### 10101 
MARKET STREET SUITE 
B100, ROTHSCHILD, WI, 
USA 54474 
FILED 12/7/2023 10:33:00 
AM FS ORIGINAL 
SOTO, CLARA JUAREZ 
/######: 
1703 HARMON LOOP, 
HOMER, LA, USA 71040 
FILE NO. 60-363154 
TELL, MARVIN R. 
/######### 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 

AM 
2179 CARTER DRIVE, 
HAYNESVILLE, LA, USA 
71038 
FILE NO. 60-363155 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
THOMPSON, VERO ICA 
LOREEN /########## 
295 WASHINGTON ST, 
HOMER, LA, USA 71040 
FILE NO. 60-363158 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN / ###### 217 
MADLO LANE, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FS ORIGINAL 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN / : 
217 MADLO LANE, MIN-
DEN, LA, USA 71055 FS 
ORIGINAL 
UNITED CREDIT CORP 
OF MINDEN /###### 217 
MADLO LANE, MINDEN, 
LA, USA 71055 
FS ORIGINAL 
User ID: FJackson1 
Page 2 of 3 on 12/8/2023 
9:32:13 AM 
Uniform Commercial Code 
Verified Filings By Debtor 
Name 
For Parish WEBSTER and 
Date Type Filing Date and 
Begin Date 12/1/2023 and 
End Date 12/7/2023 and 
Mask Tax Id Numbers True 
Debtor 
TRUE BOND MASONRY 
LLC / # 
356 AUDLEMAN RD, 
DOYLINE, LA, USA 71023 
FILE NO. 60-363145 
FILED 12/4/2023 2:00:00 
PM 
TURNER, JEANETTE M 
/ ###### 
Secured Party 
HOME FEDERAL BANK 
/ ###### 
222 FLORIDA STREET, 
SHREVEPORT, LA, USA 
71105 CN CONTINUA-
TION 
ORIGINAL FILE: 60-
350493 
1ST FRANKLIN FINAN-
CIAL CORPORATION 
(MINDEN ) / ##### P.O. 
BOX 1098, MINDEN, LA, 
USA 71058 
FILED 12/5/2023 9:20:00 
AM 
FS ORIGINAL 
681 LIBERTY HILL RD, 
HOMER, LA, USA 71040-
8343 FILE NO. 60-363151 
Number of Debtors:34 
User ID: FJackson1 
Page 3 of 3 on 12/8/2023 
9:32:13 AM 

December 13, 2023
Minden Press Herald
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Call 855-649-6863 to 
schedule your free quote!

Connect Anywhere, 
Anytime.

CALL TODAY (844) 621-9931

• Medicaid
• SNAP
• SSI
• WIC

• Veterans Pension
• Survivors or Lifeline Benefits
• Tribal Assistance Program
• Housing Assistance
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Fun &
          Games
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